2015

MINNESOTA
UNDERSTANDINGAMENDMENES
& STATE BUILDING CODE

« Administration ——
* Radon & Special Provisions

+ Commercial Building Code @

* Elevators and Related Devices -~ BUILDING CODE
* Residential Building Code :

» Existing Buildings

* Energy

* Accessibility

» Mechanical & Fuel Gas
* Plumbing

MINNESOTA DEPARTMENT OF

) LABOR & INDUSTRY



2015

MINNESOTA
UNDERSTANDING AMENDMENTS
tothe STATE BUILDING CODE

* Administration

* Radon & Special Provisions

* Commercial Building Code

* Elevators and Related Devices
* Residential Building Code

» Existing Buildings

* Energy

* Accessibility

* Mechanical & Fuel Gas

* Plumbing

’ MINNESOTA DEPARTMENT OF

LABOR & INDUSTRY



PREFACE

Understanding Amendments to the State Building Code is a compilation of the
Rule-by-Rule analysis portion of the Statement of Need and Reasonableness (SONAR) of
10 Rule Chapters adopted as part of the State Building Code in 2015 & 2016. They are
presented here in a single publication as a help to the user by providing both a brief technical
explanation as well as an understanding of the purpose behind each of the amendments
made to these 10 chapters. In some cases, explanation is provided for changes made as a
result of comments received during a public hearing or the public comment period.

It is our intent that this information will contribute to accurate and uniform application of
the code in the design and construction of buildings. The user should be aware that this
document does not contain an explanation of all the amendments to the State Building Code
but only those that were introduced as new or modified for 2015. An explanation of legacy
amendments has not been included here.



CONTENTS

Building Code Administration (Chapter 1300)............coiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiians

Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code (Chapter 1303)........cccccccveeenennnee.

Minnesota Building Code (Chapter 1305)........ccoiiiiiiiiiiiiiiii e

Elevators and Related Devices (Chapter 1307)........ccooviiiiiiiiiiiiiiiiien..

Residential Code (Chapter 1309).......cceeiiieiiiiriieiieie et

Conservation Code for Existing Buildings (Chapter 1311).......cccccceevviieiieniiennennen.

Energy Code

= Residential Energy Code (Chapter 1322)......ccccceeeciiieniieeriieeieeeeeeeee
=  Commercial Energy Code (Chapter 1323).......ccccceciiriiiinieniieiieeieeens

Accessibility Code (Chapter 1341)......c.oiiiiiiiiii e

Mechanical and Fuel Gas Code

Plumbing Code (Chapter 4714)

(Chapter 1346).......ocvviiiiiiiiiii e,

13

21

65

73

103

116

131

141

155

179



This page is intentionally left blank.



Chapter 1300, Administration




Chapter 1300, Administration

Minnesota Department of Labor and Industry
STATEMENT OF NEED AND REASONABLENESS

Proposed Amendment to Rules Governing the Administration of the Minnesota State Building Code, Minnesota
Rules, chapter 1300; and Proposed Amendment to Rules Governing Minnesota Provisions, Minnesota Rules, Chapter
1303; Revisor’s ID Number R-04140

INTRODUCTION

The Commissioner of the Department of Labor and Industry proposes to amend rules governing the administration of
the Minnesota State Building Code, Minnesota Rules, Chapter 1300. The Department also proposes to amend rules governing
Minnesota provisions of the Minnesota State Building Code, Minnesota Rules, Chapter 1303.

This rule chapter incorporates the necessary administrative information from each “Chapter 1” of the International
Code Council (“ICC”) model codes that are adopted by reference. This rule chapter also incorporates administrative
requirements specific to Minnesota. Where specific administrative provisions are necessarily related to a specific rule chapter,
the specific administrative provision will govern.

The Department utilized an advisory committee to review the existing rule and to propose necessary changes to the
rule. The committee consisted of representatives from the Builders Association of Minnesota, the Association of Minnesota
Building Officials, greater Minnesota Building Officials, the League of Minnesota Cities, the Minnesota Building Permit
Technicians Association, and Construction Codes and Licensing Division staff. The proposed amendments incorporate
changes proposed by the committee and changes made to the administrative provisions in the model codes that affect this
chapter or other chapters of the Minnesota State Building Code.



Chapter 1300, Administration

RULE-BY-RULE ANALYSIS

MINNESOTA RULES, CHAPTER 1300
STATE BUILDING CODE ADMINISTRATION

1300.0010 ADMINISTRATION.

Subpart 1. The text of subpart 1 is not modified,
however, the paragraph was given a subpart number and
heading because two new subparts have been added to the
rule part. It is necessary to separate the text into subparts
because all three paragraphs pertain to different subject
matter.

Subpart 2. This paragraph is modified by adding
a subpart number and heading to the paragraph. This
subpart is also modified by changing Minnesota Rules,
chapter 3800 to chapter 3801. This modification is
necessary because in 2009 chapter 3800 was divided into
two rule chapters: chapter 3800 and chapter 3801. Chapter
3800 is composed of rules adopted and enforced by the
Board of Electricity and chapter 3801 is composed of rules
adopted and enforced by the Department of Labor and
Industry. This change is necessary and reasonable to
properly indicate that Minnesota Rules, chapter 1315, the
Minnesota Electrical Code, is administered according to
the pertinent parts of chapter 3801.

The statutory citation to the Minnesota Electrical Act
is changed to reflect numbering changes made to sections
of that Act by the Minnesota legislature in 2007. It is
necessary and reasonable to change the statutory citation
to update it to the current and correct citation.

Subpart 3. A new subpart regarding the
Minnesota Plumbing Code is added to clarify, for
administrative purposes, that Minnesota Rules, chapter
4715 is administered and enforced statewide, pursuant to
Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.106, subdivision 3.

1300.0030 PURPOSE AND APPLICATION.

Subpart 2, subitem A. This rule part is modified
to reflect changes made to statute requiring that the State
Building Code “is the standard that applies statewide...”
This change to statute was made during the 2008 Regular
Session and can be found in Minnesota Statutes, section
326B.121, subdivision 1. This change is necessary to keep
this rule consistent with statutory language.

This subpart is also modified to delete exceptions
located in citations to Minnesota Statutes, sections
326B.112 (bleacher safety provisions), 326B.16
(enforcement of requirements for persons with
disabilities), and 326B.184 (fees for licensure and

permits). These citations are no longer needed because
those sections are not exceptions to the statewide standard.

The rule is further modified to remove the citation
to subdivision 8 in Minnesota Statutes, section 103F.141,
because subdivision 8 no longer exists, and to add
Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.121, subdivision 1
(c)(2) as applied to agricultural buildings. It is necessary
to add reference to this statute in subitem A because this
subitem addresses the application of the Minnesota State
Building Code to agricultural buildings and Minnesota
Statutes, section 326B.106, subdivision 15, specifically
requires that the State Building Code address this issue.

1300.0040 SCOPE. The changes to this section are
necessary to coordinate this rule part with new language in
the model code documents that are incorporated into the
State Building Code.

Subpart 1, Exception. This exception is added
to permit the construction of certain buildings to mirror
actual field conditions encountered by military, police,
fire, or first responders. These buildings permit training in
buildings that simulate the conditions they will encounter
in the field. It is reasonable to permit the exception
because it will allow emergency personnel to be more
fully prepare for their duties. These buildings are not used
by the general public, but by persons trained and equipped
for the anticipated field conditions.

The structural provisions of the code are still
required to be applied to ensure that the buildings are
structurally sound for snow loads, wind loads, intended
use loads, and any other structural consideration that
makes the building withstand general building use loads.

Subpart 2. The Minnesota Rule citation to part
1300.0070, subpart 12a, has been renumbered to subpart
12b. This modification is necessary to accommodate the
renumbering and to provide correct citations.

The exception in this subpart incorporates a
change to provide optional compliance and adds two
circumstances (buildings undergoing addition and
buildings being moved) to the list of exceptions that may
be designed to comply with Minnesota Rules, chapter
1311, instead of the requirements of Minnesota Rules,
chapter 1305.



Chapter 1300, Administration

Minnesota Rules, chapter 1311, was adopted to
comply with a statutory requirement enacted during the
1999 Regular Session, located in Minnesota Statutes,
section 326B.106, subdivision 1, which required that the
“code must conform insofar as practicable to model
building codes generally accepted and in use throughout
the United States, including a code for building
conservation.” The intention was to adopt a code that
permitted existing buildings to be renovated in whole or in
part without having to comply with all of the provisions
required for new buildings. Chapter 1311 provided
requirements to renovate existing buildings.

Currently the exception requires that existing or
historic buildings “shall be designed” to meet the
requirements of chapter 1311 to renovate an existing
building. The phrase “permitted to be” has been inserted
to allow designers and owners the option to choose to use
chapter 1311 instead of chapter 1305.

The current requirement to use chapter 1311
causes conflicts for building designers who chose to use
chapter 1305, which is the code for new buildings but is
more restrictive. Chapter 1311, on the other hand, is less
restrictive, but was required to be used. With the proposed
modification to the requirement, the choice is now up to
the designer to determine which code to apply.

This change is necessary to permit the designer or
owner to make the choice at the beginning of the project. It
is reasonable because the use of chapter 1305 is more
restrictive than chapter 1311, and the proposed language
will now permit the designer, and ultimately the owner, to
decide which code to use to renovate the building.

The change to this exception also permits
additions to existing buildings or moved buildings to be
evaluated using chapter 1311. This is reasonable because
the entire building is not new construction and moved
buildings are considered existing buildings.

1300.0050 CHAPTERS OF MINNESOTA STATE
BUILDING CODE.

Subitem E (1305, Minnesota Building Code).
This change to the existing rule deletes the phrase
“Adoption of the International Building Code” and
replaces it with the phrase “Minnesota Building Code.”
This change is necessary to clarify and provide a more
accurate title for the code, with its amendments, which is
being included in the Minnesota State Building Code. The
existing title can be misinterpreted to mean adoption of the
model code document without amendment.

Subitem H (1309, Minnesota Residential
Code). This change to the existing rule deletes the phrase

“Adoption of the International Residential Code” and
replaces it with the phrase “Minnesota Residential Code.”
This change is necessary to clarify and provide a more
accurate title for the code, with its amendments, which is
being included in the Minnesota State Building Code. The
existing title can be misinterpreted to mean adoption of the
model code document without amendment.

Subitem J (1315, Minnesota Electrical Code).
This change to the existing rule deletes the phrase
“Adoption of the National Electrical Code” and replaces it
with “Minnesota Electrical Code.” This change is
necessary to clarify and provide a more accurate title for
the code, with its amendments, which is being included in
the Minnesota State Building Code. The existing title can
be misinterpreted to mean adoption of the model code
document without amendment.

Subitem L (1335 Floodproofing Regulations).
This proposed change deletes the reference and inclusion
of Minnesota Rules, chapter 1330, Fallout Shelters, as a
part of the Minnesota State Building Code. This rule
chapter was previously repealed through the obsolete rules
procedure and must be deleted from the list of chapters
that make up the Minnesota State Building Code for
accuracy. The remaining subitems are relettered to adjust
for the deleted rule chapter.

Subitem T (relettered) (1322 and 1323,
Minnesota Energy Codes). This change to existing rule
deletes references to Minnesota Rule chapters 7670, 7672,
7674,7676, and 7678 and replaces them with references to
Minnesota Rule chapters 1322 and 1323. This
modification is necessary because the previous rule
chapters no longer make up the Energy Code in Minnesota.
Those chapters have been replaced with Minnesota Rule
chapters 1322 and 1323, the residential and commercial
energy code chapters. This modification is necessary to
direct the user to the correct rule chapters of the energy
code.

Subitem U (relettered). This proposed
amendment adds rules for high pressure piping systems.
Rules for high pressure piping systems were added to the
Minnesota State Building Code because of a Department
reorganization that occurred in 2005, which incorporated
High Pressure Piping into the Department’s Construction
Codes and Licensing Division and into the Minnesota
State Building Code.

1300.0060 OPTIONAL ADMINISTRATION.

Subitem C. This proposed change deletes subitem C,
Floodproofing Regulations, from the list of optional
chapters in the State Building Code. This modification is
necessary because there is a conflict with Minnesota



Chapter 1300, Administration

Rules, part 1335.0600, which requires that “this section
shall apply unless equivalent provisions are incorporated
in the city or county flood plain zoning ordinance.”
Minnesota Rules, parts 1335.0600 to 1335.1200, cannot
be optional if they may be required under certain
circumstances for a city or a county to adopt. It is
necessary and reasonable to repeal a rule part that conflicts
with another rule part to ensure coordination and
uniformity.

1300.0070 DEFINITIONS.

Subparts 3, 10a, 11, 12, 18, 22 and 23. These
subparts are repealed however, the content of these
definitions is included in chapter 1305 (IBC) in Table
302.2. The Table describes the types of facilities, number
of occupants and the occupancy classification that is
described in these definitions.

Subp. 4a. Approved. This definition is needed in
this administrative chapter to coordinate the definition of
“approved” with the other chapters of the Minnesota State
Building Code to address all situations similarly where the
building official is authorized to take formal action to
indicate whether or not proposed construction methods
have been determined to be in compliance with the state
building code. It is reasonable to provide coordinated
definitions of frequently used terms throughout the
building code to avoid conflicts between terms from one
chapter to another.

Subpart 8. Code. This definition is modified to
distinguish the use of the term “code” in chapter 1300
from the definition of “code” in other chapters of the State
Building Code. Other chapters use the term to refer to the
content of that specific chapter rather than the entire State
Building Code as it is used in chapter 1300.

Subp. 12a. Historical building. This definition
is needed to coordinate with the definition for “Historic
Building” in Minnesota Rules, chapter 1311. Chapter
1311 is intended to be used solely for the renovation of
existing buildings. When buildings are renovated using
Minnesota Rules, chapter 1305, the rules in chapter 1311
do not apply and chapter 1305 does not provide a
definition for “historical building.” Therefore, it is
reasonable to include the definition in this chapter because
it is the administrative chapter for all chapters in the
Minnesota State Building Code. (See Minnesota Rules,
part 1300.0040, Scope, for information about the
application of chapter 1311.)

Subp. 12b. International residential code
(IRC) occupancy classifications. The content of this
definition is not changed. The subpart number is changed

from 12a. to 12b. to accommodate the new definition for
“historical building” located in subpart 12a.

Subpart 25. State licensed facilities. This
definition is changed to reflect changes made to the
statutory definition of “State Licensed Facilities,” which
was previously located in Minnesota Statutes, section
16B.60, subdivision 11, now renumbered to Minnesota
Statutes, section 326B.103, subdivision 13. It is
reasonable to change the rule to match the statute to clarify
that boarding care homes and residential hospice are “state
licensed facilities.”

1300.0110 DUTIES AND POWERS OF BUILDING
OFFICIAL.

Subpart 1. General. This subpart is changed to
coordinate with the same language in the incorporated
model code documents.

Subpart 3. Applications and permits. This
subpart is changed to coordinate with the same language
in the incorporated model code documents. It is
reasonable and necessary to give the permit applicant the
opportunity to meet with the building official before an
application is made for a permit to ensure that the
proposed project is viable before any time or money is
spent in the application process.

It is also reasonable and necessary to give the
applicant and building official the right to refuse to meet at
a location that is not suitable given any certain
circumstance. Municipalities may establish a fee for this
service to cover the costs of the building official’s time.

Subpart 5. Inspections. This subpart is changed
to coordinate the same language in the incorporated model
code documents.

Subpart 8. Department records. The changes
made to the first sentence of this subpart are needed to
coordinate with the same language in the incorporated
model code documents.

The changes to the remainder of the subpart are
needed to properly address the records management
requirements in Minnesota Statutes, section 138.17. It is
the responsibility of the municipality to create the records
management schedule so the building official can follow
the schedule. This change is reasonable because the
building official is responsible for the record keeping
aspect and compliance with the records management
schedule created by the municipality.

Subpart 9. Liability. This change is needed to
protect the Board of Appeals members from liability and



Chapter 1300, Administration

legal costs to the same degree that the building official is
protected. The existing rule recognizes that both building
officials and Appeal Board members are protected from
liability while discharging their duties in good faith. The
rule also recognizes that building officials are not liable
for litigation costs when being defended against a legal
claim. However, the existing rule does not address this
same protection for Appeal Board members. It is
reasonable that these persons are afforded the same
protection against costs as building officials because they
already enjoy the same basic immunities from liability as
building officials and there is no reason why these
immunities should not also extend to liability from costs
for Board of Appeal members who perform their duties in
good faith. Additionally, Board of Appeal members serve
ad hoc and on a voluntary basis, without pay or other
remuneration. Without equal protection from liability,
including indemnification of legal costs, recruitment and
retention of these individuals by the building official for
performance of these necessary duties would be
unreasonably difficult to obtain.

1300.0120 PERMITS.

Subpart 4, subitem A (1). The change to this
existing rule is needed to resolve the difference that exists
between the International Building Code (IBC) and the
International Residential Code (IRC) regarding square
footage requirements that exempt work on structures from
permitting requirements. The IBC exempts the subject
structures from a permit when the structure does not
exceed 120 square feet. The IRC exempts the subject
structures from a permit when the structure does not
exceed 200 square feet. This change reconciles the
difference and makes the code application consistent.

It is reasonable to exempt accessory structures
that do not exceed 200 square feet from a permit for
buildings built under the IBC and IRC because the
structures are small enough to not justify a permit or fee,
however the structures must still comply with the State
Building Code. There will be a negligible financial
impact to the municipal permit fee revenue because the
exempted structures under the proposed rule will only be
slightly larger than the structures exempted under the
current provision, and a very small number of structures
will be affected by the change.

Subpart 4, subitem A (2). The change to this
subitem is needed to coordinate this subpart with the same
changes that were made in both the 2012 IBC and 2012
IRC.

Subpart 4, subitem A (13). This subitem needs
to be deleted because the exemption for agricultural
buildings already exists in part 1300.0030, subpart 2.A.,

and that part explains more completely the application of
other parts of the State Building Code to agricultural
buildings. It is reasonable to delete a part that is merely
repetitive of existing provisions and is not needed.

Subpart 4, subitem A (14). This subitem is
renumbered because of the deletion of subitem 13. The
language in this subitem did not change.

Subpart 4, subitem D. This subitem is deleted
because currently no plumbing work in Minnesota Rules,
chapter 4715 is exempt from a permit. Therefore, it is
necessary to delete this exemption to prevent a conflict
with Minnesota Rules, chapter 4715. However, limited
exemptions from permitting and inspections for plumbing
work are being proposed in Minnesota Rules, part
1300.0215, Plumbing.

Subpart 4, subitem D (relettered). The change
to this subitem is needed to identify the appropriate statute
that exempts certain electrical work from a permit. It also
changes the appropriate jurisdiction for electrical
inspections from the Board of Electricity to the
Commissioner of Labor and Industry. These changes are
necessary to coordinate with statutory changes.

Subpart 6. Repairs. This change is needed to
incorporate more commonly-used terminology for the
words “cutting away.” The phrase “opening or removal”
more accurately describes the action taking place and will
help to clarify the requirement.

Subpart 10. Validity of permit and Subpart 11.
Expiration. Subpart 10 is modified by deleting the
sentence pertaining to the issuance of a permit based on
construction documents from the subpart and adding
language pertaining to invalidating a permit for suspended
or abandoned work beyond 180 days. Subpart 10’s
deleted language has been relocated to Minnesota Rules,
part 1300.0130, subpart 6, because part 1300.0130,
subpart 6, pertains to the approval of construction
documents and is a more appropriate location for this
language.

The new language in subpart 10 is revised
language about invalid permits, which is currently located
in Minnesota Rules, part 1300.0120, subpart 11. The
language is being relocated to subpart 10 because it deals
with the “validity” of a permit. The language is further
revised because the current language in subpart 11 could
be misinterpreted to mean that a permit will become
invalid if work is suspended or abandoned at any time
during the 180-day period after work is commenced. The
new language proposed for subpart 10 clarifies that a
permit will become invalid if the work is suspended or
abandoned for more than 180 days. This new language



Chapter 1300, Administration

also clarifies that the 180-day period begins the first day
the work is suspended or abandoned. This change is
necessary to provide clarity and uniform application to the
requirement and to ensure that the requirement is properly
located within the rule.

The phrase “become invalid,” currently found in
subpart 11, is deleted from that subpart and replaced with
the word “expires.” This change clarifies that a permit will
expire. The expiration of a permit and the validity of a
permit are different concepts. Subpart 11 is describing
expiration and not validity. The change in this provision is
necessary and reasonable as it clarifies the intent of the
section and will provide more uniform enforcement. In
addition, the word “may” has been changed to “shall” as it
pertains to granting permit expiration extensions. It is
necessary to require the building official to grant an
extension if the applicant has demonstrated justifiable
cause for the extension.

Subpart 13. Information and placement of
permit. This rule subpart is changed to include language
from Minnesota Statutes, section 15.41, which requires
that every state agency and every political subdivision
shall specify on every construction permit the name and
address of the permit applicant and the name of the
general contractor, if there is one. This statute also
requires the construction permit to be posted in a
conspicuous and accessible place on the premises or
construction site. This statute is not regularly used or
referenced by the Department, so it is reasonable to
include the requirement in the proposed rule so that
building officials are aware of requirements that are not
part of Minnesota Statutes, chapter 326B.

Subpart 14. Responsibility. The change to this
subpart is needed to clarify that the person, firm, or
corporation that obtains the building permit is the
appropriate party to address for correspondence from the
building official, including correction notices, to comply
with the code. It is necessary and reasonable to have a
designated person, firm, or organization responsible for
code compliance and for the building official to have a
responsible and readily identifiable contact for which the
permit was issued.

1300.0130 CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS.

Subpart 6. Approval of construction
documents.

Subitem A. The text of Subitem A is not
modified, however, the paragraph was given a subitem
letter because a new Subpart B has been added to the
existing rule part. It is necessary to separate the text into
subparts because the two paragraphs pertain to different

subject matter relating to the approval of construction
documents by the building official.

Subitem B. This change is needed to make
building officials aware of the laws and rules of the
Minnesota Board of Architecture, Engineering, Land
Surveying, Landscape Architecture, Geoscientists and
Interior Design (“Board”) concerning the practice of
building officials “marking-up” code deficiencies directly
on plan documents that have been prepared, signed,
certified and dated by a person licensed or certified by the
Board.

With limited exception, Minnesota Statutes,
section 326.03, subdivision 1, prohibits individuals from
preparing and certifying construction documents unless
the person is licensed or certified by the Board pursuant to
Minnesota Statutes, sections 326.02 to 326.15. Building
officials are not licensed or certified by the Board under
sections 326.02 to 326.15, and therefore cannot prepare
and certify construction documents for projects which
require participation of a licensed design professional.

Each construction document is required by
Minnesota Statutes, section 326.12, subdivision 3, to bear
the signature and licensing certification of the design
professional preparing the document, including the date
on which the signature and certification were affixed. The
signature and license certification become a permanent
part of the document to which they are affixed in
accordance with Minnesota Rule part 1800.4200 and
operate to ensure the public that the document was
prepared by a licensed design professional “whose
professional skill and judgment are embodied in the
document signed” and who “assumes responsibility for
the accuracy and adequacy thereof.” If the certified
construction document is marked up by someone other
than the licensed design professional who originally
signed and certified the document, then it becomes
difficult for anyone viewing the document to determine
whether the changes therein were made by the licensed
design professional, building official or some other
person, thus putting the public’s reliance upon the
certification at risk.

Since the licensed design professional is
responsible for the accuracy and adequacy of the certified
construction document, changes made to the document are
also the design professional’s responsibility and it is
therefore reasonable to require building officials to
itemize any changes or corrections to the certified
construction document in a separate plan review letter,
rather than on the certified document itself.

The sentence “[t]he issuance of a permit based on
construction documents and other data shall not prevent



Chapter 1300, Administration

the building official from requiring the correction of errors
in the construction document and other data” is added to
this subitem. This sentence has been relocated to this
subpart from part 1300.0120, subpart 10. The relocated
language is more appropriately included in this subitem
because the language pertains to construction documents
and this subpart addresses this topic.

The sentence “all sets of required construction
documents , including the site copy, municipality copy, or
inspector copy, must be marked identically by the building
official, with one copy retained by the building official
after construction is completed” is added to this subitem.
This sentence is added to ensure that all sets of plans that
are “marked up” by the building official are identical to
avoid confusion on the construction site. Further, two
more sentences “[w]ork regulated by the code must be
installed according to the reviewed construction
documents. Work that does not comply with the approved
construction documents must not proceed until the
applicant submits changes that are approved by the
building official” are added to this subitem. This language
is needed and reasonable because it clarifies that changes
made during construction must first be approved by the
building official before it can proceed, if the work is not
being installed according to the approved plans.

1300.0160 FEES.

Subpart 4, subitem C. This subitem is deleted
because the statute placing a permit fee limitation on the
replacement of a residential fixture or appliance was
repealed in the 2007 Regular Legislative Session. It is
reasonable to eliminate a rule requirement that mirrors a
statutory requirement if the statute no longer exists.

Subpart 6, subitem A.

Exception (a). Exception (a) is amended by
deleting the phrase “types to include” and replacing it with
“configurations of” to provide clarity to the exception.

Exception (b). Exception (b) is amended by
deleting “to include poured concrete, masonry units, and
wood” and adding ‘“alternate” before the word
“foundation,” and by adding “approved by the building
official,” after the word “materials.” This modification is
necessary because the existing exception is too specific
and does not permit flexibility by the building official for
approving modifications to master plans.

Exception (c). Exception (c), “garage
dimensions,” is deleted because garage size changes cause
additional structural plan review work that was not
intended when this exception was included in the rule.

Exception old (d), new (c). This exception is not
modified, but relettered because subitem (c) is deleted.

Exception new (d). New exception (d) is
relocated from exception (g). This modification is
necessary because subitems (¢) and (f) are deleted.

Exceptions (e), (f), and (g). Exceptions (e)
“bays or cantilevered floor areas,” and (f) “decks and
porches,” are deleted because the modifications are
significant enough to cause structural plan review work
that was not intended when the rule was written. Also, a
master plan with a small attached deck may not have a
suitable structural floor system to support a larger deck.
Exception (g) is relettered to become new exception (d).

Subpart 8. Work commencing before permit
issuance. This subpart is modified by adding the phrase
“whether or not a permit is issued” after the phrase “[a]n
investigation fee established by the municipality shall be
collected.” Adding this phrase is necessary to clarify that
an investigation fee will be charged regardless of whether
a permit is ultimately issued if an investigation occurs.
After the investigation, it may be determined that the
project will not be permitted to proceed based on zoning
violations, improper construction techniques, or other
ordinances of the municipality. It is reasonable to collect
the investigation fee nevertheless because of the time and
expense the municipality incurred in determining the work
that will require permitting or whether the work can be
completed at all.

Subpart 10. State surcharge fees. This subpart
is modified by deleting the phrase at the end of the first
and second paragraphs that states “to the attention of the
state building official.” These phrases were in the rule to
direct surcharge report mail to the office of the State
Building Official, which was physically located in a
different building than the offices of the Department of
Administration. The office of the State Building Official is
now located within the same building as the Department
of Labor and Industry, so it is no longer necessary to
redirect the mail.

1300.0170 STOP WORK ORDER.

The change in the first paragraph is needed to
authorize the building official to issue a stop work order,
or a notice or order specified in part 1300.0110 subpart 4.
This is reasonable because the building official can
require corrections without stopping the work on the
entire project or portion thereof by using a correction
notice or order to accomplish the goal to require the work
to meet the state building code.



Chapter 1300, Administration

This part is further modified by adding a phrase near
the end of the part regarding the continuance of work after
service of a stop work order. This modification is
necessary to coordinate with the incorporated model code
documents. In addition, it is needed to clarify that
continuing work after a stop work order is a violation of
law.

It is also needed to clarify that a stop work order may
authorize limited work to be done to abate a continuing
violation or unsafe condition. It is reasonable to clarify
that while violating a stop work order by continuing to
work may be a violation, a stop work order may also
include orders to correct work that cannot continue to exist
until the stop work order is lifted.

1300.0180 UNSAFE
STRUCTURES.

BUILDINGS OR

The first sentence of the third paragraph is modified
to require the building official to order dangerous
buildings to be vacated. It is reasonable to require the
building official to take this action rather than to use
discretion when a building is, in fact, dangerous to
occupy.

This rule is further modified by adding language to
the third paragraph giving the building official authority to

order disconnection of utilities to eliminate a safety hazard.

This modification is necessary to permit the building
official to order disconnection of building utilities in
emergency situations. Building utilities, such as electricity
and gas, can add to the emergency if not disconnected in
the event of a fire, flood, or damaging storm. It is
reasonable to give the building official the authority to
order the disconnection of utilities to help prevent
additional damage to property and to minimize hazards to
emergency personnel.

1300.0190 TEMPORARY STRUCTURES AND
USES.

Subpart 1. General. This subpart is modified by
deleting the language pertaining to limiting the time the
permit is effective. Deleting this language is necessary to
allow municipalities to regulate the time period that a
temporary structure will be permitted to continue. It is
reasonable to permit municipalities to limit this through
local zoning rather than be regulated and confined by the
State Building Code.

1300.0210 INSPECTIONS.
Subpart 6, subitem D. This subitem is modified

to reflect changes made to language contained in
incorporated model code documents.

Subpart 6, subitem H. This subitem is modified
to reflect changes made to language contained in
incorporated model code documents.

1300.0215 PLUMBING.

Subpart 1. Inspection, testing and permits.
The heading to this subpart has been modified to reflect
changes made to the remainder of the subpart to more
accurately describe what is contained in the subpart. The
existing language in the subpart is deleted in its entirety
but has been revised and relocated in two new subparts. It
is necessary to revise the language for ease of
understanding and to separate the requirements in the
provision because the current provision combines issues
that are better presented separately for clarity. There are
two reasons for this change. First, neither the Minnesota
Plumbing Code nor this chapter contains any provisions to
provide exceptions for a permit for plumbing work. As a
result, this section is amended to specifically identify
plumbing work that would not require a permit and
inspection by the municipality. Second, local jurisdictions
often question which type of plumbing work, pursuant to
1300.0215, subpart 1, requires a permit and inspection. In
some jurisdictions, permits are required for any plumbing
work covered by the Minnesota Plumbing Code in any
building or home, including mere replacement of any
plumbing material, faucet, or a toilet. This requirement is
unreasonable and unrealistic because fixture replacement
is considered basic maintenance and does not involve the
replacement of plumbing piping, so it should not require
permitting, inspections, or testing by the administrative
authority.

Subpart 1, subitem A. The phrase
“administrative authority,” as used in this part, refers to a
different entity than the entity defined in Minnesota Rule,
part 1300.0070, subpart 2, and referenced in the rest of
chapter 1300. To avoid confusion, it is necessary to define
“administrative authority” separately as it relates to
administration of the plumbing code in Chapter 1300.

Subpart 1, subitem B This subitem contains
language that was located in the existing subpart 1 but has
been revised to further clarify the testing and inspection
requirements for new plumbing systems or parts of
existing plumbing systems that have been altered,
extended or repaired. These requirements are consistent
with the existing rule language and past practices.

Subpart 1, subitem C. This subitem provides
exceptions to plumbing work that typically require
permits, inspections, and testing. The listed exceptions are
considered basic work and common installations that do
not need to be subject to permit, inspection, and testing
requirements unless the plumbing work poses an
unsanitary or hazardous condition. Types of basic



Chapter 1300, Administration

plumbing work may include water line connections to the
replacement of a refrigerator or a clothes washer with
existing plumbing connections that are associated with
plumbing in residential installation. For this reason, it is
reasonable to waive plumbing permits, inspections, and
testing without jeopardizing health and safety. The
exceptions are limited to one-and two family dwellings
only and apply only if the plumbing work does not pose an
unsanitary or hazardous condition. In addition, this part
does not waive the plumbing licensing requirement to
perform any plumbing work listed in the exceptions (1)
through (4).

Subpart 1, subitem D. This subitem provides
exceptions to testing requirements for limited plumbing
work. This language already existed in rule but has been
relocated to this subpart. Examples of plumbing work that
may not require testing are adjustment of a water closet
carrier for accessibility height requirement under Chapter
1341, repair work by replacement of wax rings for water
closets, or replacement of faucet parts.  Testing
requirements for this type of work may be waived if the
work does not create a hazardous or unsanitary condition.
The exceptions are specific to testing requirements only
for residential and commercial installations.  The
proposed language is consistent with existing language
and past practices.

Subpart 2. Notifications. This subpart is
repealed because it is not consistent with inspection and
approval processes established in Minnesota Rules, part
1300.0120. This part was moved into Minnesota Rules,
chapter 1300 from Minnesota Rules, chapter 4715, and
was a separate requirement for plumbing inspection
notices. Plumbing inspections are the same as other
inspections required by the Minnesota State Building
Code and, as such, should follow the same administrative
procedure for uniformity purposes. It is reasonable to
delete a rule that is not consistent with other rules found in
the same chapter.

Subpart 6. Plans and specifications. The
existing rule is modified to correctly identify the
governmental authority responsible for administration of
the Minnesota Plumbing Code. The Governor’s
Reorganization Order Number 193, issued on April 4,
2005, transferred the authority responsible for
administering the Minnesota Plumbing Code from the
Commissioner of Health to the Commissioner of Labor
and Industry.

This subpart is also modified to clarify that plans
for plumbing plan review submitted to the Department do
not require duplicate sets, which is consistent with current
practices.

10

This rule subpart is further modified by adding
the phrase “and specifications” after the phrase “approved
plans” in the third sentence of the subpart. This change is
necessary because the phrase “plans and specifications” is
referenced several times throughout this subpart. In this
sentence, the phrase “and specifications” is missing from
the reference. The Commissioner requires that both plans
and specifications be submitted to him for approval of
plumbing work. This change is necessary to ensure that all
phrases that refer to “plans and specifications” are
consistent.

The submission of plans and specifications to the
Commissioner of Labor and Industry extends to all
plumbing installations in state licensed health care
facilities. These facilities are licensed by the state as a
hospital, nursing home, supervised living facility, free
standing outpatient surgical center, hospice, or a boarding
care home. The proposed change clarifies that, in cities of
the first class, plumbing plans for all state licensed health
care facilities must be submitted to the Commissioner of
Labor and Industry. This proposed change is needed to
provide consistency with current practices and the
Minnesota Department of Health’s health care licensing
requirements.

This subpart is also amended to clarify that plan
review and specifications for federal buildings are not
required to be submitted and approved by the
Commissioner of Labor and Industry. This modification is
consistent with federal preemption laws.

Finally, additional language is added to clarify
that a connection may be not made to a water supply
system except when proper backflow preventer devices
are provided and approved, pursuant to Minnesota Rules,
chapter 4715. Without this amendment, the requirement
is inconsistent with the rule parts that permit backflow
preventer devices in the water supply system.

1300.0220 CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY.

Subpart 2. Existing structures. This subpart is
modified by deleting the phrase “except as specifically
required in chapter 1311.” This modification is necessary
to coordinate this requirement with Minnesota Rules, part
1300.0040. Part 1300.0040 permits existing structures
undergoing a change of occupancy to be designed to
comply with the provisions of either chapter 1311 or
chapter 1305. Requiring the use of chapter 1311 creates
conflicts for building designers who chose to use chapter
1305, which is the code for new buildings, but is more
restrictive. Chapter 1311, on the other hand, is less
restrictive, but was required to be used. With the proposed
modification to part 1300.0040, the choice is now up to
the designer to determine which code to apply. It is



Chapter 1300, Administration

reasonable and necessary to coordinate this subpart with
Minnesota Rules, part 1300.0040.

Subpart 3. Change in use. This subpart is
modified by deleting the phrase “shall not be made except
as specified in chapter 1311,” and replacing it with the
phrase “must comply with the Minnesota State Building
code or chapter 1311.” This modification is necessary to
coordinate this requirement with Minnesota Rules, part
1300.0040. Part 1300.0040 permits existing structures
undergoing a change of occupancy to be designed to
comply with the provisions of either chapter 1311 or
chapter 1305. It is reasonable and necessary to coordinate
this subpart with Minnesota Rules, part 1300.0040.

Subpart 4. Moved buildings, exceptions. This
subpart is modified by adding a new exception that states
“buildings designed to comply with chapter 1311.” This
new exception is necessary to permit buildings to be
moved into a jurisdiction if it is designed to comply with
chapter 1311. It is reasonable to permit a moved building
to comply with chapter 1311 because other existing
buildings within a municipality are also permitted to be
designed to comply with chapter 1311.

1300.0225 MAINTENANCE. This is a new rule part
regarding maintenance on buildings and structures.
Similar language is in the Guidelines for the
Rehabilitation of Existing Buildings Code book that is
currently incorporated in rule chapter 1311 but is not
included any of the ICC model documents, including the
2012 International Existing Building Code. It is necessary
to incorporate this requirement into the administrative
provisions so an owner can continue use of a building built
under a certain code edition without having to update the
building to a new code with each subsequent code
adoption. This protects the owner from future costs for
unknown future code changes. However, it requires the
owner to maintain the building in a safe, sanitary, and
habitable condition. It is reasonable to require buildings to
be maintained and to permit the building to be maintained
in accordance with the code under which it was
constructed.

1300.0230 BOARD OF APPEALS.

Subpart 5. Final interpretive authority. This
subpart is modified to remind the user that, in accordance
with Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.127, the
commissioner has final interpretive authority to all codes
adopted as part of the State Building Code, except for the
State Plumbing Code, the State Electrical Code, and the
State High Pressure Piping Code, which are all governed
by their respective Boards.

11



This page intentionally left blank.

12



Chapter 1303, Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code

13



Chapter 1303, Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code

Minnesota Department of Labor and Industry
STATEMENT OF NEED AND REASONABLENESS

Proposed Amendment to Rules Governing Radon Gas Mitigation Control Methods in Residential Buildings and the
Minnesota Residential Energy Code, Minnesota Rules, parts 1303.2400-1303.2403 and 1322.0010-1322.2400;
Revisor’s ID Number R-04141

INTRODUCTION

On June 1, 2009, the Commissioner of the Department of Labor and Industry (“Department”) adopted rules for radon
control methods by incorporating by reference a portion of the 2006 International Residential Code (“IRC”), with
amendments.' The radon control methods rules are part of the Minnesota State Building Code and are currently found in
Minnesota Rules, Parts 1322.2100 to 1322.2103, within the Residential Energy Code chapter. The Commissioner, in 2009,
adopted the Minnesota Residential Energy Code, found in Minnesota Rules, Parts 1322.0010 to 1322.1104. The current
Residential Energy Code incorporates by reference the 2006 IRC, with amendments® The Department is amending these
rules.

The radon control methods rules will be relocated from the Residential Energy Code chapter, Minnesota Rules,
Chapter 1322, to the Minnesota Provisions of State Building Code, Minnesota Rules, Chapter 1303. The Department
convened the Radon Rule Advisory Committee to update the radon control methods.> A complete list of the Radon Rule
Advisory Committee members can be found in Exhibit A. Additionally, pursuant to Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.106,
subdivision 1, the Department consulted with the Construction Codes Advisory Council (“CCAC”) on June 21, 2012,
regarding Chapter 1303 Radon Control Methods.* During the previous adoption process, basic requirements for radon
control were adopted into the State Building Code. In the proposed rules, the Department is incorporating more
comprehensive requirements for radon control systems. The proposed rules address both passive and active radon control
systems to provide an option to homeowners should they chose to install an active system.

! Specifically, Appendix F, Radon Control Methods, of the IRC

*Chapter 11

3 The Radon Rule Advisory Committee met on November 1, 2011, November 29, 2011, and December 13, 2011. Meeting agendas
and notes can be found at: http://www.dli.mn.gov/CCLD/rm/1303agendas.asp

* Meeting minutes can be found at: http://www.dli.mn.gov/PDF/ccac/06 1 2minutes.pdf

14



http://www.dli.mn.gov/CCLD/rm/1303agendas.asp
http://www.dli.mn.gov/PDF/ccac/0612minutes.pdf

Chapter 1303, Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code

RULE-BY-RULE ANALYSIS

MINNESOTA RULES, CHAPTER 1303
MINNESOTA PROVISIONS OF THE STATE BUILDING CODE

Throughout this analysis, there are references to
the IRC and the IBC in both the radon control rules and the
energy code rules. The IRC is incorporated by reference
into the Minnesota State Building Code in Minnesota
Rules, part 1309.0010, subpart 1, and the IBC is
incorporated by reference into the Minnesota State
Building Code in Minnesota Rules, part 1305.0011,
subpart 1.

The proposed rules carry forward some of the
requirements from Minnesota Rules, Chapter 1322 for
radon control systems with modifications, and also
incorporate new requirements. These requirements were
located in Chapter 1322 at the time because that
Minnesota Rule Chapter was open for amendments when
legislation was passed to include radon control provisions
in the Minnesota State Building Code. Minnesota Rules,
Chapter 1303 is a better location for radon control system
requirements because the requirements are specific to
Minnesota and the rules apply to the construction of
buildings built under the IRC and IBC, so putting the rules
in chapter 1303 prevents repeating the same rules in
Chapters 1305 (Adoption of the International Building
Code) and 1309 (Adoption of the International Residential
Code).

Minnesota Statutes, section  326B.106,
subdivision 6, requires the radon control rules to
incorporate the radon control methods found in the IRC
appendix as a model but allows amendments to coordinate
with the other adopted construction codes in Minnesota.
The current rules use Appendix F of the IRC (“Appendix
F”) as a model, but incorporation by reference was
unnecessary because there are many modifications to the
model language in the proposed rule. That is, Minnesota
Rules, parts 1322.2101 through 1322.2103 are
modifications, deletions, or additions to the language in
Appendix F. Some of the language in the proposed rule
has been carried forward from the existing rules without
substantive revision. Some of the language is new to
provide clear standards; the additions are based on
experience about the radon control methods the
Department has gained since the radon control rules were
first promulgated.

1303.1600 FOOTING DEPTH FOR FROST
PROTECTION.

Subp. 2. Soil under slab on grade construction

15

for buildings (exception). This amendment is modified
by deleting the current 3,000 square-foot size limit and
replacing it with 1,000 square feet. This exception is
intended to apply to accessory structures, such as garages,
carports, and sheds, at risk of experiencing structural
damage resulting from frost heave. The Structural
Advisory Committee believed that structures built to the
3,000 square-foot threshold are not necessarily considered
to be a low risk for damage from frost heave. The 3,000
square-foot threshold is also greater than the 400 and 600
square foot thresholds allowed in the 2012 IRC and IBC.
The advisory committee believed that 3,000 square feet
does not accurately reflect the sizes to which these
structures are commonly constructed and that the 1,000
square-foot threshold would better reflect a size to reduce
the risk for damage from frost heave. The Minnesota
Board of Architecture, Engineering, Land Surveying,
Landscape Architecture, Geoscientists and Interior
Design’s rules, Minnesota Rules, part 1800.5900, requires
the 1,000 square-foot threshold for Group U occupancy
types, which are structures defined as buildings and
structures of an accessory character. The occupancy
Group U structures that exceed the 1,000 square-foot area
or a structure that is greater than 1-story are not exempt
from the Board’s professional design requirements,
pursuant to Minnesota Rules, part 1800.5900. The
structural engineer of record’s design, therefore, would be
required to protect the structure from effects of frost
heave. For these reasons, the advisory committee chose
the 1,000 square-foot threshold as the new limit for this
exception.

While the proposed threshold is more restrictive
than the current rule, the proposed amendment is less
restrictive than similar requirements in the IRC and IBC
proposed for adoption. There is a potential initial cost
increase to a small percentage of buildings, but there will
also be potential for long term cost savings because of
reduced structural damage and repair costs to larger
structures. Most detached, one-story private garages,
carports, and sheds built over 1,000 square feet are built
with a post and beam structure with the posts extending to
minimum frost depth, so these structures are at less risk of
damage caused by ground movement.

1303.2200 SIMPLIFIED WIND LOADS.

Subp. 2. Simplified design wind pressures.
This subpart is modified by changing the equation and



Chapter 1303, Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code

tables for horizontal pressures. This modification is
necessary and reasonable to keep the Minnesota State
Building Code's “Simplified Wind Load Procedure”
current with procedural changes that have occurred in the
International Building Code. By maintaining the
“Simplified Wind Load Procedure,” the cost of designing
simple structures for wind loads is reduced.

REPEALER. 1303.1800 RADIAL ICE ON TOWERS.

Minnesota Rule part 1303.1800, Radial Ice on
Towers, added a necessary requirement that was not in the
2006 IBC. This rule part is now being repealed because
the 2012 edition of the IBC contains Section 1614,
Atmospheric Ice Loads, and references Chapter 10 of the
ASCE-7 (Section C10.0, Ice Loads—Atmospheric Icing),
which contains the necessary requirements and references.

The national standard lists the requirements by
county. There will be an increase in requirements in some
counties, and therefore an increase in cost in some
counties. Requirements and associated costs will vary
based on location and on type and size of the structure.

1303.2400 PURPOSE AND SCOPE.

Subpart 1.  Applicability; residential
structures. Like the current rules, the proposed rules
apply to new residential buildings but clarify more
specifically what buildings are within the scope of the rule
and which ones are not. This subpart explains that these
rules apply only to new residential structures, residential
portions, and some additions to existing dwellings. The
subpart explains that if a radon control system is required
pursuant to this rule part, then a passive system is the
minimum requirement for a radon control system. This
language is new.

The purpose of the Minnesota State Building
Code is to establish reasonable safeguards for health,
safety, comfort, and security of the residents of this state.
If an addition, without required radon protection, is
allowed to be added to a residence that has a radon system,
the unprotected area of the addition would potentially
allow radon into the protected area of the house, thus
making it less safe.

Subp. 2. Applicability; design features. This
subpart identifies the structural features in a building
design that trigger the requirement for a radon control
system if the rule applies to the structure type and clarifies
what features do not trigger that requirement. For
example, hotels and motels are explicitly exempted from
these requirements because the statutory authority in
Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.106, subdivision 6,
authorizes the Department to “adopt rules for radon

16

control as part of the State Building Code for all new
residential buildings.” Emphasis added.

The building configurations listed in subpart 2(A)
through (F), identify when radon control methods must be
included in the construction. This list is necessary
because it incorporates the most common building
configurations that are known to allow the intrusion of
radon gas into the building. It is reasonable to require
radon control systems only when the building
configuration is conducive to radon intrusion. The
proposed language further clarifies that in addition to
hotels and motels, any foundation alteration or an addition
to an existing structure that does not have a radon control
system is not subject to these rules. This clarifies to the
building construction industry and building officials the
types of structures and alterations and additions that
require radon control systems.

Exceptions are added to the end of this subpart.

Exception 1. Crawl spaces outside the
conditioned space of the residential dwelling. The first
exception clarifies that unconditioned crawl spaces which
are vented directly to the outside atmosphere, according to
the building code requirements specified for that building,
are exempt from the radon control requirements. This
exception references several code sections that, if
complied with, would exempt the crawl space from a
radon control system. Section R408.1 of the 2012 IRC
and sections 1203.3 through 1203.3.1 of the 2012 IBC
address ventilation of “under-floor space between the
bottom of the floor joists and the earth under any building.
Section R408.2 of the IRC addresses openings for
under-floor ventilation.  IBC Sections 1203.3 and
1203.3.1 pertain to under-floor ventilation of buildings.
Title 24, section 3285.505, of the Code of Federal
Regulations pertains to crawlspace ventilation. Minnesota
Rules, part 1350.2700, subpart 8, addresses skirting
material, and ventilation, in foundations and support
systems of manufactured homes. This exception is
necessary to ensure that these requirements are enforced
and interpreted correctly by providing accurate
descriptions for the types of crawl spaces that are exempt
from the radon control system requirement.

Exception 2. Hotels and motels. An exception
for Hotels and Motels has been included because
Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.106, Subdivision 6,
states in part that “[t]he commissioner of labor and
industry shall adopt rules for radon control as part of the
State Building Code for all new residential buildings.”
Since hotels and motels are transient in nature and not
intended for use as a long term residence, they have been
exempted from the radon control system requirements.



Chapter 1303, Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code

Exception 3. Additions to existing dwellings
which have not incorporated a radon control system.
The purpose of the radon control system is to protect the
occupants of a dwelling by reducing the potential radon
within the dwelling by the use of a radon control system.
It is not necessary to require a radon control system for an
addition to an existing dwelling which does not have a
radon control system installed. Adding a radon control
system to a new addition would unnecessarily increase the
cost of construction while providing no additional
protection to the occupants because the existing structure
will remain unprotected.

Subp. 3. Mixed-occupancy or multistory
mixed occupancy buildings. The requirements in this
subpart are new. The Department received numerous
inquiries regarding multi-story and mixed occupancy
structures and whether radon control systems are
necessary in these structures. This new language
eliminates that confusion and clarifies the radon control
requirements for these types of structures. It is important
to ensure residential portions are protected from radon
with radon control systems or proper sealing from
non-residential portions where appropriate. This provision
strikes a balance between meeting the statutory authority
and protecting residential portions and maintaining
reasonable costs by not requiring radon control systems in
some non-residential portions of mixed occupancy
buildings.

1303.2401 DEFINITIONS.

Subpart 1. Terms Not Defined. This subpart
provides direction to the user for terms that are not defined
in these rules or elsewhere in the Minnesota State Building
Code. This language is consistent with language in other
portions of the Minnesota Building Code such as
Minnesota Rules, part 1300.0070, subpart 1.

Subp 2. Definitions. This subpart provides
definitions for terms used in this rule that are not defined
elsewhere in parts 1303.2400 to 1300.2403.

Active Radon Control System. This definition
is derived and modified from two terms in the current
rules. The current rules in Chapter 1322 have definitions
for: 1) “sub-slab depressurization system (passive)” and 2)
“sub-slab depressurization system (active).” The two
definitions are nearly identical with the exception that the
passive definition includes a vent pipe whereas the active
definition references a fan-powered vent pipe. The
similarities between the two terms and definitions have
caused confusion in the past. Putting the key word first,
“active” in this case, aids in distinguishing the type of
system which is defined below. Changing the term
“sub-slab depressurization” to “radon control” uses

17

common language that more simply describes the purpose
of these systems and is used throughout the rule. The
definition describes the intended objective (achieving
“lower air pressure below the soil-gas membrane relative
to the indoor air pressure”) and how it will be
accomplished (“by use of a fan that has been added to the
passive radon control system”). Adding this definition
will provide clarity to the proposed rule.

Approved. This definition is added to this
proposed rule and to other chapters in the Minnesota State
Building code, including chapter 1300, to give the
building official discretion to approve new materials or
technology while maintaining quality and the purpose of
the rules.

CFR. This definition is added to clarify the
reference in the exception in rule part 1303.2400, subpart
2.

Gas Permeable Material. This definition
describes the types of material that are accepted as gas
permeable materials, which are required to be installed
below the soil-gas membrane.” This definition is
necessary because the term is used in this rule. The
language in subitems 1 and 2 is from Appendix F of the
IRC, AF103.2. The language for subitem 3 is modified
from the language contained in Appendix F of the IRC,
AF103.2. The language in Appendix F contains the
phrase, “other floor designs with demonstrated capability
to permit depressurization.” This language is problematic
because it does not specify how to demonstrate the
capability. The language is modified by removing the
phrase “with demonstrated capability to permit
depressurization across the entire sub-floor area” and
replacing it with the phrase “professionally engineered to
provide depressurization under the entire soil-gas
membrane.” This modification clarifies that the materials,
systems or floor designs must be engineered designs by
licensed design professionals to be accepted as
establishing the required movement of gases below the
soil gas membrane so they can be collected and vented to
the exterior.

IBC. This definition is provided because the
proposed rule references the International Building Code
but this code is not defined. This definition will provide
clarity to the user.

IRC. This definition is provided because the
proposed rule references the International Residential
Code but this code is not defined. This definition will
provide clarity to the user.

Passive Radon Control System. This definition
is derived and modified from two terms in the current
rules. The current rules in Chapter 1322 have definitions



Chapter 1303, Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code

for: 1) “sub-slab depressurization system (passive)” and
2) “sub-slab depressurization system (active).” The two
definitions are nearly identical with the exception that the
passive definition includes a vent pipe whereas the active
definition references a fan-powered vent. The similarities
between the two terms and definitions have caused
confusion in the past. Putting the key word first,
“passive,” in this case, aids in distinguishing this term
from the optional active radon control system defined
above. Changing the term “sub-slab depressurization” to
“radon control” uses common language that more simply
describes the purpose of these systems and is used
throughout the rule. The definition describes the intended
objective (achieving “lower air pressure below the
soil-gad membrane relative to the indoor air pressure”)
and how it will be accomplished (“by use of a vent pipe
that relies on stack effect to provide an upward flow of air
from beneath the soil-gas membrane”). Adding this
definition will provide clarity to the proposed rule.

Radon Gas. This definition is an excerpt of the
current definition in Minnesota Rules part 1322.2102.
The definition is amended by removing unnecessary
commentary that describes how radon gas moves through
soil and is undetectable by human senses. This
modification will clarify this definition.

Sealed. This definition is necessary to provide a
definition for the word “sealed” that is specific to the
construction industry and to the installation of radon
control systems.

Soil-Gas Membrane. This term replaces
“SOIL-GAS RETARDER?” in the current rule. The term
“membrane” replaces “retarder” because “membrane”
better describes the material whereas “retarder” describes
the function. That is, “membrane” is a more accurate
descriptor in this case. The language in the proposed
definition is largely the same as the current definition but
removes “or other equivalent material used to retard the
flow of soil gases into a building.” This language was
removed because it is redundant; Minnesota Rules, part
1300.0110, subp. 13, allows the building official to accept
alternate methods and materials as long as the alternate
methods and materials would be equivalent to those
required by the Minnesota State Building Code.

Vent Pipe. The current rules define what a vent
pipe is and include some description of the physical
requirement along with a description of how a vent pipe
must be utilized. The proposed rule language extracts the
physical description provided to create a definition that
applies to all “vent pipe” references.

1303.2402 REQUIREMENTS FOR PASSIVE
RADON CONTROL SYSTEMS.

18

Subpart 1. Gas permeable material
preparation. The language in this subpart will ensure
that a gas permeable material, as defined above, is placed
on top of the prepared subgrade prior to the installation of
a floor system. This language is necessary because it is
the first step of the procedure for the proper installation of
a passive radon control system.

Subp. 2. Soil-gas membrane installation. The
language in this subpart describes how and where soil-gas
membranes must be installed so that radon control
systems will operate effectively and efficiently. The
soil-gas membrane will contribute to the health and safety
of Minnesota residents by further preventing radon from
entering the dwelling from the ground below the building.

Subp. 3. “T” Fitting. This subpart describes
how a “T” fitting must be installed in a vent system. The
current rule refers to “the "1~ fitting” in Minnesota Rules,
part 1322.2103 in sections AF103.5.3 and AF103.6.1,
Requirements. Connecting and orienting the “T” fitting is
not clearly explained in the current rule. The proposed
language is necessary to clarify how to connect the “T”
fitting to ensure that same-size materials are used for all
pipes and fittings. E.g., 3-inch perforated pipe or drain
tile, connected to 3-inch “T” fitting, connected to 3-inch
vent pipe.

Subp 4. Potential entry routes. The first
sentence of this subpart is a slightly modified version of
Minnesota Rules, part 1322.2103, section AF103.4.
Specifically, the phrase “closed in accordance with
sections...” is deleted and replaced with the phrase
“sealed according to this subpart, as applicable.” The
phrase, “as applicable” is added to the end of the sentence
to clarify that the requirements apply to the circumstances
that are relevant. These modifications are necessary to
provide clarity and consistency with language in other
parts of the Minnesota State Building Code.

A. Floor openings. This item is a modified
version of Minnesota Rules, part 1322.2103, section
AF103.4.1. The following modifications are made:

1. The phrase “...that penetrate concrete slabs or
other floor assemblies” is modified to read “...that
penetrate the soil-gas membrane and the concrete slab or
other floor systems.” This change is necessary to
incorporate the soil-gas membrane into the description for
“floor openings” because the soil gas membrane may be
part of the floor system or possibly the only floor system.

2. The phrase “...shall be filled with a
polyurethane caulk or equivalent sealant...” was deleted.
This modification is necessary because the deleted
language mandates a polyurethane caulking or equivalent
material to be used. The term “sealed” is newly defined in



Chapter 1303, Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code

a way so that specifying sealant material is unnecessary;
the new definition describes a final outcome of what is
necessary to prevent radon gas from entering the building
where objects penetrate both the soil-gas membrane and
the floor system.

B. Concrete joints. This item is a modified
version of rule part 1322.2103, section AF103.4.2. The
modifications include: 1) using the phrase “shall be
sealed” in place of the phrase “sealed with a caulk or
sealant” and 2) “and filled with polyurethane caulk or
other elastomeric sealant in accordance with the
manufacturer’s recommendations” is replaced with “prior
to sealing” because “sealed” is now defined. These
modifications use language that is consistent with other
portions of the proposed rules.

C. Foundation walls. The requirement for
foundation walls is being carried forward from rule part
1322.2103, section AF103.4.5, but the content is
rephrased and reorganized to provide better clarity. The
sentence “Penetrations of all foundation wall types shall
be sealed,” is added at the beginning of the provision
because it provides the objective of the requirement. The
remaining language is reorganized in a list format to
clarify the requirements for the different types of
foundations walls or features on foundation walls. These
requirements are now in a centralized location rather than
being scattered throughout the rule.

D. Unconditioned crawl spaces. The language
in this item is derived from two sections in rule part
1322.2103: sections AF103.4.9 and AF103.4.10. These
sections are being combined into a single requirement for
clarity and simplicity. Section AF103.4.9 addresses
unconditioned crawl space floors and Section AF103.4.10
addresses unconditioned crawl space access. The phrase
“or otherwise filled to prevent air leakage” is deleted and
replaced with the newly defined term “sealed,” because
the original phrase is vague. With regard to the crawl
space floors and access, “sealed” is a more accurate term
because to “otherwise fill” the crawl space opening
according to the current language could result in an
opening being filled, which is not the desired result. The
proposed language addresses how to prevent radon gas
from escaping through access openings by use of a
gasketed door. These changes are reasonable and
necessary to provide clarity.

E. Sumps. The requirement for sumps is being
carried forward from rule part 1322.2103, section
AF103.4.4 but the content is revised slightly for clarity.
The current language in rule part 1322.2103, section
AF103.4.4 addresses the requirements for the sump lid in
two statements. The proposed rule combines these
statements into a single statement that identifies the need

19

for the sump lid to be gasketed and if the sump is used as
the termination point for the radon control system, the lid
must be designed to accommodate the vent pipe. The
proposed rule also addresses the prevention of a possible
short circuit in the radon control system by clarifying that
a back flow prevention device is required in the sump
pump water discharge line to prevent the radon control
system from drawing outside air rather than air from
below the soil gas membrane. This change is reasonable
and necessary because it provides clarity and simplicity to
the reader who may be installing or enforcing this rule.

Note: AF103.4.3, Condensate drains is not carried
forward here because condensate drains are regulated by
the International Mechanical Code, as adopted in
Minnesota  Rules chapter 1346. AF103.4.6
Waterproofing/dampproofing is not carried forward
because they are regulated by the International Residential
Code, as adopted in Minnesota Rules chapter 1309.

Subd. 5. Vent pipes.

A. Single vent pipe. The language in this
subitem is a modified version of the language currently
located in part 1322.2103, sections AF103.5.3 and
AF103.6.1. The proposed rule eliminates repetitive
language and reorganizes the vent pipe requirements into
a single location. The requirement regarding “T” fittings is
relocated to its own subpart; rule part 1303.2402, subpart
3. Adding a requirement requiring individual sections of
the vent pipe to be “primed and glued” together provides
clarity that is missing in the current rule. The installation
requirements regarding an extension above the roof and a
location in proximity of an opening into the conditioned
spaces of a building are carried forward from Minnesota
Rules, part 1322.2103, sections AF103.5.3 and
AF103.6.1.

Finally, the current rule part 1322.2103, section
AF103.6.1, Exceptions, identifies requirements for a
minimum of an R-4 insulation when vent pipes run
through unconditioned space. However, this insulation
requirement is triggered only when an active radon control
system is installed. This insulation requirement is
modified in the proposed rule to apply when any vent pipe
runs through unconditioned space, including passive
radon control systems, because only a passive system may
be required. The insulation requirement plays an
important role in maintaining the interior temperature of
the vent that is relying on natural stack effect (hot air
rises). The addition of this language in the vent pipe
section of the proposed rule is reasonable and necessary to
ensure that the required passive system will operate
effectively.


http:AF103.4.10
http:AF103.4.10

Chapter 1303, Minnesota Provisions to the State Building Code

B. Multiple vent pipes. The requirements in
this subitem pertaining to multiple vent pipes is carried
forward from rule part 1322.2103, section AF103.6.2, but
revised for clarity. The phrase “sub-slab aggregate” is
deleted in the proposed rule because this phrase is not used
in the proposed rules; it has been replaced with the term
“gas-permeable material.” This change is reasonable and
necessary for clarity. The current language in rule part
1322.2103, section AF103.6.2 is ambiguous because it
does not specify when areas may be divided into separate
areas because of barriers. Adding the phrase “into 2 or
more areas” clarifies when separate radon control systems
are required; these separate systems can be connected to a
single vent. The phrase “at least 12 inches above the roof”
was deleted to remove redundant language and it is
replaced with “in accordance with item A.” This change is
reasonable and necessary to ensure that vent systems are
installed properly.

C. Vent pipe drainage. The language in this
subitem pertaining to vent pipe drainage is carried forward
from Minnesota Rules, part 1322.2103, section AF103.7.
This language is modified by deleting the word “positive”
prior to the word “drainage” in the current rule. The word
“positive” is not necessary because all radon gas vent
pipes shall drain to the ground beneath the soil-gas
membrane. The phrase “slab or soil-gas-retarder” is
replaced with “soil-gas membrane.” This modification is
necessary to coordinate the language with other language
used in the proposed rules.

D. Vent pipe accessibility. The language in this
subitem is carried forward from rule part 1322.2103,
section AF103.8, but is modified grammatically for better
clarity.

E. Vent pipe identification. The language in
this subitem is from rule part 1322.2103, section AF103.9,
but contains modifications. The word “floor” is deleted
and replaced with the word “story” to provide better
clarity and consistency with terminology used in the
proposed rules. The phrase “and crawl spaces” is added to
the end of the first sentence because vent pipes may be in
crawl spaces and therefore should be identified
consistently with the other stories. The label “Radon
Reduction System” was deleted and replaced with the
label “Radon Gas Vent System” because the label uses
plain language that is easy to understand and consistent
with other language used in the proposed rule.

F. Combination foundations. The language in
this subitem is carried forward from rule part 1322.2103,
section AF103.10, but is modified. The exception in the
subitem is deleted because single vent pipes are addressed
above so it is no longer necessary.

20

Subp. 6. Power Source. The requirement in this
subpart is a modified version of rule part 1322.2103,
section AF103.12. The modified language is necessary to
provide clarity and better direction regarding the
installation of a power source. The proposed rule states
that the power source cannot be installed in any
conditioned space, basement, or crawl space. This is
necessary so that the fan will only pressurize the vent
outside the living space, which will prevent the exposure
of radon gas into the dwelling if the vent system should
experience a joint failure.

1303.2403 REQUIREMENTS FOR ACTIVE RADON
CONTROL SYSTEMS.

This rule part describes the requirements for an
active radon control system. The current rules regarding
active radon control (a.k.a. submembrane
depressurization) systems provide only two pieces of
information relative to the subject matter. Minnesota
Rules, part 1322.2102, section AF102 provides a
definition for this type of system and the exception in
Minnesota Rules, part 1322.2103, section AF103.6.1,
which describes the routing for vent pipes in
unconditioned spaces if an active radon control system is
installed. The proposed rule part provides all of the
requirements for an active radon control system in one
location. This proposed rule part offers clear requirements
for proper application and installation of active radon
control systems.

A. Radon gas vent pipe fan. This subitem
provides detailed information relating to the requirements
for a radon gas vent pipe fan. This item is necessary
because it establishes the size and location of the radon
fan, which is not specified in the current radon rules.

B. System-monitoring device. This subitem
requires a system monitoring device for active radon
control systems. This requirement is necessary because
occupants and owners need to know if the fan ceases to
operate because radon gas could build up under the
soil-gas membrane without a functioning fan. Because the
fan is not easily accessible or audible in normal use in a
residential building, a monitoring device is necessary.

C. Luminaire and receptacle outlet. This
subitem requires a light to be installed at the power source.
This requirement is necessary to ensure the area near the
appliance installation site is illuminated for both the
installation and maintenance of the fan. This requirement
also exempts the requirement in the Mechanical Code for
a catwalk to the appliance when the appliance is a radon
gas vent pipe fan. The additional expense incurred by
requiring the catwalk would provide no added benefit so
the requirement was exempted.


http:AF103.12
http:AF103.10

Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

21



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

Minnesota Department of Labor and Industry
STATEMENT OF NEED AND REASONABLENESS

Proposed Amendment to Rules Governing the Adoption of the International Building Code, Minnesota
Rules, chapter 1305; Revisor’s ID Number R-04142

INTRODUCTION

The Commissioner of the Department of Labor and Industry proposes to adopt amendments to rules governing the
Minnesota Building Code, Minnesota Rules, chapter 1305. The proposed rules will incorporate by reference the 2012
International Building Code (“IBC”), with amendments.

On July 10, 2007, the 2006 edition of the International Building Code became effective and was adopted, with
amendments, by the Department. The Department chose to skip the adoption of the 2009 edition of the IBC because of the
drastic slowdown of the construction economy and the lack of technical experts available to assist the Department with that
adoption. Therefore, the Department currently administers and enforces the 2006 edition of the IBC, with amendments.

The International Code Council (“ICC”) publishes the IBC. The ICC reviews and modifies the ICC Model Codes
every three years to incorporate the most current construction code criteria to provide the construction industry with the most
current code provisions for use throughout the nation. The IBC is the primary commercial, industrial and institutional code
that provides minimum requirements to safeguard the public health, safety, and general welfare to occupants of new and
existing buildings, facilities, and systems. The IBC applies to all occupancies, including one- and two-family dwellings and
townhouses. While not required, the IBC may be used for one-and-two family dwellings and townhouses in lieu of the
International Residential Code (“IRC”), however the differences between the IBC and IRC are not significant.

The Department utilized a Chapter 1305 Advisory Committee (“Advisory Committee”) composed of commercial
construction technical experts and fire safety experts to provide the Commissioner with recommended changes to the 2012
edition of the IBC. Pursuant to Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.106, subdivision 1, the Department also consulted with the
Construction Codes Advisory Council in establishing the proposed adoption of, and amendments to, the 2012 IBC in this
rulemaking.

22



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

RULE-BY-RULE ANALYSIS

MINNESOTA RULES, CHAPTER 1305
MINNESOTA BUILDING CODE

GENERAL.

References to IBC Editions and Minnesota
Rule Parts. When referencing the IBC throughout the
proposed rules, the year “2006” is deleted and replaced
with the year “2012.” The Department is proposing to
adopt the 2012 edition of the IBC, replacing the 2006
edition, with amendments. Also, in many locations
throughout the proposed rules, the phrase “Minnesota
Rules” is added prior to references to specific Minnesota
rule chapters and parts to provide clarity about chapter
reference. Similarly, references to “IBC” are added prior
to references to specific IBC chapters and sections to
clarify that the specific chapter or section that is being
referenced in the proposed rule is a section of the IBC.

Definitions. Throughout the proposed rules and
in this SONAR, specific terms are used to explain
requirements contained in certain rule parts. These terms
are defined in detail within Chapter 2 of the 2012 IBC or
within Part 1305.0202 of the proposed rules, and are
described in this “GENERAL” section so that referring to
the IBC is not necessary to understand these terms.

Occupancy Groups. Throughout the proposed
rules and in this SONAR, various “occupancy groups” are
frequently mentioned when describing application of
specific requirements under the 2012 IBC and its
proposed amendments to structures occupied and used by
various groups of people. While not separately defined in
Chapter 2 of the IBC, these occupancy groupings are
described in detail in Sections 301 through 312 of the
2012 IBC. A brief summary of all occupancy groupings
follows to assist the reader in more fully understanding the
scope and application of the 2012 IBC to specific types of
building occupancies:

Assembly Group A
occupancies (A-1, A-2, A-3, A-4, and
A-5).  Generally, Group A occupancies
are places where people assemble in
small or large groups. Examples of
Group A occupancies would include
indoor symphony or concert halls, night
clubs, restaurants, amusement arcades,
places of worship, bowling alleys,
gymnasiums, museums, outdoor
amusement park structures, outdoor
grandstands, and outdoor stadiums.
Group A occupancies are more fully

23

described in Section 303 of the
International Building Code.

Business Group B occupancies.
Group B occupancies are structures or
buildings, or a portion thereof, that
provide general business services for
people, including the use for office,
professional, or service-type transactions,
and the storage of records and accounts.
Group B occupancies are more fully
described in Section 304 of the
International Building Code.

Educational Group E
occupancies. Group E occupancies are
facilities or building structures that
provide educational services for people,
including the use of a building or
structure, or portion thereof, by six or
more persons at any one time for
educational purposes through the twelfth
grade. Group E occupancies are more
fully described in Section 305 of the
International Building Code.

Factory Group F occupancies
(F-1and F-2). Group F occupancies are
factory industrial buildings or structures
used for assembly, disassembly,
fabrication, finishing, manufacturing,
packaging, repair or  processing
operations that are not otherwise
classified as a Group H hazardous or
Group S storage occupancy. Group F
occupancies are more fully described in
Section 306 of the International Building
Code.

High-Hazard Group H
occupancies (H-1, H-2, H-3, H-4, and

H-5). Group H occupancies are
generally buildings or structures used for
the manufacturing, processing,

generation or storage of materials in
quantities that constitute a high physical
or health hazard as established by
various IBC provisions. Group H
occupancies are more fully described in
Section 307 of the International Building
Code.

Institutional Group |
occupancies (I-1, 1-2, 1-3, and 1-4).
Generally, Group [ occupancies are



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

facilities or buildings that provide care
services for people, long-term detention
for people, or serve as a long-term
residence for persons that receive
custodial care from persons other than
parents or guardians. Examples of
Group [ occupancies would include
assisted living facilities, group homes,
rehabilitation facilities, hospitals,
nursing homes, detoxification facilities,
prisons, reformatories, and detention
centers. Group I occupancies are more
fully described in Section 308 of the
International Building Code and in
Minnesota Rules, part 1305.0308,
subparts 1, 2, and 3.

Mercantile Group M
occupancies. Group M occupancies are
buildings or structures, or portions
thereof, accessible to the public and used
for the display and sale of merchandise,
including the stocking of goods, wares or
merchandise incidental to such purposes.
Group M occupancies are more fully
described in Section 309 of the
International Building Code.

Residential Group R
occupancies (R-1, R-2, R-3 and R-4).
Group R occupancies are typically
places that people board for short or long
periods of time, family dwellings, adult
and child care facilities, congregate
living facilities, and residential care or
assisted living facilities. Examples of
Group R occupancies include boarding
houses, hotels, motels, apartment houses,
fraternities, sororities, monasteries, one
and two family dwellings, adult care
facilities, smaller child day care facilities,
and residential care/assisted living
facilities. Group R occupancies are more
fully described in Section 310 of the
International ~ Building Code and
Minnesota Rules, part 1305.0310.

Storage Group S occupancies
(S-1 and S-2). Group S occupancies are
buildings or structures, or portions
thereof, used for storage that is not
classified as a  high-hazardous
occupancy under Section 307 of the IBC.
Group S occupancies are more fully
described in Section 311 of the
International Building Code.

Utility and  Miscellaneous
Group U occupancies. Group U
occupancies are buildings and structures

24

of an accessory character and
miscellaneous ~ structural use not
classified in any other specific
occupancy group by the IBC. Group U
occupancies are more fully described in
Section 312 of the International Building
Code.

1305.0011 ADOPTION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE BY REFERENCE AND
ADMINISTRATIVE AUTHORITY.

Subpart 1. General. This subpart is modified by
revising the code publisher’s information because the
address and the edition have changed since the last code
adoption cycle. This modification is necessary to properly
incorporate by reference the 2012 edition of the IBC.

Subp. 2. Mandatory chapters. Refer to the
“General” statement at the beginning of the Rule by Rule
Analysis section for an explanation to the proposed
changes in this subpart. In addition, the phrase
“Minnesota State Building” was added before the word
“code” in the first sentence to clarify that the code referred
to in this case means the Minnesota State Building Code.

Subp. 3. Replacement chapters. Refer to the
“General” statement at the beginning of the Rule by Rule
Analysis section for an explanation to the proposed
changes in this subpart. In addition, the phrase “State
Building” was added before the phrase “code
administration” to provide the proper reference to the title
of Minnesota Rules, chapter 1300.

Subp. 5. Flood hazard or floodproofing
regulations. Refer to the “General” statement at the
beginning of the Rule by Rule Analysis section for an
explanation to the proposed changes in this subpart.

1305.0021 REFERENCES TO OTHER
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL CODES.

Subpart 3. Residential code. Refer to
the “General” statement at the beginning of the Rule by
Rule Analysis section for an explanation to the proposed
changes in this subpart. Additionally, the sentence is
revised by relocating the phrase “adopted pursuant to” to
correct a grammatical error in the sentence.

Subp. 4. Electrical code. Refer to the
“General” statement at the beginning of the Rule by Rule
Analysis section for an explanation to the proposed
changes in this subpart. Additionally, the sentence is
revised by relocating the phrase “adopted pursuant to” to
correct a grammatical error in the sentence.



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

Subp. 5. Fuel gas code. Refer to the “General”
statement at the beginning of the Rule by Rule Analysis
section for an explanation to the proposed changes in this
subpart.  Additionally, the sentence is revised by
relocating the phrase “adopted pursuant to” to correct a
grammatical error in the sentence.

Subp. 6. Mechanical code. Refer to the
“General” statement at the beginning of the Rule by Rule
Analysis section for an explanation to the proposed
changes in this subpart. Additionally, the sentence is
revised by relocating the phrase “adopted pursuant to” to
correct a grammatical error in the sentence.

Subp. 7. Plumbing code. Refer to the “General”
statement at the beginning of the Rule by Rule Analysis
section for an explanation to the proposed changes in this
subpart.  Additionally, the sentence is revised by
relocating the phrase “adopted pursuant to” to correct a
grammatical error in the sentence. The reference to
Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.106, subdivisions 1 and
2 is deleted and replaced with a reference to Minnesota
Statutes, section 326B.435. This change is necessary
because the statute section was renumbered and the
proposed rule now contains the correct statutory citation.

Subp. 8. Private sewage disposal code.
References to Minnesota Rule chapters 7081, 7082, and
7083 are added to this subpart to direct the user to the
appropriate rules governing individual sewage treatment
systems.

Subp. 9. Energy conservation code.
References to Minnesota Rule chapters 1322 and 1323 are
added to this subpart to clarify that the Minnesota Energy
Code is comprised of both Minnesota Rules, chapter 1322,
the residential provisions of the International Energy
Conservation Code, with amendments, and Minnesota
Rules, chapter 1323, the commercial provisions of the
International ~ Energy  Conservation Code, with
amendments.  Additionally, the section reference to
Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.115, is deleted and
replaced with section 326B.106, subdivision 1, to reflect
the correct statutory authority for adoption of the
Minnesota Energy Code.

Subp. 11. Fire code. This subpart is modified by
adding the phrase ‘“Minnesota Rules” before “chapter
75117 to clarify that chapter 7511 is a Minnesota Rule and
not a chapter in the International Fire Code.

Subp. 12. International Existing Building
Code. Refer to the “General” statement at the beginning
of the Rule by Rule Analysis section for an explanation to
the proposed changes in this subpart. This subpart is
amended to correct the title from “State Building

25

Conservation Code” to “Conservation Code for Existing
Buildings.” Additionally, the sentence is revised by
relocating the phrase “adopted pursuant to” to correct a
grammatical error in the sentence.

1305.0030
CRITERIA.

ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURE

Refer to the “General” statement at the beginning
of the Rule by Rule Analysis section for an explanation to
the proposed changes in this rule part. This subpart is
modified by changing the statutory reference from
Minnesota Statutes, section 16B.57, to section 326B.101,
because the statutory requirement was renumbered and
relocated in Minnesota Statutes to Chapter 326B.

1305.0040 VIOLATION [Repeal].

This rule part is being repealed because this
language is now located in Minnesota Rule, chapter 1300,
which provides administrative direction for all chapters of
the Minnesota State Building Code. As a result, the rule
part is no longer necessary.

1305.0202 SECTION 202, DEFINITIONS.

Subpart 1. Amended definitions. This subpart
and its title are modified to provide the user with amended
definitions to terms used in this proposed rule. This
subpart contains definitions that are being modified from
those definitions contained in Chapter 2 of the 2012 IBC.
The definition for “Agricultural Building” is relocated
alphabetically within this subpart and is revised as
described below.

Agricultural building. The existing definition
for “agricultural building” is being deleted because the
term is defined in Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.103,
subdivision 3. The reference to that statutory citation is
added to this definition instead of the current definition to
ensure that a consistent definition is used between the
proposed rule and Minnesota Statutes.

Aisle. The amended definition for “aisle” is
being proposed to be relocated here without change
because this definition is currently located in Minnesota
Rules, part 1305.1002, but the 2012 IBC definition section
has been relocated to Chapter 2 of the International
Building Code. Therefore, it is reasonable and necessary
to relocate this definition to the corresponding location in
Minnesota Rules, now located in part 1305.0202. The
definition remains unchanged.

Alternating Tread Device. This definition has
been modified to clarify that it is the device that is
“standing” between 50 and 70 degrees from horizontal,



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

rather than the language that described a series of steps
between 50 and 70 degrees from horizontal. This change
is needed to clarify that it is the device that is standing
between 50 and 70 degrees and not that the treads are at 50
to 70 degrees from horizontal. Additionally, the phrase
“that has a series of steps” has been relocated to complete
the description of the device.  This definition is also
amended from the 2012 IBC by adding the second
sentence to provide another option for designers. The
second sentence permits the use of a ships ladder that
complies with Minnesota Rules, part 1305.1209, as an
equivalent to an alternating tread device, when permitted.
This modification is reasonable because both ships ladders
(see Minnesota Rule, part 1305.1209) and alternating
tread devices provide safe alternatives as limited-use stair
devices.

Ambulatory care facility. This is a new
definition in the 2012 IBC, which addresses medical
facilities that provide care on a less than 24-hours basis
where the care recipient may be rendered incapable of
self-preservation without assistance from care providers.
Normally, the inability to exit the building without
assistance would place this use in the Group I-2
occupancy classification, but since one criterion for the
Group I-2 occupancy classification is that the care is on a
24-hour basis, they are instead defined as a “outpatient
clinic” and classified as a Group B occupancy.

The amended definition, along with the revision
of the “outpatient clinic” definition, is an attempt to
mandate additional safeguards under the “ambulatory care
facility” use not required under the “outpatient clinic” use
to address the concerns of the care recipients being
rendered incapable of self-preservation. These additional
safeguards include a fire sprinkler system, smoke
detection, and a smoke barrier that can be utilized as an
area of refuge in the event the occupants cannot exit the
building.

An amendment to the new definition is also
necessary to clarify the scoping of the definition for
kidney dialysis centers to coordinate with Minnesota
Department of Health rules as they relate to Federal
Medicare/Medicaid reimbursement provisions. Without
the modification, Minnesota building and fire officials
would not know how to properly classify kidney dialysis
facilities (“ambulatory care facility” or “outpatient
clinic”’) which would lead to a lack of consistency in code
interpretation and enforcement among code officials. The
omission of a kidney dialysis center located on the level of
exit discharge from the classifications as an ambulatory
care facility is also necessary and reasonable as the time
necessary for these dialysis patients to egress when
located on the ground floor is minimized since there
would be no stairs to traverse and assistance from a care

26

provider is therefore not necessary.

Approved. This definition is modified to
coordinate the definition of “approved” with the same
term contained in other chapters of the Minnesota State
Building Code. The modified definition also provides the
building official with methods to ensure that similar
situations are uniformly addressed when the building
official must determine whether or not construction
methods comply with the Minnesota State Building Code
and formal action is required. The methods listed in this
definition establish whether or not proposed construction
methods comply with the Minnesota State Building Code
while maintaining the intent and purpose of the code. Itis
reasonable to provide the same definition for this term that
is frequently used throughout the Minnesota State
Building Code to ensure uniformity and help prevent
conflicts from one rule to another.

Corridor. The amended definition of “corridor”
is being proposed to be relocated here without change
because this definition is currently located in Minnesota
Rules, part 1305.1002, but the 2012 IBC definition section
has been relocated to Chapter 2 of the International
Building Code. Therefore, it is reasonable and necessary
to relocate this definition to the corresponding location in
Minnesota Rules, now located in part 1305.0202. The
definition remains unchanged.

Live/work unit. This is a new term in the 2012
IBC which identifies construction requirements for a
building pertaining to live/work units, commonly referred
to as “home occupations” in Minnesota. This term is
being deleted in its entirety from the 2012 IBC because
regulation of live/work units is considered a local zoning
issue in Minnesota, not a code compliance issue. This
deletion is reasonable and necessary to prevent conflicts
between the proposed rule and local zoning regulations in
Minnesota.

Outpatient clinic. This definition is modified to
coordinate with an existing definition that is currently
located in chapter 1300. This definition is being relocated
from chapter 1300 to chapter 1305 because this term is
specific to buildings constructed under the IBC. It is also
necessary to modify this definition to include the phrase
“and ambulatory care facilities” to the definition to
provide a more complete list of uses and to help building
officials determine which of those facilities should be
classified as outpatient clinics with respect to the use or
function of the occupancy.

This amendment is necessary due a definition
change in the 2012 IBC for the term “ambulatory care
facility.” The current definition of “outpatient clinic” is
almost identical to the new “ambulatory care facility”



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

definition. That is, both definitions are based on the care
recipients being rendered incapable of self-preservation.

In the past, the department amended the
outpatient clinic definition so that building and fire
officials would not classify kidney dialysis centers under
the more restrictive Group I-2 occupancy classification,
but instead considered them an “outpatient clinic.” This
was done at the request of the Minnesota Department of
Health to insure that these facilities were not held to the
higher standard of a Group I-2 occupancy including
fire-resistive construction, smoke barriers, and a fire
sprinkler system.

The group I-2 classification could discourage the
construction of kidney dialysis centers in greater
Minnesota because the cost of construction would make
them economically infeasible. The lack of these facilities
in greater Minnesota could create a hardship for
individuals that require kidney dialysis because they
would have to travel greater distances for kidney dialysis
services. By providing the “ambulatory care facility”
definition, kidney dialysis centers can now be classified as
either an ambulatory care facility or an outpatient clinic,
depending upon the level that the dialysis center is located
within a building.

Roof covering. The amended definition for
“roof covering” is being proposed to be relocated here
without change because this definition is currently located
in Minnesota Rules, part 1305.1502, but the 2012 IBC
definition section has been relocated to Chapter 2 of the
International Building Code. Therefore, it is reasonable
and necessary to relocate this definition to the
corresponding location in Minnesota Rules, now located
in part 1305.0202. The definition remains unchanged.

Townhouse. This definition in the IBC is being
deleted because townhouses will not be constructed under
the 2012 IBC in Minnesota (See part 1305.0310 below for
a full explanation of this change and statement of
reasonableness).

Subp. 2. Added definitions. The title to this
subpart is changed to provide the user with definitions
used in this proposed rule chapter that have not been
included in Chapter 2 of the 2012 IBC. Additionally, the
definition for “Townhouse” is deleted and relocated
alphabetically to subpart 1 of this rule section and revised
as described in that section of the SONAR above.

Code. This definition is added to clarify that “the
code” or “this code” as used in this rule chapter means
Minnesota Rules, Chapter 1305.

27

Guest room. This definition is added to
coordinate with the same term that has been added to the
Minnesota State Fire Code, Minnesota Rules, chapter
7511, to prevent conflicts between the same terms utilized
in both chapters 1305 and 7511 of the Minnesota Rules.

Room. This definition is being added here
because the 2012 IBC does not define this term and it is
used frequently in the proposed rule. The definition of
“room” is currently located in Minnesota Rules, part
1305.1002, but is proposed to be relocated here because
the 2012 IBC definition section has been relocated to
Chapter 2 of the 2012 IBC. Therefore, it is reasonable and
necessary to relocate this definition to the corresponding
location in Minnesota Rules, now located in part
1305.0202. The definition remains unchanged.

Small Hose Connection. This definition is being
added because of proposed changes to part 1305.0905,
subp. 6a.The current rule requires Class III wet standpipes
and hose connections in Group R-2 occupancies. This
proposed rule requires the use of “small hose connections”
in Group R-2 occupancies. This new terminology is
necessary for firefighters to differentiate between a small
hose connection and a Class III standpipe hose
connection.

1305.0302 SECTION 302, CLASSIFICATION.

IBC Table 302.2, Care facilities. This is a new
subpart that provides classifications for the various types
of licensed, registered, and unlicensed care facilities for
application and use of the 2012 IBC. Many of the care
facilities identified in this table are licensed by the
Minnesota Department of Health (“MDH”), the
Minnesota Department of Human Services (“DHS”), or
both. Building officials have struggled in the past with
correctly classifying these facilities because the national
model codes are not consistent with MDH or DHS
licensing provisions. Proper occupancy classifications are
based on the number of care recipients permitted by the
classification, the capabilities of those care recipients to
respond  during emergencies (ambulatory  vs.
non-ambulatory), and permitted uses within & dwelling
unit. As licensed care facilities, each may or may not be
subject to additional construction requirements as
determined by the appropriate licensing agency, which
can be overlooked if code officials improperly classify the
use of the building. Without clear guidance, building
officials may place these facilities in a more restrictive
occupancy classification than is intended by statute or rule.
This improper classification can result in inconsistent
code application and increased construction costs. After
receiving numerous complaints about conflicts between
the model code and agencies’ licensing of these facilities,
Department staff met with the appropriate staff of MDH,



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

DHS, and the State Fire Marshal’s Office (“SFM”) in
2008, and developed a publication entitled “Quick
Reference Guide to Care Facilities in Minnesota.” Since
the guide’s classification of these facilities can deviate
from the 2012 IBC, it is therefore reasonable and
necessary to incorporate the occupancy classification
portion of this guide into the proposed rule. The proposed
table also provides building officials with guidance about
which licensed facilities should be treated similar to a
“dwelling unit” for the purposes of fire suppression.

Received during comment period regarding care
facilities:

1305.0302, Table 302.2, Care Facilities. The
commenter requests that under the heading “Chemical
Dependency Treatment Program-residential, <5 residents,
the Department add “dwelling unit” under R-3 because
treatment programs with <5 residents occur in (one
family) dwelling units. The commenter states that this
proposed change is submitted for improved clarity and
consistency.

ER]

The Department created a new table in the
proposed rules that describes building uses required to be
licensed by the State of Minnesota. The table identifies
certain uses contained in dwelling units. A dwelling unit
can be a single family dwelling, an apartment, or
condominium. The commenter identifies one additional
use in the table that can be located in a dwelling unit. The
Department agrees that the table should be modified to
add the phrase “dwelling unit” in the “Chemical
Dependency Treatment Program-residential <5 residents”
category because the commenter is correct in that this
licensed use can be located in a dwelling unit.
Accordingly, the Department agrees to modify the
proposed rule.

1305.0308 SECTION 308, INSTITUTIONAL GROUP
L

Subpart 1. IBC section 308.3, Institutional
Group I-1. This subpart is amended by renumbering the
IBC section references because the corresponding sections
were renumbered in the 2012 IBC. The language in this
subpart is also amended to match the 2012 IBC text,
except that “Boarding care,” “Housing with services,” and
“Supervised living facilities Class A-2” are added to the
list of occupancy use groups. These use groups are added
to the list of Group I-1 occupancies contained in in the
2012 IBC because these use groups are specific to the
MDH and DHS licensing provisions and adding these to
the list contained in the proposed rule will ensure uniform
use of the terms and uniform enforcement of the code by
building officials. Additionally, the occupancy use group
“Residential board and custodial care facilities,”
referenced in the 2012 IBC, is amended by deleting the
term “custodial” because that term is already used in the

28

opening paragraph to describe all I-1 occupancies and it is
redundant to include the term in this location. In addition,
the sentence in the current rule part that reads “The
occupants are capable of responding to an emergency
situation without physical assistance from staff” is deleted
because the state-issued licenses for these uses dictate
when assistance from staff is a requirement of the use.
These modifications are reasonable and necessary to help
eliminate misclassification of these facilities by designers
and code officials.

Finally, the language in the existing subpart that
states “A facility such as the above with five or fewer
persons shall be classified as Group R-3. A facility such
as above housing at least six and not more than 16 persons,
shall be classified as Group R-4” is amended. That
language is amended in the proposed rule by dividing the
language into two separate section numbers, sections
308.3.1 and 308.3.2, respectively. This amendment is
made to coordinate the proposed rule’s format with the
reformatted sections contained in the 2012 IBC.

Received during comment period regarding care
facilities:

1305.0308, subpart 1, section 308.3,
Institutional Group I-1. The commenter requests that in
the list of examples we change the phrase “assisted living
facilities” to “assisted living services” because it is
“services” that are being provided in these occupancies.
Also, the commenter states that the phrase “Housing with
services” should be changed to “Housing with services
establishment” because this more fully describes the
current way these services are provided. Typically,
outside service companies provide “assisted living
services” in buildings originally created as other
occupancies.

The rule contains the phrase “Assisted living
facilities” to provide an example of a use in Institutional
Group I-1 occupancies. Because this section of the rule
part contains a sample list of facilities or uses, the
Department believes that a “service” does not logically fit
into the list of facilities or uses. The Department will
delete the word “facilities” from the phrase “Assisted
living facility” so that the phrase is all encompassing and
will apply to anything associated with assisted living,
including the use or the services provided to the use.
Additionally, the Department agrees with the commenter
that the phrase “Housing with services” should be
changed to “Housing with services establishment”
because the modified phrase better describes the way
these services are provided and is also consistent with
terminology used in proposed Table 302.2. Accordingly,
the Department agrees to modify the proposed rule



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

Subp. 2. IBC section 308.4, Institutional
Group I-2. This subpart is amended by renumbering the
IBC section references because the corresponding sections
were renumbered in the 2012 IBC. The first sentence in
this subpart is further amended by deleting the phrases
“surgical, psychiatric, nursing, or custodial” and “not
capable,” and by inserting the term “incapable,” to also
coordinate with language changes made to the 2012 IBC
text. The list of occupancy uses is amended by adding
“Detoxification facilities” and “Foster care facilities.” The
list is also amended by deleting “Mental” hospitals and
replacing it with “Psychiatric” hospitals. The text “both
intermediate-care facilities and skilled nursing facilities,”
following the phrase “Nursing homes,” has also been
deleted. All of these amendments to the list of examples
of Institutional Group I-2 occupancies in this subpart are
necessary to coordinate with textual changes made to the
list in the 2012 IBC or to correlate with requirements from
the MDH and the DHS because these agencies classify
these uses into different classifications or they use
different terminology. These changes are reasonable as
they will coordinate with the corresponding sections of the
2012 IBC and will help prevent construction conflicts
between building officials and other state agencies’
licensing staff.

Subp. 3. IBC section 308.5, Institutional
Group I-4, day care facilities. This subpart is repealed
because the 2012 IBC now contains the same language.
Therefore, this modification is no longer necessary.

Subp. 4. IBC section 308.6.4, Five or fewer
persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. This subpart
is new and modifies section 308.6.4 of the 2012 IBC by
deleting the phrase “or shall comply with the International
Residential Code” from the end of the section. This
reference to the International Residential Code is deleted
because licensed facilities in Minnesota are classified
according to the IBC, not the IRC. Failure to delete that
language may create confusion and conflicts with the
licensing requirements of other state agencies that may be
involved in regulating these facilities, such as MDH and
the DHS.

1305.0310 SECTION 310, RESIDENTIAL GROUP R.

IBC sections 310.1 to 310.6. The existing rule
part is amended by reformatting the rule part to
correspond with reformatting changes made to section 310
of the 2012 IBC. Additionally, this part is amended to
coordinate with the residential occupancy classifications
contained in the rules of the Minnesota Department of
Health and the Minnesota Department of Human Services.

IBC section 310.1, Residential Group R. The

phrase “Residential occupancies shall include the

29

following:” is deleted to coordinate with reformatting
changes made to section 310 of the 2012 IBC.
Additionally, the language of the existing rule part is
amended by adding a phrase as follows: “This group shall
not include buildings regulated by chapter 1309, the
International Residential Code (IRC). However, the
licensed uses specified in this part, section 310.5, and
section 310.6 are applicable to a building constructed in
accordance with the IRC that houses a use that is required
to be licensed.” This phrase is added because the ICC
produces two model documents for the general regulation
of building construction, the IBC and the IRC. If a
jurisdiction adopts only the IBC, then the provisions for
one-family dwellings, two-family dwellings and
townhouses that are normally in the scope of the IRC must
then be included in the IBC adopted by that jurisdiction.

However, Minnesota adopts both the IRC
(Chapter 1309) and the IBC (Chapter 1305). There needs
to be a clear distinction regarding when the IRC applies
and when the IBC applies to certain buildings. Currently
there is a path to use the IBC for the construction of
one-family dwellings, two-family dwellings and
townhouses. This is done by classifying these buildings as
“R-3” occupancies in the IBC. This path needs to be
closed because only Chapter 1309 contains the required
durability-related provisions for these buildings that are
mandated by Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.118.
While the Minnesota Residential Energy Code
(Chapter1322) contains the bulk of the durability-related
provisions mandated by this statute, certain
durability-related provisions required by this statute for
one-family dwellings, two-family dwellings and
townhouses are located in Chapter 1309. The mandatory
provisions for these building types are not located in
Chapter 1305, which is intended to regulate buildings
other than those regulated by Chapter 1309.

Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.118, requires
the Commissioner to “explore and review the availability
and appropriateness of any model energy codes related to
the construction of single one- and two-family residential
buildings.”  Additionally, this statute requires the
department to adopt an energy code for residential
buildings that includes “research and analysis that
addresses, at a minimum, air quality, building durability,
moisture, enforcement, enforceability cost benefit, and
liability.”

As stated previously, most of the provisions that
comply with Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.118’s
mandate are located in Minnesota rule chapter 1322.
However, some of the mandatory provisions fit better into
the IRC and were recently made part of Chapter 1309. For
example, since the IRC is intended to be used for
construction of one-family and two-family dwellings and



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

townhouses, some of the required durability and moisture
requirements for these structures have been located in the
IRC during its recent adoption, not the IBC. In order to
meet these durability-related requirements, it is essential
that these structures be built according to the IRC, rather
than the IBC. Therefore, the inclusion of the sentence
“This group shall not include buildings regulated by
chapter 1309, the International Residential Code (IRC)” in
section 310.1 is reasonable and needed to clarify that
one-family dwellings, two-family dwellings and
townhouses must be constructed to the IRC, not the IBC.

In addition, the phrase “However, the licensed
uses specified in this part, section 310.5, and section 310.6
are applicable to a building constructed in accordance
with the IRC that houses a use that is required to be
licensed” is added to clarify that one-family dwellings,
two-family dwellings and townhouses built under the IRC
are permitted to have applicable licensed uses in those
buildings. It is reasonable to permit buildings built under
the IRC to house applicable licensed uses because the
licenses were permitted in the same buildings, however
possibly built in accordance with the IBC.

IBC section 310.2, Definitions. This section is
incorporated from the 2012 IBC without modification.
The section lists common definitions used throughout
Section 310 to let the user know that these terms are now
defined in Section 202 of the 2012 IBC.

IBC section 310.3, Residential Group R-1. The
language in this rule part is amended by adding occupancy
uses for R-1 occupancies to the list of examples of
Residential Group R-1 occupancies to coordinate with
changes made to Section 310 of the 2012 IBC. The 2012
IBC changed by adding the words “with more than 10
occupants” to the end of the phrases “Boarding houses
(transient)” and “Congregate living facilities (transient).”
Additionally, the phrase “Bed and breakfast facilities with
six or more guest rooms. A facility with less than six
guest rooms shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy”
is relocated within the proposed rule to place the phrase in
alphabetical order in the 2012 IBC list.

IBC section 310.4, Residential Group R-2. The
language in this rule part is further amended to coordinate
with reformatting and other changes made to Section 310
of the 2012 IBC concerning Residential Group R-2
occupancies. Additionally, the reference to “Live/work
units” contained in section 310.4 of the 2012 IBC is not
being incorporated into this rule part because the
Department is deleting this term entirely from its adoption
of the 2012 IBC. This term must be deleted by the
Department because the regulation of live/work units is
considered a local zoning issue in Minnesota. This
modification is reasonable and necessary as it will prevent

30

conflicts between the proposed rule and local zoning
regulations.  Finally, the phrase “Congregate living
facilities with 16 or fewer occupants are permitted to
comply with construction that complies with the
requirements for Group R-3” is deleted from the existing
rule part because this requirement is now appropriately
located in the Group R-3 section of the 2012 IBC, section
310.5, and is no longer needed.

IBC section 310.5, Residential Group R-3. The
amendments to this rule part are necessary to coordinate
with changes made to Section 310 of the 2012 IBC
concerning Residential Group R-3 occupancies and to add
certain uses to the list of examples of Residential Group
R-3 occupancies contained in the proposed rule.

The phrase “Buildings that do not contain more
than two dwelling units” is deleted because buildings that
meet this description will be built to the requirements of
Chapter 1309 (See Section 310.1, above). In addition,
“Dwelling units in mixed occupancy buildings” is added
to accommodate situations where a dwelling unit is
attached to a building that is only regulated by the IBC and
is termed a “mixed occupancy.” This is needed because
mixed occupancies are not addressed in the IRC. It is
reasonable to accommodate situations where a dwelling
unit is attached to an occupancy other than a residential
IBC occupancy.

A sentence is also added to the end of this part to
require that new R-3 occupancies shall meet the durability
provisions of Chapter 1309 to affect the intention of
Minnesota Statutes Section 326B.118, which requires
single one- and two-family residential buildings to meet
energy and durability requirements. “Dwelling units in
mixed occupancy buildings” are the same as one- family
dwellings, therefore it is reasonable to require those
dwelling units to meet the energy and durability
requirements of Chapter 1309. The modifications to the
list are reasonable and necessary to prevent confusion and
conflict between this code and the regulations of other
state agencies, such as the Minnesota Department of
Health and the Minnesota Department of Human Services.

Received during comment period regarding care
facilities:

1305.0310, subsection 310.5, Residential
Group R-3. The commenter requests that in the list of
examples of these occupancies, the Department change
the phrase “assisted living facilities” to “assisted living
services” because it is services that are provided in these
occupancies. Also the commenter states that the phrase
“Housing with services” should be changed to “Housing
with services establishment” because this more fully
describes the current way these services are provided.
Typically, outside services companies provide “assisted



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

i ) 0 buildi ..
living services” in buildings originally created as other
occupancies.

The rule contains the phrase “Assisted living
facilities” to provide an example of a use in Residential
Group R-3 occupancies. Because this section of the rule
part contains a sample list of facilities or uses, the
Department believes that a “service” does not logically fit
into the list of facilities or uses. The Department will
delete the word “facilities” from the phrase “Assisted
living facility” so that the phrase is all encompassing and
will apply to anything associated with assisted living,
including the use or the services provided to the use.
Additionally, the Department agrees with the commenter
that the phrase “Housing with services” should be
changed to “Housing with services establishment”
because the modified phrase better describes the way
these services are provided and is also consistent with
terminology used in proposed Table 302.2. Accordingly,
the Department agrees to modify the proposed rule.

IBC section 310.5.1, Care facilities within a
dwelling. This section of the 2012 IBC is being modified
by deleting it in its entirety. This modification is
necessary because all care facilities in Minnesota are

regulated only by Minnesota Rules Chapter 1305, the IBC.

This section of the IBC, as published, refers the user to the
International Residential Code. This existing reference
will therefore send the user to a code that has no
applicability to care facilities in Minnesota. Therefore, it
must be deleted to avoid potential confusion.

IBC section 310.6, Residential, Group R-4.
This section of the 2012 IBC is modified by expanding the

list of uses classified as residential Group R-4 occupancies.
This list includes facilities licensed by other state agencies.

Examples of these facilities include boarding care
facilities, housing with services, and residential hospice
facilities with 12 or fewer occupants. This modification is
reasonable and necessary to prevent confusion or conflict
between this code and the regulations of other state
agencies such as the Minnesota Department of Health and
the Minnesota Department of Human Services.

Received during comment period regarding care
facilities:

1305.0310, subsection 310.6, Residential
Group R-4. The commenter requests that in the list of
examples of these occupancies, the Department add
“Assisted Living Services” to the list of examples of these
types of occupancies because this type of service. This
phrase needs to be added to the Group R-4 occupancy list
because “services” are also provided in this occupancy
classification.

31

Also, the commenter proposes to change the
phrase “Housing with services (including those that
provide assisted living services)” to “Housing with
services establishment,” because this this more phrase
more fully describes the current way these services are
provided. Typically, outside service companies provide
“assisted living services” in buildings originally created as
other occupancies.

The rule contains the phrase “Assisted living
facilities” to provide an example of a use in Residential
Group R-4 occupancies. Because this section of the rule
part contains a sample list of facilities or uses, the
Department believes that a “service” does not logically fit
into the list of facilities or uses. The Department will
delete the word “facilities” from the phrase “Assisted
living facility” so that the phrase is all encompassing and
will apply to anything associated with assisted living,
including the use or the services provided to the use.
Additionally, the Department agrees with the commenter
that the phrase “Housing with services” should be
changed to “Housing with services establishment”
because the modified phrase better describes the way
these services are provided and is also consistent with
terminology used in proposed Table 302.2. Accordingly,
the Department agrees to modify the proposed rule.

1305.0402 SECTION 402, COVERED MALL AND
OPEN MALL BUILDINGS.

This existing rule part heading is amended by
adding the phrase “and open mall” to the title to
coordinate with changes made to the Section heading in
the 2012 IBC.

Subpart 1. IBC section 402.4.2.2.2, Property
lines. This subpart is amended by renumbering the
section reference number and the section references in the
body of the subpart to coordinate with renumbering
changes made to the 2012 IBC.

Subp. 3. IBC section 402.7.2, Smoke control.
This new subpart modifies section 402.7.2 of the 2012
IBC by adding a paragraph after the exception regarding
covered mall buildings exceeding 50,000 square feet. The
requirements for smoke control in covered mall buildings
are currently located in Minnesota Rules, part 1305.0404,
Section 404, Atriums. The Department has determined
that the requirements for smoke control in covered mall
buildings would be more appropriately located in Section
402 of the 2012 IBC, which addresses covered mall
buildings. Therefore, the Department has determined that
the existing requirements of Minnesota Rules, part
1305.0404, be repealed and relocated to Minnesota Rules,
part 1305.0402, which addresses covered mall buildings.



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

The Department further determined that proposed
rule part 1305.0402, subpart 3, be added to exempt
covered mall buildings 50,000 square feet or less in floor
area, excluding the anchor buildings, from the
requirement for a “post fire exhaust system.” The existing
rule language of part 1305.0404 requires all covered mall
buildings to be equipped with a post fire smoke exhaust
system, regardless of size. The proposed language in this
new subpart does not require a post fire smoke exhaust
system in covered mall buildings that are 50,000 square
feet or less in floor area, excluding anchor buildings, if
they are provided with an approved smoke control system
that complies with Section 909 of the IBC. This exception
is reasonable because smaller malls that experience a fire
incident can adequately clear the smoke by opening the
structure’s exterior doors. Post fire smoke exhaust
systems are intended to allow the removal of smoke from
a structure after a fire incident. In larger malls, it is not
practical, nor efficient, to open exterior doors to remove
smoke after a fire incident. Without a post fire smoke
exhaust system, even a small fire incident may render a
larger mall unable to resume operation in a timely matter.
Exempting covered malls 50,000 square feet and smaller
from the requirement for a post fire smoke exhaust system,
if they are equipped with an approved smoke control
system, is therefore reasonable as it will reduce costs for
the building owner without any additional risk to the
structure.

1305.0403 SECTION 403, HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS.

Subpart 1. IBC section 403.3.2, Shaft
enclosures. This subpart is amended by renumbering
section reference numbers to coordinate with renumbering
changes made to the 2012 IBC.

Subp. 2. IBC section 403.15, Post fire smoke
exhaust system. This subpart is being repealed because
the 2012 IBC now contains requirements for post fire
smoke exhaust systems in high-rise buildings. Therefore,
this modification is no longer necessary.

Subp. 3. IBC section 403.4.8.2, Standby power
loads. This subpart modifies section 403.4.8.2 of the
2012 IBC by revising the third classification item listed by
deleting the word “elevators” and replacing it with
language pertaining to passenger elevators serving
occupied floors more than 75 feet above the lowest level
of fire department access. Standby power is an alternate
source of power that is used in the event of an interruption
of the primary power source. This modification is
necessary because freight elevators were not intended to
comply with this requirement. Freight elevators are not
used for the movement of people and are not allowed to be
used in an emergency situation. Without this modification,
the IBC’s classification of standby power loads may be

32

misapplied to freight elevators, which could increase costs
to the building owner because installation of standby
power would be required for elevators banks within a
high-rise building, including freight elevators. This
modification is reasonable as it provides clarity, ensures
uniform enforcement, and reduces costs for building
owners.

1305.0404 SECTION 404, ATRIUMS.

IBC section 404.5, Smoke control. This rule
part is repealed because the requirements for smoke
control in atriums are being relocated to Minnesota Rules,
part 1305.0402, subpart 3. As a result, the amendment is
no longer necessary.

1305.0406 SECTION 406, MOTOR
VEHICLE-RELATED OCCUPANCIES.

Subpart 1. IBC section 406.4.5, Floor surface.
IBC section 406.4.5 is modified by adding a new
exception that exempts unoccupied portions of nonpublic
parking garages from having to be made of concrete or
similar noncombustible or nonabsorbent material. This
exception is intended to reduce costs of vehicular storage
buildings that are being constructed for security or general
weather protection of vehicles. The exception is intended
to apply to buildings like pole sheds or garages where an
earth or gravel floor is adequate for the protection and
preservation of the equipment.

Subp. 2. IBC section 406.5.7, Means of egress.
This section of the 2012 IBC has been renumbered from
406.3.8 to 406.5.7 so the section reference number must
be renumbered to coordinate with this change.
Additionally, a new amendment is being added to section
406.4.5 of the 2012 IBC causing this language to be
numerically formatted as subpart 2 to accommodate the
new amendment, which will become subpart 1. The
content of the amendment is unchanged.

1305.0407 SECTION 407, GROUP I-2.

IBC section 407.2.1, Spaces open to the
corridor. This rule part is amended by revising the title of
the rule part from “Spaces of unlimited area” to “Spaces
open to the corridor.” Section 407.2.1 in the 2012 IBC is
entitled “407.2.1, Waiting and similar areas.” Both the
title in the existing rule part and the title in the 2012 IBC
section are misleading regarding the actual content of the
code requirement, which addresses spaces that are
permitted to be open to corridors for Group I-2
occupancies. As a result, the title is changed to more
reasonably correlate it with the actual content and intent of
the rule part. This rule part is further modified by deleting
the phrase “In an I-2 occupancy” because section 407 only



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

addresses requirements pertaining to Group [-2
occupancies. Therefore, the phrase is redundant and not
necessary. Condition numberl in Section 407.2.1 is
modified to coordinate with changes made to the 2012
IBC. These modifications are reasonable to provide clarity
and help ensure uniform enforcement of the 2012 IBC.

1305.0408 SECTION 408, GROUP I-3.

Subpart 1. IBC section 408.6, Smoke barrier
[Repeal]. This subpart is being repealed because the same
requirements are also contained in the Minnesota
Department of Correction’s rules for construction of
sleeping cell areas. Section 408.6 of the 2012 IBC now
requires a fire-resistive smoke barrier wall for the
compartmentalization of any correctional facility,
regardless of the size or number of sleeping cells. Unlike
previous editions, the 2012 IBC language now coordinates
with the Department of Correction’s rule requirements, so
this modification is no longer necessary and is being
repealed.

Subp. 2. IBC section 408.7, Security glazing.
This subpart is amended by renumbering the IBC section
references because the section was renumbered in the
2012 IBC. The amended language for sections 408.9.1
and 408.9.2 of the 2012 IBC are also being incorporated
into this newly amended language for Group I-3
occupancies and the existing language is deleted. The
language in section 408.7 is modified by adding the phrase
“2-hour fire barriers constructed in accordance with
section 707 used for horizontal exits.” This modification
is needed to maintain visual supervision in detention
facilities when a 2-hour fire barrier is used as a horizontal
exit. Additionally, an exception is added to condition
number 2 that reads, “Exception: Fire partitions or smoke
barriers with “-inch (6.4 mm) wire glass in a security
assembly.” Security laminated glazing is used instead of
traditional glazing in detention facilities because the
traditional glazing can be broken and used a weapon. A
new condition number 5 is also added to the list of
conditions that reads, “5. Security glazing in fire
partitions, 1-hour fire barriers enclosing fire command
centers, and smoke barriers, shall not be limited to 25
percent of the area of the common wall with any room.”

The first modification described above is carried
forward from existing language in sections 408.9 and
408.9.2. The exception in condition number 2 is added to
allow sandwiching of rated "4 wire-glass in the assembly
instead of providing sprinkler wash of the glass. This
exception addresses those instances where it is
undesirable to place a sprinkler head in a position where
an inmate may be able to access it, damage it, and then use
it as a weapon. Additionally, visual observation of
detainees is needed in addition to providing glazing

33

material that cannot be readily broken and the pieces used
as weapons. The historical problem with the national
model codes is that where rated doors and windows were
required, the code did not have an exception to permit the
use of security laminated glazing. Beginning with the
1998 Minnesota State Building Code, Minnesota has
included provisions that permit the use of security
laminated glazing in fire-rated door and wall assemblies.
The 2012 IBC now contains requirements for laminated
security glazing; however, they do not address all the
instances where the use of security laminated glazing is
necessary.

The new condition number 5 is added to remove
the limitation on size of security glazing in fire partitions,
fire barriers enclosing fire command centers, and smoke
barriers. These partition types are limited to a maximum
of 25% of the common wall, in accordance with IBC
section 716.6.7.2. It is reasonable to remove the 25 % area
coverage size limitation on security glazing in detention
facilities because visual observation of detainees is critical
in a detention facility. Moreover, the proposed changes to
this section are not more restrictive or more costly as
compared to existing rule requirements.

IBC sections 408.9.1, Corridors and 408.9.2,
Other. The existing rule amendments to IBC sections
408.9.1 and 408.9.2 are being deleted because the 2012
IBC, as amended, now addresses laminated security
glazing installations in detention facility corridors.
Therefore, the amendments are no longer necessary.

Subp. 3. IBC section 408.9, Windowless
buildings. This is a new subpart that adds a modification
to IBC section 408.9, Windowless buildings. The first
sentence has been revised for clarity and the term
“skylights” is added to the sentence. This section is also
modified by adding the phrase “or exterior doors provided
in all resident areas of the exit access with an occupant
load greater than 50” to the end of the sentence. This
modification is intended to clarify that the exit access for
resident areas having more than 50 occupants shall have
an exterior door, or an operable window or skylight, or a
breakable window or skylight. This modification is
necessary because the language in IBC section 408.9 does
not provide specific parameters addressing when an
opening or an engineered smoke control system is
required. The modifications are reasonable because they
establish clear parameters as to what constitutes a
windowless building under this code.

1305.0413
STORAGE.

SECTION 413, COMBUSTIBLE

IBC section 413.3, Fire protection of floors.
This new rule part adds new subsection 413.3 to Section



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

413 of the 2012 IBC. This new subsection directs the user
to section 420.6 of the 2012 IBC for floor protection
requirements, in addition those discussed in Section 413.
It is necessary that this amendment reference another
proposed amendment located in Minnesota Rules, part
1305.0420, so that building designers do not miss the
additional requirements when applying the combustible
storage provisions of section 413. It is reasonable to add a
provision to make the code easier and clearer for building
designers to use.

1305.0419 SECTION 419, LIVE/WORK UNITS.

This is a new rule part that deletes section 419 of
the 2012 IBC that pertains to live/work units, commonly
referred to as “home occupations” in Minnesota. Deleting
this requirement is needed and reasonable because
regulation of live/work units in Minnesota is addressed by
local zoning laws that could conflict with these
requirements.

1305.0420 SECTION 420, GROUPS I-1, R-1, R-2, R-3.

Subpart 1. IBC section 420.1, General. This
new subpart is added to modify Section 420 of the 2012
IBC. Section 420.1 of the IBC is modified by changing
the section reference “420.1 through 420.5” to “420.1
through 420.6.” This change is necessary because subpart
2 of this proposed new rule part adds new subsection
420.6, Fire protection of floors, to Section 420 to address
floor assemblies that are not fire-resistance rated
construction.

Subp. 2. IBC section 420.6, Fire protection of
floors. This new subpart is added to incorporate
fire-resistance protection for residential-type occupancies
into the 2012 IBC. The proposed language is identical to
the adopted language in Chapter 1309, the 2012
International Residential Code (“IRC”). ° Proposed
section 420.6 is entitled “Fire protection of floors.” As in
the IRC adoption, the language in this proposed subpart is
added to address floor assemblies that are not
fire-resistance rated construction. The requirements of
this section reasonably provide additional safety to the
occupants, first responders, and fire fighters by protecting
the floor assembly during a fire event when entering and
exiting the structure. This subpart is necessary to provide
consistency between the International Building Code and
the International Residential Code for construction
projects of similar construction.

> Minnesota Rules, Chapter 1309, was filed with the
Secretary of State’s Office and formally adopted on April
23, 2014. The Notice of Adoption was published in the
State Register on July 28, 2014. The effective date for
Chapter 1309 is January 24, 2015.

34

1305.0421 SECTION
OCCUPANCIES.

421, GROUP E

This existing rule part is repealed because Section
421 of the 2012 IBC was renumbered to Section 306. Asa
result, the existing rule language is being relocated to
Minnesota Rules, part 1305.0425.

1305.0425 SECTION
OCCUPANCIES.

425, GROUP E

This rule part contains language that is relocated
from existing Minnesota Rules, part 1305.0421, because
the section pertaining to this subject was renumbered in
the 2012 IBC. The language includes some minor
grammatical edits to provide clarity, but the requirements
in this part remain unchanged.

1305.0507 SECTION 507, UNLIMITED AREA
BUILDINGS.

Subpart 2. IBC section 507.3, Sprinkled,
one-story. This subpart is amended by adding the phrase
“above grade plane” following the phrase “one-story” in
two places in the subpart. This modification is reasonable
and necessary to coordinate the subpart with changes
made to Section 507 in the 2012 IBC.

Subp. 3. IBC section 507.4, Two-story. This
subpart is amended by adding the phrase “above grade
plane” following the phrase “one-story” in the subpart.
This modification is reasonable and necessary to
coordinate with changes made to Section 507 in the 2012
IBC.

1305.0508 SECTION 508, MIXED USE AND
OCCUPANCY

IBC section 508.3.3.4. This rule part is amended
by deleting the current language pertaining to the
exception for an occupancy separation between a child or
adult daycare and a Group A-3 church building. This
language is deleted because this section has been
renumbered in the 2012 IBC. Additionally, this exception
is no longer needed because section 308.6.2 of the 2012
IBC now applies to these occupancies and addresses such
care being provided in places of worship. The existing
rule amendment was included with the 2000 IBC code
adoption to address problematic code applications that
were occurring with these two occupancies. Since that
time, however, a requirement for “Accessory Uses” has
also been included in section 508.2 of the 2012 IBC which
can now be used in these situations to eliminate
problematic issues such as the requirement for fire
resistive separation between mixed uses and occupancies.



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

IBC section 508.1. Additionally, the rule part is
amended by adding language that deletes exception
number 3 from section 508.1 of the 2012 IBC. Exception
#3 states, “Uses within live/work units, complying with
Section 419, are not considered separate occupancies.”
This exception must be deleted to maintain consistency
with other modifications made throughout the 2012 IBC
adoption process pertaining to requirements for
“live/work units.” References to “live/work units” are
being deleted throughout the code because these uses are
regulated by local zoning laws in Minnesota, not the State
Building Code. This modification is reasonable and
needed to prevent conflict between the code and local
zoning laws and to maintain consistency with other
amended sections of the 2012 IBC.

1305.0603 SECTION 603, COMBUSTIBLE
MATERIALS IN TYPE I AND II CONSTRUCTION.

IBC section 603.1, Allowable materials. This
new rule part modifies section 603.1 of the 2012 IBC by
adding an exception number 26 to the list of other
exceptions regarding permitted combustible materials that
can be used in buildings of Type I or Type II construction.
Type 1 or Type Il construction materials are generally
restricted to materials that are non-combustible, such as
steel or concrete. The new exception identifies that wood
may be used for roof construction to support equipment,
building and roof joint systems, skylight or mechanical
equipment, curb, cants, blocking and backing, and parapet
or roof edge construction. This modification is reasonable
because permitting wood in the limited applications in this
type of construction is standard practice in the industry in
the locations described in this exception. Also, the limited
amount of wood in this exception is needed to properly
secure roofing materials at the intersection of the roof
covering and parapets. This modification will provide
consistent and uniform code administration relating to
roof and related roofing construction practices in Type I or
II building construction.

1305.0714 SECTION 714, PENETRATIONS.

IBC section 714.4.1.2, Membrane penetrations.

This new rule part modifies exception number 7 of section
714.4.1.2 of the 2012 IBC by deleting “fire-resistance
rated” from the first sentence pertaining to the required
installation of a fire-resistance rated wall assembly when
or if the top plate of a wall interrupts or penetrates the
bottom side of the ceiling membrane, which is typically
gypsum board, of a horizontal ceiling assembly. This
modification is necessary because walls are typically
framed with double top plates that are tight to the
underside of the horizontal floor-ceiling framing members
above. The finished ceiling system is then applied to the
underside of the horizontal ceiling framing members up to

35

and around the top plates of the wall. Top plates of walls
are typically installed in this manner, which is considered
to be a standard construction method in Minnesota. When
installed in this manner and when the double top plates are
properly sealed (fire caulked) at all penetrations, there is
no need to use or install a fire rated wall assembly below
1t.

This section is further amended by deleting the
last sentence from exception number 7 that states, “The
fire resistance rating of the wall shall not be less than the
rating of the horizontal assembly.” This modification is
necessary because without it, designers would be required
to provide a fire-resistance rated wall at every location in
the building that interrupts the horizontal -ceiling
membrane above. It would also add substantial cost to a
building and deviate from conventional construction
practices in Minnesota that are considered to achieve the
same fire protection at less cost. Both modifications
discussed above for section 714.4.1.2 are reasonable and
needed to provide clarity, ensure uniform design and
enforcement, and reduce construction costs for building
owners.

1305.0716 SECTION 716, DUCTS
TRANSFER OPENINGS [Repeal].

AND AIR

This rule part is being repealed because Section
716 was renumbered to Section 717 in the 2012 IBC. Asa
result, the amendment is no longer applicable and needs to
be repealed to correlate with changes made to the 2012
IBC.

1305.0717 SECTION 717, DUCTS
TRANSFER OPENINGS.

AND AIR

Subpart 1. IBC section 717.5.3, Shaft
enclosures. The language in this new subpart was
previously located in Minnesota Rules, part 1305.0716,
Ducts and Air Transfer Openings. The amendment
modified section 716.5.3 by adding an exception number
5 pertaining to shaft enclosures. The language remains
unchanged from that in the existing amendment, but the
section reference numbers and the exception number are
changed to correlate with new section and exception
numbers found in the 2012 IBC.

Received during comment period regarding shaft
enclosures IBC Section 717.5.3:

Proposed Minnesota Rules, Part 1305.0717,
Subpart 1. The commenter requests that proposed
Minnesota Rule, part 1305.0717, subpart 1, which amends
IBC section 717.5.3 by adding exception 6 concerning
laboratory ventilation systems installed in accordance
with NFPA 45, be modified to specify the applicable
chapters of NFPA 45 which necessarily apply to these



Chapter 1305, Minnesota Building Code

systems in order for them to meet the exception (NFPA 45
Chapters 1-4, 7 and 8). As correctly noted by the
commenter, the proposed rule as written does not specify
which chapters of NFPA 45 are necessary to comply with
in the design and installation of the system in order for it to
meet the exception; instead, as written the proposed
language may be interpreted as requiring that all chapters
of NFPA 45 be complied with in order to meet the
exception, whether those chapters are relevant or not. The
commenter further notes that requiring compliance with
NFPA 45 in its entirety could result in several unintended
consequences and conflicts with other portions of the IBC
and the International Fire Code. Therefore, the
commenter proposes that the proposed rule be further
modified to clearly identify which chapters of NFPA 45
the design and installation of the laboratory ventilation
system must comply with in order to meet the exception.

The Department agrees that the commenter’s
suggested change is necessary and reasonable. The
Department does not wish to include chapters of the
NFPA 45 standard that are not appropriate, that will cause
conflict with other portions of the IBC, or that may render
the code difficult or impossible to comply with. Moreover,
this modification will assist in clarifying the intent of the
requirement without changing the requirement itself.
Accordingly, the Department agrees to modify the
proposed rule.

Subp. 2. IBC section 717.6.1, Through
penetrations. This is a new subpart that modifies section
717.6.1 of the 2012 IBC. The modification renumbers the
existing exception and its list of requirements as exception
number 1, subitems a through e. The modification also
amends the first subitem of the existing exception by
permitting another option to protect the duct and adds a
new exception number 2 that addresses duct openings
connecting adjacent floors in Group I occupancies. The
rest of the content remains unchanged from the 2012 IBC.

The modification to the first subitem of the
existing exception is made to allow the use of a listed
through penetration firestop system that has an F and T
rating as an option to the non-listed 26-gage duct assembly
enclosed within a wall. Items that penetrate fire-resistive
assemblies (walls, floors, roofs) are traditionally required
to be tested to ensure that the penetrating item (conduit,
pipe, duct, and plumbing) does not negatively affect the
fire-resistive assembly that is being penetrated. The
testing agency assigns an F and T rating to the penetrating
item. An F rating designates the time frame used to
determine the acceptance (1, 2 or 3 hour fire-resistivity)
and the T rating determines whether the temperature of the
penetrating item gets so hot that it is likely to ignite
something combustible that it may be in contact with on
the non-fire side of the assembly. Rather than requiring an

36

F and T rating, the exception includes a prescriptive
requirement on how to protect the ductwork where it
penetrates the floor and deals with the temperature
concerns by requiring that the duct be within the cavity of
a wall so that no combustibles can come in contact with it.

This modification is reasonable because fire and
life safety precautions are increased when installing a
listed and tested through penetration firestop system
having a T rating which ensures that the penetrating item’s
temperature on the non-fire side does not increase to a
point that it would ignite combustibles. This practice is
proven and already used in wood framed multi-family
construction as an alternative to strict application of the
code and is now considered a standard construction
practice in Minnesota.  This modification is also
reasonable because it reduces the cost for duct installation
conditions at walls that intersect with floor-ceilings by
allowing walls to terminate at the ceiling line of the
floor-ceiling or roof-ceiling assemblies.

Finally, exception number 2 is added to address
duct openings connecting adjacent floors in Group I
occupancies. The exception addresses the many instances
where a hospital, nursing home, or detention facility is
only two stories in height. Without the modification, a