Plumbing Board
Meeting Minutes

October 21, 2014 at 9:30 a.m.
Minnesota Room — Department of Labor and Industry
443 Lafayette Road North, St. Paul, MN 55155

Members

John Parizek (Chair)
Scott Eggen

Jim Kittelson

Larry Justin

John Flagg

Pete Moulton

Ron Thompson

Joe Beckel

Phillip Sterner (Secretary)
Jim Lungstrom

Members Absent
Gale Mount
Grant Edwards
Mike McGowan
Jeff Brown

Call to Order
The meeting was called to order by Chair Parizek at 9:37 a.m. Introductions and housekeeping
announcements were made. Attendance was taken; a quorum was met with 9 of 13 members
present.

Approval of Meeting agenda

A motion was made by Justin, seconded by Moulton, to approve the agenda with an addition
to VI. Special Business, Item C) Procedures for Variance. The vote was unanimous; the
motion carried.

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes
October 21, 2014

DLI Staff & Visitors

Wendy Legge (Chief Gen. Counsel, DLI)
Suzanne Todnem (DLI)

Cathy Tran (DLI)

Jim Peterson (DLI)

Lyndy Lutz (DLI)

Brad Jensen (DLI)

Gary Thaden (MMCA)

Matt Marciniak (IAPMO)

Richard Hauffe (ICC)

Gary Ford (Metro Testing)

Brian Noma (MDH)

Tim Power (MNLA)

Luke Westman (PHCC)

Jessica Bartram (PHCC)

Mark Johnson (PHCC)

Carl Crimmins (PHCC)

Craig Johnson (ASPE)

John Schroeder (Schroeder Sales Co.)
Tom McCarthy (Local 34)

Scott Thompson (MN Plumbing Training)
Phil Raines (ABC)

Dwight Engen (MN LECET)

Bob Taylor (Osland Piping)

Brian Soderholm (Soderholm/WCC)

Page |1



Approval of Previous Meeting Minutes

A. Plumbing Board Minutes — July 15, 2014
A motion was made by Sterner, seconded by Justin, to approve the Minutes as
presented. The vote was unanimous; the motion carried.

V. Regular Business
Approval of Expense Reports — Parizek approved the expenses as presented.
V. Committee Reports
A) Department Updates
The Board’s new member, Jeff Brown, was appointed to Chad Filek’s vacated seat
(Commercial / Industrial Plumbing Journeyman from outside the Twin Cities). He is from
Duluth and due to the late notice won’t be joining us today.
i. Current rulemaking for department — Todnem provided an update.
The first wave of updated rules for the Construction Codes and Licensing Division
will have an effective date of Jan. 24, 2015. This includes chapters:
Administrative, Accessibility, Elevator, Residential, Residential Energy, and the
Conservation Code for Existing Buildings. The second wave of rules will be
effective February 14, 2015 which includes Mechanical and Fuel Gas. Legge
noted that the Notice of Intent to Adopt Chapter 1305 has not been published
and there has not been an amendment to the Fire Code.
B) Executive Committee
Met this morning and reviewed today’s agenda items.
C) Construction Codes Advisory Council
Nothing to report
VI. Special Business
A) Review of modifications to Revisor’s draft of proposed Minnesota Rules chapter 4714
(See Attachment A) Minor additions / clarifications need to be approved by a 2/3
majority (9 of 13 members).
The Board reviewed all suggested changes and approved edits will be reflected on the
next Rule Draft copy.
Suggested changes / clarifications to the rule:
Line 1.8, change to “2003”
Line 4.12, change statute chapter to “326B”
Page 6, amendment noted to move definition of “Approved” to subpart 2
6.16 and 6.17, suggested adding the word and definition to barometric loop. Definition
on page 21 moves to page 6; then a rule part 4714.0204 would need to be added to
include this term.
Page 10, changes noted
Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |2

October 21, 2014



Page 14, typographical error, include title

Page 17, line 17.7, UPC sections 506.0 to 506.9, including all figures, are deleted in their
entirety.

Page 19, language clarified

Page 21, line 21.9, “or” was removed and replaced with “and not.” Line 21.22 —add the
language “a minimum of” to read “inverted “u” located upstream and rising a minimum
of 35 feet above the highest fixture it supplies.” The entire section would be included in
definitions.

Page 24, footnote was added in error and is therefore removed.

Page 25, will ask the Revisor to indent items 25.12 to 25.20

Page 27, line 27.4, 27.15, 27.18, and 27.20 hand-written edits intended for clarification
purposes

Page 31, clarification to lines 31.24 and 31.25

Page 32 & 33, Line 32.26 to 33.4: “as an alternate to a sewage pump system only in
one- or two-family dwellings when gravity flow is not possible. Not more than one
bathroom group is permitted to discharge into a macerating toilet system. One
bathroom group consists of: a toilet; a lavatory; and a shower or bathtub. Components
of macerating toilet systems shall be accessible.”

Page 34, addition of Subp. 4 Section 713.8. A new section 718.8 is added to read as
follows: 713.8 Single-family and two-family dwellings. Remove “Exception:” line
34.20 and shift over so that section is format as other subparts above. This item was
discussed but not approved by the Board (see item 2 below).

Page 35, line 35.27 — should read “11,200/325P — either remove the space and add a
comma or just remove the space in 11 200. The Board decided to leave the space as is
so that it reads 11 200. “352” was transposed and was amended to read “325”

Page 36, line 36.13 to read “Section 720.” Line 36.22, add “as amended” after 712

Page 38, line 38.22 — recommended changing to an “Exception”

Page 39, deletion of the word “including” on line 39.2 and the word “square” on line

39.12.

39.2, add a comma after the word “drains,”

Page 43, lines 43.1 and 43.2 — change the wording and move to line 42.23 in between
the words “jurisdiction” and “In.” Language was amended as follows: In no case shall
water from roofs or any building roof drainage flow onto the public sidewalk.

Page 45 - line 45.19 to 45.23 revised to read as follows: “1109.1 Testing Required.
New bBuilding storm drainage systems that are new and parts of existing systems that
have been altered, extended, or repaired shall be tested in accordance with section
712 to disclose leaks and defects, except as provided in section 1109.2. Any section of
the building storm sewer that passes through contaminated soils or contaminated
water must be air tested in accordance with section 742:712.3.” Todnem noted that
“contamination” is defined in the UPC. The proposed change to delete “air” and
“712.3” and add “712” was discussed but not approved by the Board (see item 1 and
motion below).

The meeting broke for a 15 minute recess.

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |3
October 21, 2014



Discussion returned to Page 45, section 1109.1, specifically language regarding the last
sentence regarding contaminated soils or contaminated water. Todnem discussed
concerns with 1109.2 Exceptions, Items 1 and 2, and Chair Parizek said that line 45.21
beginning with the word “Any” through 45.23 could be stricken in its entirety and the
Board would need to revisit this section. The Board did not approve this change (see
below).

Page 47, 1110.2.9 Transition locations. Line 47.20, ASME Standard 45 — what year is
this referring to? When the rulemaking process began 2013 was not released.
Specifically there is a requirement for 3 feet per second at the discharge that is no
longer in the current (2013) standard. Should Line 47.21 to 47.23 be re-worded if a
year is referenced? It was discussed that if the Standard were referenced then the year
should be added. The Board discussed adopting the Standard without adding a year.
Legge noted that there are inconsistencies with other standards, specifically on page
48, 4714.1401 Referenced Standards, where some Standards refer to a year and others
do not. She asked if a year should be referenced for ASPE Standard 45 and/or IAPMO
IGC 155. Tran said that at the time there was not a date available for 155. Line 47.21,
ASPE Standard 45, should a year be referenced? Leaving without a date makes it
ambiguous and it isn’t clear which Standard is being enforced, is it 2013 or 2011? The
Board’s decision on whether to add dates to ASPE Standard 45 and/or IAPMO IGC 155
(155- 2008?) and whether to re-word the language on page 47, lines 47.21 to 47.23,
were tabled until after lunch.

Page 48, Added to the list of Referenced Standards in part 4714.1401, handwritten note
reads “IGC”

Page 50, line 10, add “as amended”

Page 51, line 10, add “collect rainwater” and strike are-rtended

Page 51, line 51.27, Revise to read as follows: “Minimum 5 micron or smaller absolute
filter”

Page 52, line 52.2 and 52.13 suggested revisions were approved

Page 58, 58.12 add the word “catchment” and on line 58.24 add the word “piping.
Page 59, Add “rainwater catchment to lines 59.8 and 59.12. Line 59.10, add a sentence
after the word “code.” to read: “Abandoned systems must comply with Chapter 11,
Storm Drainage, as amended.”

A motion to set items aside Section 713.7 (page 34), Section 1110.2.9
Transition locations (page 47, lines 47.21 to 47.23), date references to
ASPE Standard 45 (line 48.24) and IAPMO IGC 155, and Section 1109.1
(page 45, lines 45.19 to 45.23), was made by Justin, seconded by Eggen.
The vote was unanimous; the motion carried and items noted above were
tabled until after lunch.

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |4
October 21, 2014



A motion was made by Justin, seconded by Sterner, to accept the
remainder of items and edits, except items set aside in above motion.
The vote was unanimous; the motion carried.

The meeting broke from noon to 1:00 p.m. for lunch.
Items tabled for the afternoon were addressed as follows:

Item 1:Section 1109.1 Testing Required.
Page 45 — Any section of the building storm sewer than passes through contaminated
soils or contaminated water must be airtested in accordance with section 712.712.3.~

A motion was made by Sterner, seconded by Eggen, to approve the
language as shown in Item 1 above. The vote was 7 for with 2 against
(Beckel and Moulton). The motion did not pass and language reverted
back to how it was printed.

Item 2: Page 34, remove as an exception for Section 713.7 Installation, Line 34.20, and
include as a new sub-part titled Section 713.8.

Subp. 4. Section 713.8. A new section 713.8 is added to read as follows: 713.8 Single-
family and two-family dwellings. Exception: Single-family and two-family dwellings and
buildings or structures accessory thereto, when connected to an approved private
sewage disposal system prior to the time of connecting the premises to the public sewer
need not connect to the public sewer when there is insufficient grade or slope to permit
drainage to the public sewer by gravity and the following conditions are met:

Line 35.2: (3) written permission has been obtained from the Authority Having
Jurisdiction.

There were no concerns to move as an exception to a new section.

Chair Parizek announced that a Board member had to depart therefore no changes can
be accepted to any sections unless brought back for a special board meeting. Sections
must remain as is.

All present Board members agreed to move forward with the rule draft as is and not
accept additional items that were previously tabled.

Wendy reminded members that completed Variance requests need to be addressed
within 60 days after a completed Petition for Variance has been received. The new
Petition for Variance needs to be reviewed to determine if it is complete and if it is then
a special board meeting would need to be scheduled to address it.

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |5
October 21, 2014



B) Review of SONAR for 4714 proposed rules
Modifications made to the rule draft will need to be reflected in the SONAR. The SONAR
does not need approval by the Board members; however, it should be reviewed and in
particular the following sections were addressed: Page 4, items (5) and (6). Wendy
noted that specific expenses or savings should be placed into the SONAR; Pages 5 & 6,
Additional Notice items 1 to 28 should include all organizations and groups affected by
the rules; Page 6 & 7 Cost of Complying for Small Business or City should be reviewed
and the Board could vote to say “they have determined” or “they have not determined”
that the cost of complying with the proposed rules in the first year after the rules take
effect will not exceed $25,000 for any small business or small city.

The Board took a ten minute recess to review SONAR sections as noted below.

Page 4, Item #5
“Plumbers, municipal inspection departments and designers wilkmay need to purchase
copies of the UPC. “

Page 4, Item #6
No comments

Page 5, Additional Notice:

Add the following items after item 28:

e All Minnesota licensed Building Officials

e All licensed plumbers and plumbing contractors
e Water Conditioning Engineers

e City Engineers Association of Minnesota

e The Nursery and Landscape Association

e MOWA

e American Waterworks Association, MN Chapter

Page 6 &7, Cost of Complying for small business or city:

Will there be a cost of more than $25,000 to a small business to train their employees?
The Board said no, there would not be a cost of more than $25,000 to a small business.
Legge suggested that based on the Board’s consideration and conclusion, language
should be added as follows: Nothing in this code is going to require a business to put in
new equipment. Costs for existing systems include the testing of testable devices for
backflow prevention and the number of devices that need to be tested has expanded —
the new rules will allow additional sewer materials that are cheaper, less expensive
sewer liners, no longer requiring a 5-year re-build, and single-wall heat exchangers offer
cost savings over double-wall.

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page | 6
October 21, 2014



Q) Procedures for Variances:
Legge referred to MN Statutes, section 14.055, Rule Variances; Standards and 14.056
Rule Variances; Procedures.
MN STATUTES, SECTION 14.055, RULE VARIANCES; STANDARDS.
Subdivision 1. Authority. A person or entity may petition an agency for a variance from
a rule adopted by the agency, as it applies to the circumstances of the petitioner.

Wendy noted that the Variance has prospective effect only — you only ask for variances
for items in the future; they cannot apply to something that has already happened. The
agency can attach certain conditions but you can only grant a variance to a rule. The
Board does not have authority to grant a variance to a statute or court order. There are
certain circumstances in which granting a variance is mandatory — as shown in Subd. 3
below:

Subd. 3.Mandatory variances.

An agency shall grant a variance from a rule as applied to the particular circumstances
of the petitioner, if the agency finds that the application of the rule, as applied to the
circumstances of that petitioner, would not serve any of the purposes of the rule.

There are also certain circumstances when granting a variance is optional as explained
in Subd. 4 below:

Subd. 4.Discretionary variances.

An agency may grant a variance if the agency finds that:

(1) application of the rule to the petitioner would result in hardship or injustice;

(2) variance from the rule would be consistent with the public interest; and

(3) variance from the rule would not prejudice the substantial legal or economic rights of
any person or entity.

In terms of the procedures, MN Statutes 14.056 Rule Variances: Procedures, Subdivision
1, items 1 to 7 are required. Legge noted a Petition for Variance must include all of the
seven items listed below:

MN STATUTES, SECTION 14.056, RULE VARIANCES; PROCEDURES.

Subdivision 1.Contents of variance petition.

A petition for a variance under section 14.055 must include the following information:
(1) the name and address of the person or entity for whom a variance is being requested;
(2) a description of and, if known, a citation to the specific rule for which a variance is
requested;

(3) the variance requested, including the scope and duration of the variance;

(4) the reasons that the petitioner believes justify a variance, including a signed
statement attesting to the accuracy of the facts asserted in the petition;

(5) a history of the agency's action relative to the petitioner, as relates to the variance
request;

(6) information regarding the agency's treatment of similar cases, if known; and

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |7
October 21, 2014


https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/?id=14.055

(7) the name, address, and telephone number of any person the petitioner knows would
be adversely affected by the grant of the petition.

The Board does not have budget and the department won’t charge a fee therefore
Subd. 2 Fees can be skipped.

Subd. 3 Notice — Legge said persons that would be adversely affected need to be
notified per the language as shown below:

Subd. 3.Notice.

In addition to any notice required by other law, an agency shall make reasonable efforts
to ensure that persons or entities who may be affected by the variance have timely
notice of the request for a variance. The agency may require the petitioner to serve
notice on any other person or entity in the manner specified by the agency.

The Board can request additional information from the petitioner as shown below:

Subd. 4.Additional information.
Before granting or denying a variance petition, an agency may request additional
information from the petitioner.

Subd. 5.0rder; timing.

An agency must issue a written order granting or denying a variance and specifying the
scope and period of any variance granted. The order must contain an agency statement
of the relevant facts and the reasons for the agency's action. The agency shall grant or
deny a variance petition as soon as practicable, and within 60 days of receipt of the
completed petition, unless the petitioner agrees to a later date. Failure of the agency
to act on a petition within 60 days constitutes approval of the petition.

The Board needs to act to determine if a Variance can be granted by reviewing the
variance for completeness. Legge proposed that for future variance petitions the Board
give certain authorities to the Chair of the Board for purposes of getting needed
information in a timely manner and giving required notice in a timely manner. Legge
prepared a Resolution for dealing with variance petitions as shown below:

RESOLUTION

It is hereby resolved that the Plumbing Board Chair is authorized to take the
following actions in connection with a petition for a variance submitted to the Board
under Minnesota Statutes § 14.055:

1. Require the Petitioner to submit additional information in connection with the
Petition if the Chair believes that the Petition does not contain all information
required by Minnesota Statutes § 14.056, subdivision 1, or if the Chair believes that
the Board needs additional information in order to determine whether to grant or
deny the requested variance;

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |8
October 21, 2014



2. Require the Petitioner to serve notice, in the manner determined by the Chair, on
any person or entity who may be affected by the variance. This includes not only
persons or entities listed by the Petitioner under Minnesota Statutes § 14.056,
subdivision 1(7), but also any other person or entity who, in the opinion of the Chair,
may be affected by the variance;

3. Enter into an agreement with the Petitioner to extend the 60 day deadline for
the Board to grant or deny the variance; and

4. Charge the Petitioner a variance fee in accordance with section 14.056, Subd. 2,
including entering into an agreement on the costs and the timing and manner of

payment.

A motion was made by Justin, seconded by Kittelson, to accept the
Resolution with changes noted in bold for #3 and #4 as shown above. The
vote was unanimous; the motion carried.

D) Petition for Variance — Manitou Ridge Golf Course (See Attachment #3)
The Board reviewed procedural requirements in Subdivision 1, ltems 1 to 7 of MN
Statutes 14.056, for completeness and Wendy noted that Notice should have been given
to persons or groups affected, such as the Met Council or the City of White Bear.
Wendy noted that if tems 1 to 7 were incomplete or affected parties weren’t notified
then the Variance should not be addressed.

Procedural items 1 to 7 reviewed for completeness by the Board:
e Item 1, complete
e Item 2, complete

e Item 3, Are they requesting a temporary variance until they take additional action or
is it a permanent variance? What is currently being done with it and what locations?
Has it been installed at any location? In particular, at Manitou?

e [tem 4, Wendy does not believe they attest to the accuracy of the facts and said the
Board should ask for a signed statement from the Petitioner attesting to the
accuracy of the facts.

e Item 5, the Board can request any information the Petitioner might have in regards
to the Department but only in regards to this Variance request. The department’s
action relates only to this Variance. Under Subd. 4 the Board can always request
additional information such as a denial from the department.

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |9
October 21, 2014



e |tem 6, The Board can ask for this information as it relates to similar cases, locations
and permitting process used for the installations. Specifically, the Board can request
information regarding the Department’s actions dealing with Keller and information
regarding the City of Minneapolis’s actions dealing with Mendakota (water stacks
installed). Did Minneapolis give Mendakota a Variance — the Petitioner should
provide this information as well.

e Item 7, Need to request name, address, and telephone number of any person the
petitioner knows would be adversely affected by the grant of the petition. Subpart 3
allows the Board to ask the Petitioner to give notice to persons or agencies affected.
Agencies such as: MPCA, Met Council, The Department of Health (water quality /
reuse), City of White Bear Lake, and any other agencies or individuals that might be
affected by it. The Board can request that the Petitioner contact particular entities
PLUS list any other individuals or agencies that might be adversely affected.

The Board needs to grant authority to Chair Parizek to assess a fee and enter into an
agreement with Manitou Ridge Golf Course. In addition, the Board needs to note if
there is any information needed for the variance before granting or denying the
petition. Wendy noted that the Board could request that the Petitioner contact affected
agencies and satisfactorily address all concerns as per language in item 7 above.

Legge clarified the Board needs to grant Chair Parizek the authority to
determine a fee and negotiate the agreement and timing and manner of
payment with the Petitioner. Chair Parizek asked for a motion that the
Resolution that was adopted earlier also apply to the Petition for
Variance from Manitou Ridge Golf Course.

A motion made by Flagg, seconded by Moulton, to grant Chair Parizek the
authority to determine a fee and negotiate the agreement and timing and
manner of payment with the Petitioner (Manitou Ridge Golf Course). The
vote was unanimous; the motion carried.

VII. Complaints
No complaints

VIll. Open Forum
Nothing brought forth

IX. Board Discussion
There will be a five state conference February 25-27 at the Earl Brown Center in the Twin Cities.
This event will provide an opportunity to discuss reciprocity with other states.

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |10
October 21, 2014



X. Announcements
Next regularly scheduled meetings — all meetings with be held at 9:30 a.m. in the Minnesota
Room. Executive Committee meetings occur at 8:00 a.m., prior to each regular meeting.
° April 21, 2015
° July 21, 2015
° October 20, 2015

John discussed expiring board members and hoped that everyone would re-apply.

Xl. Adjournment
A motion was made by Moulton, seconded by Flagg, to adjourn the meeting at 3:26 p.m.

Respectfully submitted,

Phillip Sterner
Phillip Sterner
Secretary

Plumbing Board Meeting Minutes Page |11
October 21, 2014



' g

e
1.2

1.3

14
1.5
1.6
1.7
1.8
1.9
1.10
1.11
1.12
1.13

114

1.15
1.16
1.17
1.18
1.19
120
121

1.22

1.23
1.24
1.25

1.26

/ ' :
A0/07/14 LOH 1Y REVISOR

Attachment A -

/ &@\g@@( et Vo Board
| ‘ _SS/DL RD4139
Wi addihons o Wizify A - add new .I‘mﬂ A
Minnesota Plumbing Board Aok +o ""Qe ' @ = new lne
= Y -
Proposed Amendment to Rules Governing the Plumbing Code and Adopting the
2012 Uniform Plumbing Code, with Amendments

4714.0050 TITLE; INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE.
Chapters 2 to 11, 14, and 17 of the 2012 edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code

(UPC) as promulgated by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Offices (IAPMOQ), Ontario, California, and UPC appendices A, B, and I, except for
IS 12-2006, IS 13-2006, IS 26-2006, SIS 1-2003, and SIS 2-2013 of appendix I, are

incorporated by reference and made part of the Minnesota Plumbing Code except as

qualified by the applicable provisions in chapter 1300, and as amended in this chapter. The

UPC is not subject to frequent change and a copy of the UPC, with amendments for use in

Minnesota, is available in the office of the commissioner of labor and industry. Portions of

this chapter reproduce text and tables from the UPC, reproduced with permissidn. The
UPC is copyright 2012 by the TAPMO. All rights reserved.

4714.0100 BASIC PLUMBING PRINCIPLES.

This code is founded upon certain basic principles of environmental sanitation

and safety through properly designed, acceptably installed, and adequately maintained

plﬁmbing systems. Some of the details of plumbing construction may vary, but the basic

sanitary and safety principles desirable and necessary to protect the health of the people

are the same everywhere. As interpretations may be required, and as unforeseen situations

arise that are not specifically covered in this code, the 23 principles in items A to W

shall be used to define the intent.

A. All premises intended for human habitation, occupancy, or use shall be

provided with a potable water supply that meets the requirements of the commissioner of

health. The water supply shall not be connected with unsafe water sources nor shall it

be subject to the hazards of backflow or back~siphonage.

4714.0100 1




2.1

22

23

24

2.5

2.6

2.7

2.8

29

2.10

2.11

2.12

2.13

2.14

2.15

2.16

2.17

2.18

2.19

2.20

221

222

223

2.24

225

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

B. Proper protection shall be provided to prevent contamination of food, water,

sterile goods, and similar materials by backflow of sewage. When necessary, the fixtures,

devices, or appliances shall be connected indirectly with the building drainage system.

C. Each family dwelling unit shall have at least one water closet, one lavatory,

one kitchen-type sink, and one bathtub or shower to meet the basic requirements of

sanitation and personal hygiene. All other structures for habitation shall be equipped

with sufficient sanitary facilities.

D. The building sewer in every building with installed plumbing fixtures

and intended for human habitation, occupancy, or use when located on premises where

the Authority Having Jurisdiction has determined that a public sewer is available shall

be connected to the public sewer.

E. The building drainage system shall be designed to provide adequate

circulation of air in all pipes with no danger of siphonage, aspiration, or forcing of trap

seals under conditions of ordinary use.

F. The drainage system shall be designed, constructed, and maintained to conduct

the waste water with velocities that prevent fouling, deposition of solids, and clogging.

G. The drainage system shall be provided with an adequate number of cleanouts

so arranged that in case of stoppage the pipes may be readily cleaned.

H. Where a building drainage system may be subjected to backflow of sewage,

suitable provision shall be made to prevent overflow in the building.

1. Each vent terminal shall extend to the outer air and be so installed as to

minimize the possibilities of clogging and the return of foul air to the building.

J. No substance that will clog or accentuate clogging of pipes, produce

explosive mixtures, destroy the pipes or their joints, or interfere unduly with the sewage

disposal process shall be allowed to enter the drainage system.

4714.0100 2



3.1
3.2

33

34

3.5

3.6

37

3.8
3.9

3.10

3.11

3.12

3.13
3.14

3.15

3.16
3.17
3.18

3.19

3.20

321

3.22

3.23

3.24

3.25

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

K. The piping of the plumbing system shall be of durable material free from

defective construction and designed and constructed to give satisfactory service for its

reasonable expected life.

L. The plumbing system shall be subjected to adequate tests and to inspections

in a manner that will disclose all leaks and defects in the work or the material.

' M. Plumbing systems shall be maintained in a safe and serviceable condition

from the standpoint of both mechanics and health.

"N. Plumbing shall be installed with due regard to preservation of the strength

of structural members and prevention of damage to the walls and other surfaces through

fixture usage.

O. Plumbing fixtures shall be made of durable, smooth, nonabsorbent, and

corrosion-resistant material and be free from concealed fouling surfaces.

P. Plumbing fixtures, devices, and appurtenances shall be supplied with water

in sufficient volume and at pressures adequate to enable them to function properly and

without undue noise under normal conditions of use.

Q. Plumbing fixtures shall be designed and adjusted to use the minimum

quantity of water consistent with proper performance and cleaning. Hot water shall be

supplied to all plumbing fixtures which normally need or require hot water for their

proper use and function.

R. All plumbing fixtures shall be installed with regard to spacing as to be

accessible for their intended use and cleansing.

S. Each fixture shall be provided with a separate, accessible, self-scouring,

reliable trap placed as near to the fixture as possible.

T. No water closet or similar fixture shall be located in a room or compartment

that is not properly lighted and ventilated.

4714.0100 3




4.1

42

43

44

45

4.6

4.7

4.8

49

4.10

411

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

U. If water closets or other plumbing fixtures are installed in a building where

there is no public sewer available as determined by the Authority Having Jurisdiction,

suitable provisions shall be made for treatment of the building sewage by methods that

meet the requirements of rules administered by the Pollution Control Agency.

V. Devices for heating and storing water shall be designed and installed to

prevent all dangers from explosion and overheating.

W. Sewage or other waste shall not be discharged into surface or subsurface

water unless it first has been subjected to an acceptable form of treatment approved by the

Pollution Control Agency.

4714.0101 CONFORMANCE WITH CODE.

Subpart 1. Scope. As provided in Minnesota Statutes, sections 326B.43 and

B268
A 345B.52, this code applies to all new plumbing installations performed anywhere in the

4.13

4.14

4.15

4.16

4.17

4.18

4.19

4.20

421

422

4.23

424

425

state, including additions, extensions, alterations, and replacements.

Subp. 2. New buildings. All plumbing materials and plumbing systems or parts

thereof shall be installed to meet the minimum provisions of this code.

Subp. 3. Existing buildings. In existing buildings and premises in which plumbing

systems, -drainage systems, or other work regulated by this code are to be added, altered,

renovated, or replaced, the new materials and work shall meet the provisions of this code, If

the Authority Having Jurisdiction finds that the full performance of bringing the work into

compliance with all requirements of this code would result in exceptional or undue hardship

by reason of excessive structural or mechanical difficulty or impracticability, a deviation

may be granted by the Authority Having Jurisdiction only to the extent the deviation can

be granted without endangering the health and safety of the occupants and the public.

Subp. 4. Changes in building occupancy. A plumbing system that is a part of a

building or structure undergoing a change in use or occupancy, as defined in the building

4714.0101 4



5.1

5.2

53

54

5.5

5.6

5.7

5.8

59

5.10

5.11

5.12

513

5.14

5.15

5.16

517 -

5.18

5.19

5.20

521

522

5.23

524

525

5.26

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

code, shall be in accordance with the requirements of this code that are applicable to

the new use or occupancy.

Subp. 5. Moved buildings. Plumbing systems that are part of buildings or structures

moved into this jurisdiction shall be in accordance with this code for new installations. Parts

of the plumbing systems of a building or part thereof that is moved from one foundation to

another, or from one location to another, shall be completely tested as new work, except

that walls or floors need not be removed during such tests where other equivalent means

of inspection acceptable to the Authority Having Jurisdiction are provided.

Subp. 6. Health and safety. No provision of this code shall be deemed to require

a change in a portion of a plumbing or drainage system or other work regulated by this

code in or on an existing building or lot where the work was installed and is maintained in

accordance with rule in effect before the effective date of this code. Where the plumbing

or drainage system or other work regulated by this code is determined by the Authority

Having Jurisdiction to be dangerous, unsafe, insanitary or a nuisance or a hazard to life,

health, or property then the owner or owner's agent shall be responsible for bringing the .

existing plumbmg mstallatlon within the provisions of this code. Where these conditions

'ex1st the owner or owner's agent shall be responsible for 1nstallmg additional plumbing or

making such corrections as may be necessary to abate such nuisance or hazard and bring

the existing plumbing installation within the provisions of this code.

Subp. 7. Commissioner's authority. The commissioner retains the ultimate

authority to enforce this code and Minnesota Statutes, sections 3268.41 to 326B.59,

regatrdless of whether the administrative ‘authority is the commissioner or the governing

body of a governmental subdivision.

4714.0203 TERMS DEFINED BEGINNING WITH A.

Subpart 1. Added definitions. UPC section 203.0 is modified by adding the
following definition:

4714.0203 5




10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RDA4139

6.1 Administrative Authority - Means the commissioner.

6.2 Exception: When a governmental subdivision adopts and maintains a comprehensive
6.3 plumbing enforcement program that is conducted by personnel who are knowledgeable
6.4 about plumbing installation requirements, and includes enforcement of all code

65 provisions including materials, methods, inspection, and testing, the administrative
6.6 authority shall be the governing body of the adopting unit of government or a duly

designated representative of the governing body who is either an employee of the

governing body or a person working under contract with the governing body.

mpproved - Means approval by the administrative authority, pursuant to the Minnesota

6.7
6.8

Plumbing Code, by reason of inspection, investigation, or testing; accepted principles;
6.11

computer simulations; research reports; or testing performed by a nationally recognized

testing laboratory.

by

6.13 Subp. 2. Amended definitions. UPC section 203.0 is modified by amending the

4 following definition;
FA T
6.15 Authority Having Jurisdiction ~ Unless otherwise specified in this code, the term

Authority Having Jurisdiction has the same meaning as administrative authority. sheree:

H114.0204 Terms defined beﬂinm‘nﬁ with & f Baromeiric loep = [ o for”

See
4714.0205 TERMS DEFINED BEGINNING WITH C. e algé‘vm%mj

6.18 Subpart 1. Amended definitions. UPC section 205.0 is modified by amending the

6.19 following definitions:

6.20 Certified Backflow Assembly Tester - Has the same meaning as backflow prevention

6.21 tester defined in Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.42, subdivision 1c.

6.22 Clear Water Waste - Uncontaminated water discharges, subsoil discharges, and similar

6.23 discharges.
6.24 Coade - For purposes of this chapter, "this code" or "the code" means the Minnesota

6.25 Plumbing Code, Minnesota Rules, chapter 4714.

4714.0205 6



7.1

7.2

7.3

74

7.5

7.6

7.1

7.8

7.9

7.10

7.11

o712

7.13

7.14

7.15

7.16

7.17

7.18

7.19

7.20

7.21

7.22

7.23

7.24

7.25

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

Subp. 2. Added definitions. UPC section 205.0 is modified by adding the following
definition:

Commissioner ~ Means the commissioner of labor and industry or a duly designated

representative of the commissioner who is either an employee of the Department of Labor

and Industry or a person working under contract with the department.

4714.0206 TERMS DEFINED BEGINNING WITH D.
UPC section 206.0 is modified by amending the following definition:

Drainage System - Includes all the piping within public or private premises that conveys

sewage, rainwatet, or other liquid wastes to a legal point of disposal, but does not include

the mains of a public sewer system or a public sewage treatment or disposal planf.

4714.0210 TERMS DEFINED BEGINNING WITH H.

Subpart 1. Amended definition. UPC section 210.0 is modified by amending the

following definition:

Hydromechanical Grease Interceptor ~ A plumbing appurtenance or appliance that is-

. installed in a sanitary drainage system to intercept nonpetroleum fats, oil, and grease

(FOQG) from a wastewater discharge and is identified by flow rate, and separation and

retention efficiency. The design incorporates air entrainment, hydromechanical separation,

interior baffling, or barriers in combination or separately, and one of the following;:

A - External flow control, with air intake (vent), directly connected.

B - External flow control, without air intake (vent), diréctly connected.

C - Without external flow control, directly connected.

These interceptors comply with the requirements of Table 1014.2.1. Hydromechanical

orease interceptors are generally installed inside.

Subp. 2. Added definitions. UPC section 210.0 is modified by adding the following
definition: |

4714.0210 7




8.1

8.2

8.3

8.4

8.5

8.6

8.7

8.8

8.9

8.10

8.11

8.12

8.13

8.14

8.15

8.16

8.17

8.19

8.20

8.21

8.22

8.23

8.24

8.25

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

Health Authority - Means the state health department or local public health agency that

has authority established under law to enforce rules governing drinking water supply.

4714.0218 TERMS DEFINED BEGINNING WITH P.
UPC section 218.0 is modified by amending the following definitions:

Plumbing System - Includes all potable water, building supply, and distribution pipes;

all plumbing fixtures and traps; all drainage and vent pipes; and all building drains and

building sewers, including their respective joints and connections, devices, receptors, and

appurtenances within the property lines of the premises and shall include potable water

piping, potable water treating or using equipment, and nonpotable water piping serving

plumbing fixtures.

Potable Water - Water that is satisfactory for drinking, culinary, and domestic purposes

and that meets the requirements of the Health Authority.

Private Sewage Disposal System - A subsurface sewage treatment system designed for

use apart from a public sewer as regulated under the rules administered by the Pollution

Control Agency.

4714.0220 TERMS DEFINED BEGINNING WITH R.
UPC section 220.0 is modified by adding the following definition:

Registered Professional Engineer - For purposes of this code, "registered professional

engineer," "engineer," or "registered engineer" means a person practicing professional

engineering as described in Minnesota Statutes, section 326.02, subdivision 3, and who is

licensed in the state of Minnesota as a professional engineer by the Board of Architecture,

Engineering, Land Surveying, Landscape Architecture, Géoscience, and Interior Design

under Minnesota Statutes, section 326.10.

4714.0221 TERMS DEFINED BEGINNING WITH S.
UPC section 221.0 is modified by amending the following definition:

4714.0221 8



9.1

9.2
9.3

9.4

9.5

9.6

9.7

9.8

9.9

9.10
9.11
9.12
9.13
9.14
9.15
9.16
9.17
9.18
919
9.20
9.21
9.22
9.23
9.24
9.25
9.26

9.27

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

Single-Family Dwelling - Has the meaning of dwelling, single-family, in Minnesota
Rules, part 1309.0202, subpart 1.

4714.0301 SECTION 301.0 MATERIALS - STANDARDS AND ALTERNATIVES.

Subpart 1. Section 301.1. UPC section 301.1 is amended to read as follows:

301.1 Minimum Standards. Pipe, pipe fittings, traps, fixtures, material, and devices

used in a plumbing system shall:

(1) be listed or labeled (third-party certified) by a listing agency (accredited conformity

assessment body);

(2) comply with the approved applicable recognized standards referenced in this code; and
(3) be free from defects.

Plastic pipe and the fittings used for plastic pipe shall meet the requirements of NSF 14,

Unless otherwise provided for.in this code, materials, fixtures, or devices used or entering

into the construction of plumbing systems, or parts thereof, shall be submitted to the

Authority Having Jurisdiction for approval,

301.1.1 Marking. Each length of pipe and each pipe fitting, trap, fixture, material,

and device used in a plumbing system shall have cast, stamped, or indelibly marked

on it the manufacturer's mark or name, which shall readily identify the manufacturer

to the end user of the product. Where required by the approved standard that applies,

the product shall be marked with the weight and the quality of the product. Materials

and devices used or entering into the construction of plumbing and drainage systems,

or parts thereof, shall be marked and identified in a manner satisfactory to the

Authority Having Jurisdiction. The marking shall be done by the manufacturer. Field

markings shall not be acceptable.

301.1.2 Standards. Standards listed or referred to in this chapter or other chapters

cover materials that shall conform to the requirements of this code, where used in

accordance with the limitations imposed in this or other chapters thereof and their

listing. Where a standard covers materials of various grades, weights, quality, or

4714.0301 9




10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

10.1 configurations, the portion of the listed standard that is applicable shall be used.

102 | Design and materials for special conditions or materials not provided for herein shall
103 be permitted to be used only by special permission of the Authority Having Jurisdiction
10.4 after the Authority Having Jurisdiction has been satisfied as to their adequacy. A list
10.5 of accepted plumbing material standards is referenced in Table 1401.1.

10.6 Subp. 2. Section 301.2. UPC section 301.2 is amended to read as follows:

10.7 301.2 Alternate Materials and Methods of Construction Equivalency. Nothing in

108 this code is intended to prevent the use of systems, methods, or devices of equivalent or

10,9 superior quality, strength, fire resistance, effectiveness, durability, and safety over those

10.10  prescribed by this code. Prior to installation, technical documentation shall be submitted

10.11  to the Authority Having Jurisdiction to demonstrate equivalency. Unless prohibited by

1012  this code or by law, the Authority Having Jurisdiction shall have the authority to approve

1013 or disapprove the system, method, or device for the intended purpose.

10.14 However, the exercise of this discretionary approval by the Authority Having

1015  Jurisdiction shall have no effect beyond the jurisdictional boundaries of the Authority

10.16  Having Jurisdiction. An alternate material or method of construction so approved shall not

1017  be considered as in accordance with the requirements, intent, or both of this Code for a

10.18  purpose other than that granted by the Authority Having Jurisdiction where the submitted

A I S S and 30iz12 e precnsd 2T,
10.20 Subp. 3. Section 301.4.6. UPC section 301.4.6 is amended to read as follows:

10.21 301.4.6 Inspection and Testing. The alternative engineered design shall be tested

1022 . and inspected in accordance with the submitted testing and inspection plan and the

10.23 requirements of this code. Prior to the final plumbing inspection, the registered

10.24 professional engineer shall provide written certification to the administrative authority

1025 that the system has been visually inspected by the registered professional engineer or

10.26 the registered professional engiﬁeer's designee, and the installation has been properly

10.27 implemented according to the certified plans, calculations, and specifications.

4714.0301 10



10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

11.1 4714.0307 LOCATION.

112 UPC section 307.1 is amended to read as follows:

113 307.1 System. Except as otherwise provided in this code, no plumbing system, drainage

114 system, building sewet, or part thereof shall be located in a lot other than the lot that is the

115 site of the building, structure, or premises served by such facilities.

11.6 4714.0311 INDEPENDENT SYSTEMS.

11.7 Subpart 1. Section 311.0. UPC section 311.0 title is amended to read as follows:
11.8 311.0 Use of Public Sewer and Water Systems Required. |

119 Subp. 2. Section 311.1. UPC secﬁon 311.1 is amended to read as follows:

11,10 311.1 General. If a public sewer is available in a street or alley to a building or premises

1.11 and the connection is feasible, liquid waste from any plumbing system in that building

1112 shall be discharged into the public sewer unless otherwise prohibited by this code or a

1113 local ordinance. If a public water supply is accessible, the water distribution system shall

11.14  be connected to it unless otherwise permitted by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. A

1115 private water well taken out of service because of a connection to a public water supply

11.16  shall be maintained pursuant to Minnesota Rules, chapter 4725, Wells and Borings.

11.17 Every building shall have its own independent water and sewer connection except that

11.18  a group of buildings may be connected to one or more sewer manholes on the premises

11.19  that are constructed to standards set by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

1120 4714.0312 PROTECTION OF PIPING, MATERIALS, AND STRUCTURES.

11.21 Subpart 1. Section 312.7. UPC section 312.7 is amended to read as follows:

1122 312.7 Fire-Resistant Construction. Piping penetrations of fire-resistance-rated walls,

1123 partitions, floors, floor/ceiling assemblies, roof/ceiling assemblies, or shaft enclosures

1124  shall be protected in accordance with the State Building Code.

11.25 Subp. 2. Section 312.9. UPC section 312.9 is amended to read as follows:

4714.0312 11




12.1

12.2

123

12.4

12.5

12.6

12.7

12.8

12,9

12.10

12.11

12.12

12,13

12.14

12.15

12.16

12.17

12.18

12.19

12.20

12.21

12.22

12.23

12.24

12.25

12.26

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

312.9 Steel Nail Plates. Plastic and copper piping penetrating framing members to within

1 inch (25.4 mm) of the exposed framing shall be protected by steel nail plates not less
than No. 18 gauge (0.0478 inches) (1.2 mm) in thickness. The steel nail plate shall

extend along the framing member not less than 1-1/2 inches (38 mm) beyond the outside

diameter of the pipe or tubing.
Exception: See Minnesota Rules, chapter 1346, Minnesota Mechanical and Fuel

Gas Codes.

4714.0313 HANGERS AND SUPPORTS.
UPC section 313.7 is deleted in its entirety.

4714.0314 TRENCHING, EXCAVATION, AND BACKFILL.
UPC sections 314.0 to 314.4 are deleted in their entirety.

4714.0315 JOINTS AND CONNECTIONS.

UPC section 315.1 is amended to read as follows:

315.1 Unions. Approved unions shall be permitted to be used in drainage piping where

accessibly located in the trap seal or between a fixture and its trap in the vent system,

except underground or in wet vents, at a point in the water supply system.

4714.0317 FOOD-HANDLING ESTABLISHMENTS.

UPC section 317.1 is amended to read as follows:

317.1 General. Soil or drain pipes installed over areas where food or drink will be stored,

prepared, or displayed shall be installed with the minimum number of joints necessary and

connected to the nearest adequately sized vertical stack with the following provisions:

(1) Plumbing openings through floors over such areas shall be sealed watertight ‘to the

floor construction.

(2) Floor and shower drains installed above such areas shall be equipped with integral

seepage pans.
(3) Cleanouts shall be extended through the floor construction above.

4714.0317 _ 12



131
132
13.3
134

13.5

13.6

13.7

13.8

139

13.10
13.11
13.12
13.13
13.14
13.15
13.16
13.17

13.18

13.19

13.20

1321
13.22
13.23
| 13.24

13.25

10/07/14 ' REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

(4) Piping subject to operation at temperatures that will form condensation on the exterior

of the pipe shall be thermally insulated.

(5) Where pipes are installed in ceilings above such areas, the ceiling shall be of the

removable type, or shall be provided with access panels in order to form a ready access

for inspection of piping.

4714.0319 MEDICAL GAS AND VACUUM SYSTEMS.
UPC sections 319.0 to 319.1 are deleted in their entirety.

4714.0403 WATER—CONSERVING FIXTURES AND FITTINGS.

UPC section 403.3 is amended to read as follows:

403.3 Urinals. Urinals shall have an average water consumption not to exceed 1 gallon

(4 L) of water per flush.

403.3.1 Nonwater urinals. Nonwater urinals shall be listed and comply with the

applicable standards referenced in Table 1401.1. Nonwater urinals shall have a barrier

liquid sealant to maintain a trap seal. Nonwater urinals shall permit the uninhibited

flow of waste through the urinal to the sanitary drainage system. Nonwater urinals

shall be cleaned and maintained in accordance with the manufacturer's instructions

after installation. Where a nonwater urinal is installed, a water-supplied fixture shall

be installed upstream of the nonwater urinal at the end of that same drainage branch.

4714.0406 PROHIBITED FIXTURES.

UPC section 406.3 is deleted in its entirety.

4714.0409 BATHTUBS AND WHIRLPOOL BATHTUBS.

UPC section 409.1 is amended to read as follows:

409.1 Application. Bathtubs and whirlpool bathtubs shall comply with the applicable

standards referenced in Table 1401.1.: Pfessure sealed doors within bathtubs and whirlpool

bathtub enclosures shall comply with the applicable standards referenced in Table 1401.1.

4714.0409 13




14.1

14.3

144

14.5

14.6

14.7

14.8

14.9

14.10

14.11

14.12

14.13

14.14

1415

14.16

14.17

14.18

14.19

14.20

14.21

14.22

14.23

14.24

14.25

14.26

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

Whirlpool pedicure tubs shall comply with general requirements and water retention

sections of ASME AJ2-9-% or IAPMO IGC 155, Pipeless Whirlpool Bathtub Appliances.
AAN2.19.7, Hydromassage. Ratritub Appliances,
4714.0415 DRINKING FOUNTAINS.

UPC section 415.2-is amended to read as follows:

415.2 Public Use Fountains. Installation of a combined cold water faucet and drinking

fountain is prohibited for public use. If a drinking fountain is provided at a pﬁblic use

sink, it shall have at least an 18-inch separation from any other faucet spout.

4714.0418 FLOOR DRAINS.

Subpart 1. Section 418.4. UPC section 418.4 is amended to read as follows:

418.4 Food Storage Areas. Where drains are provided in storerooms, walk-in freezers,

walk-in coolers, refrigerated equipment, or other locations where food is stored, the drains

shall have indirect waste piping. Separate waste pipes shall be run from each food storage

area, each with an indirect connection to the building sanitary drainage system. Traps shall

be provided in accordance with Section 801.2.2 and shall be vented.

Indirect drains shall be permitted to be located in freezers or other spaces where

freezing temperatures are maintained, provided that traps, where supplied, shall be located

where the seal will not freeze. Otherwise, the floor of the freezer shall be sloped to a floor

drain located outside of the storage compartment.

Subp. 2. Section 418. UPC section 418 is amended by adding the following

subsections.

418.6 Elevator Pit Drain. An elevator pit drain shall discharge to the sanitary sewer USiIE.

an indirect connection that precludes the possibility of sewage backup into the pit. If a

sump is used, it shall be outside the pit with a dry pan drain flowing to it.

418.7 Garage and Parking Area Floor Drains. Floor area drains in open parking areas,

including open areas of parking ramps, shall discharge to the storm sewer or to a place of

disposal satisfactory to the sewer authority. Floor drains in parking areas that are enclosed,

4714.0418 14


http:Arplia.Yl

10/07/14 ' REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

15.1 and floor drains in areas open or enclosed that are used for maintenance or as vehicle wash

152 bays, shall discharge to the sanitary sewer if a municipal sewer is available. An oil and

153 flammable liquid interceptor shall be provided if required by Section 1017.

15.4 Exception: Floor drains in private garages serving one- and two-family dwellings

15.5 may discharge to daylight if approved by the administrative authority.

15.6 4714.0420 SINKS.

15.7 UPC section 420.3 is amended to read as follows;

15.8 420.3 Waste Outlet. Kitchen and laundry sinks shall have a waste outlet and fixture

15.9 tailpiece not less than 1-1/2 inches (40 mm) in diameter, except commercial pot and

1510  scullery sinks shall be provided with waste outlets not less than 2 inches (50 mm) in

(15,11 diameter. Service sinks shall have a waste outlet and fixture tailpiece not less than 2 inches

1512 (50 mm) in diameter. Fixture tailpieces shall be constructed from the materials specified in

1513 Section 701.1 for drainage piping, provided, howevet, that the connections where exposed

1514  or accessible shall be permitted to be of seamless drawn brass not less than No. 20 B & S

1515  Gauge (0.032 inches) (0.81 mm). Waste outlets shall be provided with an approved strainer.

1516 4714.0421 FIXTURES AND FIXTURE FITTINGS FOR PERSONS WITH
1517 DISABILITIES.

1518 UPC section 421.2 is amended to read as follows:

1519  421.2 Limitation of Hot Water Temperature for Public Lavatories. Hot water

1520  delivered from public-use lavatories shall be limited to a maximum temperature of 110°

1521  F (43° C) by a device that is in accordance with ASSE 1070 or CSA B125.3. The water

1522  heater thermostat shall not be considered a control for meeting this provision.

1523 4714.0422 MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED FIXTURES.

15.24 Subpart 1. Section 422.1. UPC section 422.1 is amended to read as follows:

1525  422.1 Required Minimum Number of Fixtures. For all premises subject to Minnesota

1526  Rules, chapter 4714, plumbing fixtures shall be pfovided for the type of building

4714.0422. 15




16.1

162

16.3

16.4
16.5

16.6
16.7
16.8
16.9
16.10
l6.11
16.12
16.13
l6.14

16.15

16,16

16.17
16.18

16.19

16.20

1621
16.22
16.23
1624

16.25

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

occupancy and in the minimum number listed in Minnesota Rules, chapter 1305,

Minnesota Building Code.

Subp. 2. Sections 422.1.1 to 422.5. UPC sections 422.1.1 to 422.5, including tables,

are deleted in their entirety.

Subp. 3. Table 422.1. UPC Table 422.1 is deleted in its entirety.

4714.0501 GENERAL.

UPC section 501.1 is amended to read as follows:

501.1 Applicability. The regulations of this chapter as amended in this code shall govern

the construction, location, and installation of fuel-burning and other water heaters heating

potable water. The minimum capacity for storage water heaters shall be in accordance

with the first hour rating listed in Table 501.1. Design, construction, and workmanship

shall be in accordance with accepted engineering practices, manufacturer's instructions,

and applicable standards and shall be of such character as to secure the results sought to be

obtained by this code. No water heater shall be hereinafter installed that does not comply

with the type and model of each size thereof approved by the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

4714.0503 INSPECTION.
UPC sections 503.0 to 503.2 are deleted in their entirety.

4714.0504 WATER HEATER REQUIREMENTS.

Subpart 1. Sections 504.1 to 504.2. UPC sections 504.1 to 504.2 are deleted in
their entirety. |

Subp. 2. Section 504.6. UPC section 504.6 is amended to read as follows:

504.6 Temperature, Pressure, and Vacuum Relief Devices. The installation of

temperature, pressure, and vacuum relief devices, or combinations thereof, shall be

installed in accordance with the terms of their listings and the manufacturer's installation

instructions. A shutoff valve shall not be placed between the relief valve and the water

4714.0504 16



10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DL RDA4139

171 heater or on discharge pipes between the valves and the atmosphere. The hourly British

172 thermal units (Btu) (kW-h) discharge capacity or the rated steam relief capacity of the

173 device shall be not less than the input rating of the water heater. [NFPA 54:10.28.5]

174 4714.0505 OIL-BURNING AND OTHER WATER HEATERS.
17.5 - UPC section 505.4.1 is deleted in its entirety.

17.6 4714.0506 AIR FOR COMBUSTION AND VENTILATION.
17.7 UPC sections 506.0 to 506.9 are deleted in their entirety.

178 4714.0507 OTHER WATER BEATER INSTALLATION REQUIREMENTS.

17.9 Subpart 1. Sections 507.6 to 507.11 and 507.14 to 507.23. UPC sections 507.6 to
1710 507.11 and 507.14 to 507.23 are deleted in their entirety.

17.11 Subp. 2. Section 507.5. UPC section 507.5 is amended to read as follows:

1712 507.5 Relief Valve Discharge. Discharge from a relief valve into a water heater pan

1713 shall be prohibited. Discharge relief valves shall terminate to a safe place of disposal

17.14  or within 18 inches of the floor.

1715 4714.0508 APPLIANCES ON ROOFS.

17.16 UPC sections 508.0 to 508.4 are deleted in their entirety.

1717 4714.0509 VENTING OF APPLIANCES. _
17.18 UPC'sections 509.0 to 509.14, including all tables and figures, are deleted in their

17.19  entirety.

1720  4714.0510 SIZING OF CATEGORY I VENTING SYSTEMS.
17.21 UPC sections 510.0 to 510.2, including all tables and figures, are deleted in their

1722 entirety.

1723 4714.0511 DIRECT-VENT APPLIANCES.

17.24 UPC sections 511.0 to 511.1 are deleted in their entirety.

4714.0511 4 17



http:507.11and507.14

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

18.1 4714.0601 HOT AND COLD WATER REQUIRED.

182 UPC section 601.1 is amended to read as follows;:

183 601.1 General. Each plumbing fixture shall be provided with an adequate supply

184 of potable running water piped to it in an approved manner, so arranged as to flush

18.5 and keep the fixture in a clean and sanitary condition without danger of backflow or

18.6 cross-connection. Water closets and urinals shall be flushed by means of an approved

18.7 flush tank or flushometer valve.

18.8 Exception: Listed fixtures that do not require water for their operation and are not

189 connected to the water supply.

18.10  601.1.1 Hot Water Required. In occupancies where plumbing fixtures are installed for

18.11  private use, hot water shall be required for bathing, washing, laundry, cooking purposes,

18.12  dishwashing, and maintenance. In occupancies where plumbing fixtures are installed for

18.13  public use, hot water shall be required for bathing and washing purposes. This requitement

18.14  shall not supersede the requirements for individual temperature control limitations for

18.15  public lavatories, bidets, bathtubs, Whirlpbol bathtubs, and shower control valves.

18.16  601.1.2 Hot Water Recirculation. Hot water supply systems in four-story buildings or

18.17  higher, or buildings where the developed length of hot water piping from the source of

18.18  hot water supply to the farthest fixture supplied exceeds 100 feet, shall be of the return

18.19  circulation type.

1820 4714.0602 UNLAWFUL CONNECTIONS.

1821 Subpart 1. Section 602.2. UPC section 602.2 is amended to read as follows:

1822 602.2 Cross-Contamination. Unless there is provided a backflow prevention device

1823  approved for the potential hazard and maintained in accordance with this code, no person

1824  shall make a connection or allow one to exist between pipes or conduits carrying domestic

1825  water supplied by a public or private building supply system, and (1) pipes, conduits, or

1826  fixtures containing or carrying water from any other source or containing or carrying water

4714.0602 18



191

19.2

19.3

194

19.5

19.6

19.7

19.8

19.9

19.10

19.11

19.12

19.13

19.14

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

that has been used for any purpose whatsoever, or (2) any piping carrying chemicals,

liquids, gases, or substances whatsoevet.

FEach point of use shall be separately protected where potential cross-contamination of

individual units exists. Water used for cooling or heating of equipment or other purposes

shall not be returned to the potable water system. Such water shall be discharged into the

drainage system through an air-gapped indirect waste or other approved method of disposal.

Subp. 2. Section 602.4. UPC section 602.4 is amended to read as follows:

602.4 Approval by Authority. No water piping supplied by a private water supply system

shall be connected to any other source of supply without the approval of the Authority

Having Jurisdiction.

4714.0603 CROSS-CONNECTION CONTROL.

Subpart 1. Section 603.2. UPC section 603.2 is amended to read as follows:

603.2 Approval of Devices or Assemblies. Before a device or an assembly is installed

for the prevention of backflow, it shall have first been approved. Devices or assemblies

shall be tested in accordance with recognized standards or other standards-seeeptable-te-
“approved

AreAnsthority-HavingJurisdictten. Backflow prevention devices and assemblies shall

19.17

19.18

19.19

19.20

1921

19.22

16.23

19.24

19.25

19.26

comply with Table 503.2, except for specific applications and provisions as stated in

Sections 603.5.1 through 603.5.23.

Devices or assemblies installed in a potable water supply system for protection

against backflow shall be maintained in good working condition by the person or persons

having control of such devices or assemblies. The devices or assemblies shall be tested

at the time of installation, repair, or relocation and not less than on an annual schedule

thereafter, or more often where required by the Authority Having Jurisdiction. Where

found to be defective or inoperative, the device or assembly shall be repaired or replaced.

No device or assembly shall be removed from use or relocated, or other device or

assembly substituted, without the approval of the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

4714.0603 19



http:603.5.23

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

20.1 Testing shall be performed by a certified backflow assembly tester in accordance

202 with ASSE Series 5000.

203 UPC Table 603.2 is not amended.

20.4 Subp. 2. Section 603.5.4. UPC section 603.5.4 is amended to read as fqllows:

20.5 603.5.4 Heat Exchangers. Heat exchangers used for heat transfer, heat recovery, or
20.6 solar heating shall protect the potable water systeni from being contaminated by the
20.7 heat-transfer medium.

20.8 603.5.4.1 Single-Wall Heat Exchanger. Installation of a single-wall heat

20.9 exchanger shall meet all of the following requirements: .

20.10 (1) Connected to:

20.11 (a) a low-pressure hot water boiler limited to a maximum of 30 pounds-force
20.12 per square inch gauge (psig) (207 kPa) by an approved safety or relief
20.13 valve; or

20.14 (b) a steam system limited to a maximum of 15 psig (103 kPa).

20.15 (2) The heat-transfer medium is either potable water or contains fluids having a
20.16 toxicity rating or Class of 1.

20.17 (3) Bear a label with the word "Caution," followed by the following statements:
20.18 (a) The heat-traﬁsfer medium shall be water or other nontoxic fluid having a
20.19 toxicity rating or Class of 1 as listed in Clinical Toxicology of Commercial
20.20 Products, 5th edition.

2021 (b) The pressure of the heat-transfer medium shall be limited to a maximum
2022 of 30 psig (207 kPa) by an approved safety or relief valve.

2023 The word "Caution" and the statements in letters shall have an

2024 uppercase height of not less than 0.120 inch (3.048 mm). The vertical
2025 spacing between lines of type shall be not less than 0.046 inch (1.168
20.26 mm). Lowercase letters shall be compatible with the uppercase letter
2027 size speciﬁcations.

4714.0603 20



21.1
21.2

21.3

214
21.5
21.6
21.7

21.8

21.10

2111
2112

2113
2114
2115

21.16

21.17
21.18
21.19

21.20

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

603.5.4.2 Double-Wall Heat Exchanger. Double-wall heat exchangers

shall separate the potable water from the heat-transfer medium by providing

a space between the two walls that are vented to the atmosphere.

Subp. 3. Section 603.5.12. UPC section 603.5.12 is amended to read as follows:

603.5.12 Beverage Dispensers. Potable water supply to beverage dispensers,

carbonated beverage dispensers, or coffee machines shall be protected by an

ait gap or a vented backflow preventer in accordance with ASSE 1022. For

carbonated beverage dispensers, piping materials installed downstream of the

backflow preventer shall not be made of copper;e; be affected by carbon dioxide
gas. ale not

Subp. 4. Section 603.5.18. UPC section 603.5.18 is amended to read as follows:

603.5.18 Potable Water Outlets and Valves. Potable water outlets, freeze-proof

yard hydrants, combination stop-and-waste valves, or other fixtures that incorporate a

stop-and-waste feature that drains into the ground shall not be installed underground

except for a freeze-proof yard hydrant that is located at least two feet above the water

table and at least ten feet from any sewer or similar source of contamination.

Subp. 5. Section 603.5. UPC section 603.5 is amended by adding the following

subsections:

603.5.22 Barometric Loop. A barometric loop is an acceptable method of protection

of water connections where an actual or potential backsiphonage hazard exists that is

not subject to backpressure{ A barometric loop i 1s a section of pipe in the shape of an

‘ @feﬁed "u" located upstream and 11smg 35 feet above the highest fixture it supphes

21.23
2124
2125

21.26

603.5.23 Installation of Testable Backflow Prevention Assembly. Testable

backflow prevention assemblies meeting ASSE Standard 1013, 1015, 1020, 1047,

1048, or 1056 shall be installed, tested, maintained, and removed in accordance with
sections 603.5.23.1 through 603.5.23.4.

4714.0603 21

G

mobé
c\ePnni’h

ol



http:603.5.23
http:603.5.22
http:603.5.18
http:603.5.18
http:603.5.18
http:603.5.12
http:603.5.12
http:603.5.12

22.1

22.2

223

224

22.5

22,6

22.7

22.8

229

22,10

2211

2212

22.13

22,14

22.15

22.16

22.17

22,18

22.19

2220

2221

2222

2223

2224

22.25

2226

10/07/14

REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

603.5.23.1 Notification of Installation. The administrative authority shall be

notified before installation of a testable backflow prevention assembly. The

public water supplier shall be notified of the installed testable backflow preventer

assembly within 30 days following installation on a community public water

system.
603.5.23.2 Testing and Maintenance. The installation of a testable backflow

prevention assembly is permitted only when a periodic testing and inspection

program conducted by qualified personnel is provided by an agency acceptable to

the administrative authority. Inspection intervals shall not exceed one year. The

administrative authority may require more frequent testing if deemed necessary

to ensure protection of the potable water. A testable backflow prevention

assembly shall be inspected after initial installation to ensure that it has been

properly installed and that debris resulting from the piping installation has not

interfered with the functioning of the assembly.

603.5.23.3 Inspection and Records. A test and inspection tag shall be affixed

to the testable backflow prevention assembly. The tester shall date and sign

the tag and include the tester's backflow prevention tester certification number.

Written records of testing and maintenance shall be maintained and submitted to

the administrative authority, and to the public water supplier, within 30 days of

testing if installed on a community public water system.

603.5.23.4 Notification of Removal. The Authority Having Jurisdiction, in

addition to the public water supplier, shall be notified within 30 days following

removal of a testable backflow prevention assembly from a community public

water system.

4714.0604 MATERIALS.

UPC section 604.11 is amended to read as follows:

4714.0604 22



10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

24.1 separation of ten feet shall be maintained between the outer edge of the water supply
242 pipe and the outer edge of the contamination source.
24.3 Subp. 2. Section 609. UPC section 609 is amended by adding the following

244 subsection:

24.5 609.11 Water Meters. Water meters shall be located inside a building, installed at least

24.6 12 inches above the finished floor, and readily accessible. All water meter installations

24.7 shall be rigidly supported with a permanent support in order to prevent the meter from

248  vibrating when the water is passing through it.

24.9 - Exceptions: Where installation inside a building is not possible, the water meter may
24,10 be installed in an enclosed structure not subject to flooding, high groundwater, or
24.11 surface drainage runoff, provided the meter is protected from freezing. Provisions
24,12 shall be made to install the meters above grade when possible. When installed below
24,13 grade, the top of the stmctui'e shall be located af least 12 inches above the finished
2414 grade, be secured, and be accessible. This structure shall not be connected to any
115 storm or sanitary sewer system.

2416  4714.0610 SIZE OF POTABLE WATER PIPING.

24,17 UPC section 610, Table 610.3, is amended to read as follows:

24.18 TABLE 610.3

24,19 Water Supply Fixture Units (WSFU) and Minimum Fixture Branch Pipe Sizes>
2420 Minimum ‘

2421 - Fixture Branch :

2422 Appliances, Appurtenances, Pipe Size™ Ve

24.23 or Fixtures® (inches) Private Public Assemblyé

Bathtub or Combination 172 4.0 4.0 —

2425  Bath/Shower (fill) o o -

2426  3/4-inch Bathtub Fill Valve 3/4 10.0 10.0 -
2427  Bidet 12 1.0 — ~
2428  Clothes Washer 172 4.0 4.0

|
I

4714.0610 24




231
232
23.3
234
235
23.6
23.7
238
239
23.10
23.11
23.12
23.13
23.14
23.15

23.16
23.17

238
23.19
23.20
23.21
2322
2323
2324
2325
2326

2327

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

604.11 Lead Content. Water pipe and fittings with a lead content which exceeds a

weighted average of 0.25 percent in the wetted surface material, as established in the

Safe Drinking Water Act, section 1417(d), shall be prohibited in piping systems used

to convey potable water.

4714.0608 WATER PRESSURE, PRESSURE REGULATORS, PRESSURE
RELIEF VALVES, AND VACUUM RELIEF VALVES.

UPC section 608.5 is amended to read as follows:

608.5 Drains. Relief valves located inside a building shall be provided with: (1) a drain

that is not smaller than the relief valve outlet and piping and fittings made of galvanized

steel, hard-drawn copper, CPVC, or PP; or (2) a listed relief valve drain tube with fittings.

The drain and drain tube shall not reduce the internal bore of the pipe or tubing (straight

lengths as opposed to coils) and shall terminate to a safe place of disposal or within 18

inches of the floor.

Relief valve drains shall not terminate in a building's crawl space. No part of a drain

pipe shall be trapped or subject to freezing. The terminal end of the drain pipe shall

not be threaded.

4714.0609 INSTALLATION, TESTING, UNIONS, AND LOCATION.

Subpart 1. Section 609.6. UPC section 609.6 is amended to read as follows:

609.6 Location. Except as provided in Section 609.7, no building supply shall be located

in a lot other than the lot that is the site of the building or structure served by the building

supply.

609.6.1 Water supply near sources of contamination.- Potable water supply pipes

shall not be located in, under, or above cesspools, septic tanks, septic tank drainage

fields, seepage pits, soil treatment systems, contaminated soil, sewer manholes,

catch basins, storm water storage tanks, buried tanks containing chemicals or

petroleum products, or any other source of contamination that in the judgment of the

administrative authority might contaminate the potable water supply. A horizontal

4714.0609 23



10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI k RDA4139

251 Dental Unit, cuspidor 12 — 1.0 —
252 Dishwasher, domestic 12 15 15 —
253 Drinking Fountain or Water 172 0.5 0.5 0.75
254 Cooler
25.5 Hose Bibb 172 2.5 2.5 -
256  Hose Bibb, each additional* 12 1.0 1.0 -
25.7 Lavatory (each basin), or hand
253 sink 1 10 L0 L0
259 Lawn sprinkler, each head* — 1.0 1.0 —
2510  Mobile Home, each (minimum) — 12.0 - —
25.11 Sinks - = - -
“Bar 12 10 20
@ '~ Clinic Faucet 12 — 3.0 -
@ Clinic Flushometer Valve with or
(2515 without faucet 1 - 8.0 -
@ Kitchen, domestic with or —> indent
(2517  without dishwasher 12 15 15 —
(3P Lam 12 L5 L5 -
@ Service or Mop Basin 12 L5 3.0 -
@ \\Washup, each set of faucets 172 — 2.0 -
2521  Shower, per head 172 2.0 2.0 -
2522 Urinal, 1.0 GPF Flushometer ‘
2523 Valve 3/4 See Footnote” -
2524  Urinal, greater than 1.0 GPF
2525  Flushometer Valve 3/4 See Footnote” -
2526  Utinal, flush tank 12 2.0 2.0 3.0
2527  Wash Fountain, circular spray 3/4 — 4.0 o
2528  Water Closet, 1.6 GPF Gravity
2529  Tank 12 2.5 2.5 3.5
2530 Water Closet, 1.6 GPF |
2531 Flushometer Tank 12 2.5 2.5 3.5

|
I.
|

4714.0610 . 25




10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

26.1 Water Closet, 1.6 GPF
26.2 Flushometer Valve

See F ootnotez —

[

26.3 ‘Water Closet, greater than 1.6
26.4 GPF Gravity Tank 12 3.0 5.5 7.0

26.5 Water Closet, greater than 1.6
26.6 GPF Flushometer Valve

See F ootnotez —

[

26.7 For SI units: 1 inch =25 mm

26.8 Notes:

26.9 L Size of the cold branch pipe, or both the hot and cold branch pipes.

2610 © Appliances, appurtenances, or fixtures not referenced in this table shall be permitted to

26.11  be sized by reference to fixtures having a similar flow rate and frequency of use.

2612 > The listed fixture unit values represent their load on the cold water building supply.

2613 The separate cold water and hot water fixture unit value for fixtures having both hot

26.14  and cold water connections shall be permitted to be each taken as three-quarters of the

26,15  listed total value of the fixture.

2616 * The listed minimum supply branch pipe sizes for individual fixtures are the nominal

2617  (I.D.) pipe size.

2618 > For fixtures or supply connections likely to impose continuous flow demands, determine

2619  the required flow in gallons per minute (gpm) (L/s), and add it separately to the demand in

2620  gpm (1/s) for the distribution system or portions thereof.

2621 & Assembly [Public Use]. See Minnesota Rules, chapter 1305, International Building Code.

2622~ Where sizing flushometer systems, see Section 610.10.

2623 ®Reduced fixture unit loading for additional hose bibbs is to be used where sizing total

2624  building demand and for pipe sizing where more than one hose bibb is supplied by a

2625  segment of water distribution pipe. The fixture branch to each hose bibb shall be sized

2626  on the basis of 2.5 fixture units.

2627  4714.0611 WATER CONDITIONING EQUIPMENT.

26.28 UPC sections 611.0 to 611.3 are amended to read as follows:

4714.0611 26



271
272
273
275
27.6
277
27.8
279
27.10
27.11
27.12
2713
27.14
27.16

27.17

@

~

27.19
2721
2722
27.23
27.24
2725

27.26

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

611.0 Water Conditioning Equipment.

611.1 Application. Water conditioning equipment shall comply with the requirements

in this section.

' \
611.1.1 Deﬁnition.” Water conditioning equipment\ means any appliance,

appurtenance, or fixture, or any combination thereof, designed to treat potable

water, so as to alter, modify, add, or remove any minerals, chemicals, or bacteria

contained in water. Water conditioning equipment includes but is not limited to

ion exchange water softeners, backwashing water filters, oxidizing water filters,

cartridge filters, chemical feed cartridges, ultraviolet lights, and equipment for reverse

osmosis, ultrafiltration, nanofiltration, pH adjustment, nitrate and arsenic removal,

and adsorption onto activated carbon.

611.1.2 Manufacture and Assembly. Water conditioning equipment shall: (1) be

manufactured as a complete system; or (2) be assembled as a complete system by a

licensed plumbing contractor or licensed water conditioning contractor, using various

- types of water conditioning equipment. Wetted gnaterials used in water conditioning

v o~

Surface.
equipment shall comply with ANSI/NSF 61 standards, or the equipment shall comply

with the applicable NSF standards as listed in Table 1401.1.

Exceptmn‘ Water conditioning equlpment;{n'{%-te treajiwater for nonpotable

uses that are protected by an approved backflow device, assembly, or method as

required in Chapter 6, oS »

611.1.3 Labeling. All conditioning equipment shall be labeled by:

(1) the manufacturer of equipment manufactured as a complete system; or

(2) the licensed plumbing contractor or licensed water conditioning contractor who

assembled the complete system

so as to clearly identify the type of equipment and the name and address of the

manufacturer, licensed plumbing contractor, or licensed water conditioning contractor.

4714.0611 27




28.1

28.2

283

284

285

28.6

28.7

28.8

28.9

28.10

28.11

28.12

28.13

28.14

28.15

28.16

28.17

28.18

28.19

28.20

28.21

28.22

28.23

28.24

2825

28.26

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

611.2 Airgap Discharge. Any discharge from water conditioning equipment shall enter

the drainage system through an airgap in accordance with Table 603.3.1 or an airgap

device in accordance with Table 603.2, NSF 58, or IAPMO PS 65.

611.3 Connection Tubing. The tubing to and from water conditioning units shall be of a

size and material as recommended by the manufacturer. The tubing shall comply with

the requirements of NSF 14, NSF 42, NSF 44, NSF 53, NSF 55, NSF 58, NSF 62, or the

appropriate material standards referenced in Table 1401.1.

4714.0701 MATERIALS.

UPC section 701.1 is amended to read as follows:

701.1 Drainage Piping. Materials for drainage piping shall be in accordance with one of

the referenced standards in Table 701.1 except that:

(1) Galvanized wrought-iron and galvanized steel pipe shall not be used underground and

shall be kept not less than 6 inches (152 mm) aboveground.
(2) ABS and PVC DWV piping installations shall be installed in accordance with

applicable standards referenced in Table 1401.1.

(3) No vitrified clay pipe or fittings shall be used aboveground or where pressurized by a

pump or ejector. They shall be kept not less than 12 inches (305 mm) belowground.

(4) Copper tube for drainage and pipe venting shall have a weight of not less than that of

copper drainage tube type DWV.

(5) Stainless steel 304 pipe and fittings shall not be installed underground and shall be kept

not less than 6 inches (152 mm) aboveground.

(6) Cast-iron soil pipe and fittings shall be listed and tested in accordance with standards

referenced in Table 1401.1. Such pipe and fittings shall be marked with country of

origin and identification of the original manufacturer in addition to markings required

by referenced standards.

UPC Table 701.1 is not amended.

4714.0701 28



29.1

29.2

293
294

29.5
29.6
29.7
29.8
299

29.10
29.11

29.12
29.13

29.14
29.15

29.16

29.17
29.18

29.19
29.20

29.21
2922

29.23
29.24

29.25

29.26
29.27

29.28
29.29
29.30
29.31

29.32

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RDA4139
4714.0702 FIXTURE UNIT EQUIVALENTS.
WUPC section 702, Table 702.1, is amended to read as follows:
TABLE 702.1
Drainage Fixture Unit Values (DFU)
Minimum
Size Trap
- and Trap
Plumbing Appliances, Arm™
Appurtenances, or Fixtures (inches) Private Public Assemblyl

Bathtub or Combination
Bath/Shower 1-1/2 2.0 2.0 —
Bidet 1-1/4 1.0 - -
Bidet 1-1/2 2.0 —
Clothes Washer, Domestic,
Standpipe® 2 3.0 3.0 3.0
Dental Unit, Cuspidor 1-1/4 — 1.0 1.0
Dishwasher, Domestic, with
Independent Drain”™ 1-1/2 2.0 2.0 2.0
Drinking Fountain or Water
Cooler 1-1/4 0.5 0.5 1.0
Food Waste Grinder, Commercial 2 - 3.0 3.0
Floor Drain, Emergency 2. — 0.0 0.0
Floor Drain (for Additional Sizes
see Section 702.0) 2 2.0 2.0 2.0
Shower, Single-Head Trap 2 2.0 2.0 2.0
Shower, Multi-Head, Each
Additional 2 1.0 1.0 1.0
Lavatory, Single 1-1/4 1.0 10 1.0
Lavatory, in Sets of Two or Three 1-1/2 2.0 2.0 2.0
Washfountain 1-1/2 — 2.0 2.0
Washfountain 2 .= 3.0 3.0
Mobile Home, Trap 3 12.0 - -
4714.0702 29




30.1
30.2
30.3
30.4
305
30.6
30.7
30.8
30.9
30.10
30.11
30.12

30.13
30.14
30.15

30.16
30.17

30.18
30.19
30.20
30.21
3022

30.23
30.24

30.25

30.26
30.27

30.28
3029

3030
30.31

REVISOR

10/07/14

Receptor, Indirect Waste™? 1-1/2
Receptor, Indirect Waste™* 2
Receptor, Indirect Waste" 3_
Sinks -
Bar 1-172
Bar* 1-172
Clinical 3
Commercial With Food Waste® 1-172
Commercial Pot or Scullery 2
Special ijposeZ 1-1/2
Special Purpose 2
Special Purpose 3
Kitchen, Domestic (with or

without food waste grinder,

dishwasher, or both) 1-1/2
LaundryZ (with or without

discharge from a clothes washer) 1-1/2
Service or Mop Basin 2
Service or Mop Basin 3
Service, Flushing Rim 3
Wash, Each Set of Faucets —
Urinal, Integral Trap 1.0 GPF 2
Urinal, Integral Trap Greater

Than 1.0 GPF 2
Urinal, Exposed Trap; 1-1/2
Water Closet, 1.6 GPY Gravity

Tank 3
Water Closet, 1.6 GPF

Flushometer Tank 3
Water Closet, 1.6 GPF

Flushometer Valve 3
4714.0702 30

—_
)

oo |

[\
Do

l.

O8]
<

|

l.

N
<o

l.

[\
<

l.

O8]
<

[.

Z

SS/DI

See footnoteLi

See footnotel*i

See footnotf:l '

[\
o

l.

=)
o

Qlﬂ.w‘.ﬂshi.
(eI Fen TN Kan- B Fan T N

|

N
(o]

b
[

l.

W
)

W
(o]

£ 12k
o lo

N
<o

[\
<

[\
<

l:‘*‘
o

ps

2

RD4139

Il

[\
<o

I.

=)
o

]‘

W
(o]

].

N
o

l.

W
(o]

].

SN
)

=
o

N
o

by e}

l.

b
o

Lh
()

'.

=
o

l.

Lh
)

].

=)
o

A



311
312

31.3
314

31.6
31.7
31.8
31.9
31.10
3111
3112
31.13
31.14
31.15.
31.16

31.17

31.18
31.19
31.20
3121
31.22

31.23

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

Water Closet, Greater Than 1.6

GPF Gravity Tank® 3 4.0 6.0 8.0
~ Water Closet, Greater Than 1.6
GPF Flushometer Valve 3 4.0 . 6.0 8.0

For SI units: 1 inch =25 mm

Notes:

Hndirect waste receptors shall be sized based on the total drainage capacity of the

fixtures that drain therein to, in accordance with UPC Table 702.2(b).

% provide a 2-inch (50 mm) minimum drain.

3 . , .
= For refrigerators, coffee urns, water stations, and similar low demands.

4 4 . . .
= For commercial sinks, dishwashers, and similar moderate or heavy demands.

3 Buildings having a clothes-washing area with clothes washers in a battery of three

or more clothes washers shall be rated at 6-fixture units each for purposes of sizing

common horizontal and vertical drainage piping.

8 Trap sizes shall not be increased to the point where the fixture discharge is capable

of being inadequate to maintain their self-scouring properties.

1 Assembly [See Minnesota Rules, chapter 1305, International Building Code].

4714.0704 FIXTURE CONNECTIONS (DRAINAGE).

UPC section 704.3 is amended to read as follows:

704.3 Commercial Dishwashing Machines and Sinks. Pot sinks, scullery sinks,

commercial kitchen sinks, beverage service sinks, dishwashing sinks, silverware sinks,

commercial dishwashing machines, silverware-washing machines, and other similar

fixtures shall be connected directly to the drainage system. A floor drain constructed

without backwater valves shall be provided adjacent to the ﬁXtul‘%zaﬁ('TEl'e fixture shall be

3126

31.27

and
connected on the sewer side of the floor drain trap,ée&ided—%h&t-no other drainage linéss-
—& i

connected between the floor drain waste connection and the fixture drain.. The fixtire and

floor drain shall be trapped and vented in accordance with this code.

4714.0704 31

srall be




10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

32.1 4714.0705 JOINTS AND CONNECTIONS.

32.2 UPC subsection 705.10.2 is amended to read as follows:

32.3 705.10.2 Expansion Joints. Expansion joints shall be accessible and shall be
324 permitted to be used where necessary to provide for expansion and contraction
32.5 of the pipes.

32,6 4714.0707 CLEANOUTS.

32.7 UPC section 707.4 is amended by adding a new subsection:

328 707.4.1 Back-to-Back. A cleanout shall be provided on a common vertical

32.9 fixture drain or common vent serving two fixture traps that connect to a vertical
32.10 | drain at the same level. The cleanout shall be the same nominal pipe size as the
32.11 drain serving the fixtures. Where the vertical drain is accessible through the trap
32.12 opening, the cleanout may be eliminated.

3213 4714.0710 DRAINAGE OF FIXTURES LOCATED BELOW THE NEXT
3214 UPSTREAM MANHOLE OR BELOW THE MAIN SEWER LEVEL.

32.15 Subpart 1. Section 710.12. UPC section 710.12 is amended to read as follows:

3216  710.12 Grinder Pump Ejector. Grinder pumps shall be permitted to be used. The

32.17  sump basin storage volume and the pump capacity shall be sized adequately to prevent

3218  overloading and shall at a minimum accommodate water demand peak flow from all

3219  fixtures.

32.20 710.12.1 Discharge Piping. The discharge piping shall be sized in accordance with
3221 the manufacturer's installation instructions and shall be not less than 1 1/4 inches (32
32.22 mm) in diameter. A check valve and fullway-type shutoff yalve shall be located
32.23 within the discharge line.

32.24 Subp. 2. Section 710.13. UPC section 710.13 is amended to read as follows:

3225  710.13 Macerating Toilet Systems. Listed macerating toilet systems shall be permitted
as an alternate to a sewage pump system, A-mraeeratingtoilet system may only-be—

4714.0710 ‘ 32



10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DIL RD4139

mit-ﬁ j . P : .
D At in one- or two-family dwellings'when gravity flow is not possible. Not more

£32>  than one bathroom group, consisting of a to1leif a lavato% and a shower or bathtub,

33.3 may dlschmge into a macerating toilet system. Comgonents of macerating toilet systems

33.4 shall be accessible.

33.5 710.13.1 Sumps. The sump shall be watertight and gastight.

33.6 - 710.13.2 Discharge Piping, The dischaAge > piping shall be sized in accordance

33.7 with the manufacturer's instructions and shall be ndt less than 3/4-inch (20 mm)

33.8 in diameter. The develop;ed length of the discharge piping shall not exceed the

33.9 manufacturer's instructions. A check valve and fullway-type shutoff valve shall be
33.10 located within the discharge line or internally within the device.

33.11 710.13.3 Venting. The plﬁrnbing fixtures that discharge into the macerating device
33.12 shall be vented in accordance with this code. The sump shall be vented in accordance
33.13 with the manufacturer's instructions and the vent shall be permitted to connect to
33.14 the fixture venting. |

3315  4714.0712 TESTING.

33.16 Subpart 1. Section 712.1. UPC section 712.1 is amended to read as follows:

33,17  712.1 Media. The piping of the plumbing, drainage, and venting systems shall be tested

' 3318  with water or air. The Authority Having Jurisdiction shall be permitted to require the

33.19  necessary points of access to ascertain whether the pressure has reached all parts of the

- 3320 © system.

3321, Subp. 2. Section 712. UPC section 712 is amended by adding subsections to read:

3322  as follows:

3323  712.4 Negative Test. Concrete manholes and sewer lines shall be tested by negaﬁve
3324  pressure in accordance with ASTM Standards C1214-13 and C1244-11 or the Hydroétatic
3325  Test Method in section 1109.2.2.

4714.0712 : 33




10/07/14 . REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

34.1 712.5 Finished Plumbing. After the plumbing fixtures have been set and their traps

34.2 filled with water, their connections shall be tested and proven gastight and watertight by

343 plugging the stack openings on the roof and the building drain where it leaves the building,

34.4 and air introduced into the system equal to the pressure of a 1-inch water column. Such

34.5 pressure shall remain constant for 15 minutes or the duration of the inspection without

34.6 the introduction of additional air.

34.7 712.6 Test Plugs or Caps. Test plugs or caps for roof terminals shall extend above or

34.8 outside the end of the vent pipe to provide a visible indication for removal after the test

34.9 has been completed.

3410  4714.0713 SEWER REQUIRED.

34.11 Subpart 1. Section 713.1. UPC section 713.1 is amended to read as follows:

3412 713.1 Where Required. A building in which plumbing fixtures are installed and premises

34.13  having drainage piping thereon shall have a connection to a public or private sewer, except

3414  as provided in sections 713.2 and 713.4 and Minnesota Rules, part 4714.0101, subpatt 6,

34.15 Subp. 2. Section 713.5. UPC section 713.5 is deleted in its entirety.

34.16 Subp. 3. Section 713.7. UPC section 713.7 is amended to read as follows:

34.17  713.7 Installation. In cities, counties, or both where the installation of building sewers is

34.18  under the jurisdiction of a municipal utility easement, the provisions of this code relating

* 194 Sﬁl;mbdu;ggzgy:asg&r% anlxew sechon 1128 18 addecl 4o read as Loliows:q 713\3
& + Single~-family and two-family dwellings and buildings or structures “§“ ' !
Lo H.l ﬂss.

accessory thereto, when connected to an approved private sewage disposal system

prior to the time of connecting the premises to the public sewer need not connect to

the public sewer when there is insufficient grade or slope to permit drainage to the

public sewer by gravity and the following conditions are met:

(1) no hazard, nuisance, or unsanitary condition is evidenced from the private sewage

disposal system,

4714.0713 34



10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DL RD4139

@ - (2) the private sewage system is maintained properly; and

353
354

355
356
35.7
35.8
35.9

35.10

35.11
35.12
35.13
35.14
35.15
35.16

35.17

35.18

35.19

35.20
3521
3522
35.23
3524
35.25
35.26
35.27

(3) written permission has been obtained from the Authority Having Jurisdiction.

N

4714.0714 DAMAGE TO PUBLIC SEWER OR PRIVATE SEWAGE DISPOSAL
SYSTEM.

UPC section 714.5 is amended to read as follows:

714.5 Tanks. An approved-typed, watertight sewage or wastewater holding tank, the

contents of Which, due to their character, shall be periodically removed and diSpOSCdAOf at

some approved off-site location, shall be installed where required by the Authority Having

Jurisdiction to prevent anticipated surface or subsutface contamination or pollution,

damage to the public sewer, or other hazardous or nuisance conditions.

4714.0715 BUILDING SEWER MATERIALS.

| UPC section 715.3 is amended to read as follows:

715.3 Existing Sewers. Replacement of existing building sewer and building storm

sewers using cured-in-place pipe lining trenchless methodology and materials shall be

installed in accordance with ASTM F 1216. Replacement using cured-in-place pipe liners

shall not be used on collapsed piping or when the existing piping is compromised to a point

where the installation of the liners will not eliminate hazardous or insanitary conditions.

4714.0717 SIZE OF BUILDING SEWERS.
UPC section 717, Table 717.1, is amended to read as follows:

TABLE 717.1
Maximum/Minimum Fixture Unit Loading on Building Sewer Piping
SLOPE (inches per foot)

Size of Pipe (inches) 1/16 ' 1/8 _ 1/4

6 and smaller (As specified in Table 703.2/No minimum loading)

8 1950/1500 2800/625 3900/275
10 3400/1600 - 4900/675 6800/300
12 5600/1700 8000/725 11 200/352

4714.0717 35




36.1

36.2

36.3

364

36.5

36.6

36.7

36.8

36.9

36.10

36.11

36.12

36.13

36.14

36.15

36.16

36.17

36.18

36.19

36.20

36.21

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

For SI units: 1 inch =25 mm, 1 inch per foot = §3.3 mm/m

4714.,0721 LOCATION.
UPC Table 721.1 is amended to read as follows:

TABLE 721.1 ,
Minimum Horizontal Distance Required from Building Sewer (feet)
Water supply wells See ML.R. Chapter 47251
Building supply 1_0Z

For SI units: 1 foot = 304.8 mm

Notes:

! The minimum horizontal setback distance between a building sewer and a water supply

well is governed by Minnesota Rules, chapter 4725.

% Unless otherwise permitted by the Administrative Authority and when installed in

accordance with Section 720.0.

4714.0722 ABANDONED SEWERS AND SEWAGE DISPOSAL FACILITIES.
UPC sections 722.0 to 722.5 are deleted in their entirety.

4714.0723 BUILDING SEWER TEST.

UPC section 723.1 is amended to read as follows:

723.1 General. Building sewers shall be tested by plugging the end of the building sewer

at its points of connection with the public sewer or private sewage disposal system and

completely filling the building sewer with water from the lowest to the highest point

thereof, or by approved equivalent low-pressure air test. Testing of building sewers shall

be in accordance with Section 712 xThe building sewer shall be gastight or watertight.

36.23

36.24

36.25

- ﬁ J as GJ’YI”]M,
4714.0724 RECREATIONAL VEHICLE SANITARY DISPOSAL STATION.

UPC chapter 7 is amended by adding the following sections:

724.0 Recreational Vehicle Sanitary Disposal Station.

4714.0724 36



371

37.2

37.3

374

375

37.6

377

37.8

379

37.10

37.11

37.12

37.13

37.14

37.15

37.16

37.17

37.18

37.19

37.20

37.21

37.22

37.23

37.24

37.25

37.26

37.27

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

724.1 Construction. Each recreational vehicle sanitary disposal (dump) station shall have

a concrete slab with the drainage system located as to be on the road (left) side of the

recreational vehicle. The slab shall be not Jess than 3 feet by 3 feet (914 mm by 914 mm),
not less than 3-1/2 inches (89 mm) thick, and properly reinforced. The slab surface shall

be troweled to a smooth finish and sloped from each side inward to a drainage system inlet.

The drainage system inlet shall consist of a 4-inch (102 mm), self-closing,

foot-operated hatch of materials meeting these rules with the cover milled to fit tight. The

hatch body shall be set in the concrete of the slab with the lip of the opening flush with

its surface to facilitate the cleansing of the slab with water. The hatch shall be properly

connected to a drainage system inlet, which shall discharge to a public or private sewer

meeting the standards of this section.

724.2 Flushing Device. The recreational vehicle sanitary disposal station flushing device

shall consist of a supported riser terminating not less than 2 feet (610 mm) above the

ground surface, with a 3/4-inch (20 mm) valved outlet adaptable for a flexible hose. The

flexible hose shall be designed such that it cannot lie on the ground. The water supply to

the flushing device shall be protected from backflow by means of a listed vacuum breaker

or backflow prevention device located downstream from the last shutoff valve.

Adjacent to the recreational vehicle sanitary disposal station shall be posted a sign of

durable material not less than 2 feet by 2 feet (610 mm by 610 mm) in size. Inscribed on
the sign in clearly legible letters shall be the following:
"DANGER - NOT TO BE USED FOR DRINKING OR DOMESTIC PURPOSES."

4714.0801 INDIRECT WASTES.

Subpart 1. Section 801.2.2. UPC section 801.2.2.is amended to read as follows:

801.2.2 Walk—Ili Coolers. Floor drains shall not be located inside walk-in coolers

unless they are specifically required by the licensing authority. Where required,

floor drains shall be connected to a separate drainage line discharging into an

outside receptor. The flood-level rim of the receptor shall not be less than 6 inches

4714.0801 37



http:PURPOSES.11

38.1

38.2

383

384

38.5

38.6

38.7

38.8

389

38.10

38.11

38.12

38.13

38.14

38.15

38.16

38.17

38.18

38.19

38.20

38.21

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

(152 mm) lower than the lowest floor drain. The floor drains shall be trapped and

individually vented. Cleanouts shall be proyided at 90 degree (1.57 rad) turns and

shall be accessibly located. The waste shall discharge through an air gap or air break

into a trapped and vented receptor, except that a full-size air gap is required where

the indirect waste pipe is under vacuum.

Subp. 2. Section 801.2.3. UPC section 801.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

801.2.3 Food-Handling Fixtures. Cooking rangeé, steam kettles, potato peelers,

ice cream dipper wells, and similar equipment shall be indirectly connected to the

drainage system by means of an air gap. Bins, cooling counters, compartments, and

other equipment having drainage connections and used for the storage of unpackaged

ice used for human ingestion, or used in direct contact with ready-to-eat food, shall be

indirectly connected to the drainage system by means of an air gap. Each indirect waste

pipe from fo'od—hand]jng fixtures, storage or holding compartments, or equipment shall

be separately trapped and piped to the indirect waste receptor and shall not combine

with other indirect waste pipes. The piping from the equipment to the receptor shall

be not less than the drain on the unit, and in no case less than 3/4 inch (20 mm).

Subp. 3. Section 801.3. UPC section 801.3 is deleted in its entirety.

4714.0804 INDIRECT WASTE RECEPTORS.

UPC section 804 is amended by adding the following subsection:

804.2 Domestic or Culinary Type Fixtures Prohibited as.Receptors. No plumbing

fixture that is used for domestic or culinary purposes shall be used to receive the discharge

- T ' ) EXC'&P "'7' n s . . . .
of an indirect Wasteﬁgomestlc us Ulshwashers may discharge into a sink, or discharge to

38.23

3824

38.25

a sink tailpiece or food-waste grinder when installed in accordance with Section §07.4.

4714.0813 SWIMMING POOLS.

UPC section 813.1 is amended to read as follows:

4714.0813 38



39.1

393

39.4
39.5

39.6
39.7
39.8
399
39.10

39.11

39.13
39.14
39.15

39.16
39.17
39.18
39.19
39.20

39.21

39.22

39.23

39.24

39.25

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

813.1 General. Pipes carrying wastewater from swimming or wading pools, including pool

drainage and backwash from filters, sselading water from scum gutter drains and pool deck

~ drains, shall be installed as an indirect waste. Where a pump is used to discharge waste pool

water to the drainage system, the pump discharge shall be installed as an indirect waste.

4714.0814 CONDENSATE WASTES AND CONTROL.

Subpart 1. Section 814.1. UPC section 814.1 is amended to read as follows:

814.1 Condensate Disposal. Condensate from air washers, air-cooling coils, fuel-burning

condensing appliances, the overflow from evaporative coolers, and similar water-supplied

equipment or similar air-conditioning equipment shall be collected and discharged to an

approved plumbing fixture or disposal area. Where discharged into the drainage system,

equipment shall drain by means of an indirect waste pipe. The waste pipe shall have a

slope of not less than 1/8 inch per sguaze-foot (10.4 mm/m) or 1 percent slope and shall be

made of an approved corrosion-resistant material.

Subp. 2. Table 814.1. UPC Table 814.1 is deleted.

Subp. 3. Section 814.2. UPC section 814.2 is deleted in its entirety.

Subp. 4. Section 814.3. UPC section 814.3 is amended to read as follows:

814.3 Point of Discharge. Air-conditioning condensate waste pipes shall connect

indirectly to the interior drainage system through an air gap or air break to: (1) properly

trapped and vented recepfors; (2) the tailpiece of an approved plumbing fixture; or (3) an

exterior place of disposal approved by the Minnesota Pollution Control Agency.

Condensate waste shall not drain over a public way or in areas causing a nuisance.

4714.0902 VENTS NOT REQUIRED.
UPC section 902.2 is deleted in its entirety.

4714.0903 MATERITALS,

UPC section 903.1 is amended to read as follows:

4714.0903 39




40.1
402
403
404
40.5

40.6

40.7
40.8
40.9
40.10
40.11
40.12

40.13
40.14

40.15
40.16

40.17

40.18
40.19
40.20
40.21
40.22

40.23

40.24
40.25

40.26

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

903.1 Applicable Standards. Vent pipes and fittings shall comply with the applicable

standards referenced in Table 701.1, except that:

(1) Galvanized steel or 304 stainless steel pipe shall not be installed underground and shall

be not less than 6 inches (152 mm) aboveground.

(2) ABS and PVC DWY piping installations shall be in accordance with the applicable

standards referenced in Table 1401.1.

4714.0905 VENT PIPE GRADES AND CONNECTIONS.

UPC section 905.3 is amended to read as follows:

905.3 Vent Pipe Rise. Except as provided elsewhere in this code, each vent shall rise

vertically to a point not less than 6 inches (152 mm) above the flood-level rim of the fixture

served before offsetting horizontally, and where two or more vent pipes converge, each

such vent pipe shall rise to a point not less than 6 inches (152 mm) in height above the

flood-level rim of the plumbing fixture it serves before being connected to any other vent.

4714.0906 VENT TERMINATION.

Subpart 1. Section 906.1. UPC section 906.1 is amended to read as follows:

906.1 Roof Termination. Each vent pipe or stack shall extend through its flashing and

shall terminate vertically not less than 12 inches (305 mm) above the roof.

Subp. 2. Section 906.3. UPC section 906.3 is amended to read as follows:

906.3 Use of Roof. Vent pipes shall be extended separately or combined and of full

required size, not less than 12 inches (305 mm) above the roof. Flagpoling of vents shall

be prohibited except where the roof is used for purposes other than weather protection.

Vents within 10 feet (3,048 mm) of a part of the roof that is used for such other purposes

shall extend not less than 7 feet (2,134 mm) above the roof and shall be securely stayed.

Subp. 3. Section 906.7. UPC section 906.7 is amended to read as follows:

906.7 Frost or Snow Closure. Vent terminals shall be not less than 2 inches (50 mm) in

diameter and shall not be smaller than the required vent pipe. Any change in diameter

4714.0906 40



41.1

41.2

413
414
415
41.6
41.7
4138
419

41.10

T 4111

4112 -

41.13
41.14
41;15
41.16

41.17

41.18

41.19

41.20

41.21

4122

41.23

41.24

41.25

10/07/14 : REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

shall be made inside the building not less than 12 inches (305 mm) below the roof in an

insulated space and terminate not less than 12 inches (305 mm) above the roof.

4714.1001 TRAPS REQUIRED.

UPC section 1001.1 is amended to read as follows:

1001.1 Where Required. Each plumbing fixture shall be separately trapped by an

approved type of liquid seal trap. This section shall not apply to fixtures with integral

traps. Not more than one trap shall be permitted on a trap arm. Food waste disposal units

installed with a set of restaurant, commercial, or industrial sinks shall be connected to

a separate trap. Each domestic clothes washer and each laundry tub shall be connected

to a separate and independent trap, except that a laundry tub shall be permitted to also

receive the waste from a clothes washer set adjacent thereto. The vertical distance

between a fixture outlet and the trap weir shall be as short as practicable, but in no case

shall the tailpiece from a fixture exceed 24 inches (610 mm) in length. One trap shall be

permitted to serve a set of not more than three single compartment sinks or laundry tubs

of the same depth or three lavatories immediately adjacent to each other and in the same

room where the waste outlets are not more than 30 inches (762 mm) apart and the trap is

centrally located where the three compartments are installed.

4714.1007 TRAP SEAL PROTECTION.
UPC section 1007 is deleted in its entirety.

4714.1008 BUILDING TRAPS.
UPC section 1008 is deleted in its entirety.

4714.1009 INDUSTRIAL INTERCEPTORS (CLARIFIERS) AND SEPARATORS.
UPC section 1009.2 is amended to read as follows:

1009.2 Approval. The size, type, and location of each interceptor (clarifier) or separator

shall meet the requirements of this chapter.

4714.1009 41




42.1
4.2
423
424
425

42.6

42.7
428
42.9
42.10
42,11

42.12

42.13

42.14

4215

42.16

42.17

42.18

42,19

42.20

4221

4222

42.23

4224

4225

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RDA4139

Exception: Interceptors or separators that are engineered and manufactured and are

documented by the manufacturer and the project registered professibnal engineer

to be properly designed and sized for the specific project, and are approved by the

Authority Having Jurisdiction.

No wastes other than those requiring treatment or separation shall be discharged into an

interceptor (clarifier) or separator unless specifically permitted elsewhere in this code.

4714.1010 SLAUGHTERHOUSES, PACKING ESTABLISHMENTS, ETC.

" UPC section 1010.1 is amended to read as follows:

1010.1 Slaughterhouses. Slaughtering and dressing room drains shall be equipped with

separators or interceptors approved by the administrative authority, which shall prevent

the discharge into the drainage system of feathers, entrails, or other material likely to

clog the drainage system.

4714.1014 GREASE INTERCEPTORS.
UPC section 1014.3.7 is amended to read as follows:

1014.3.7 Abandoned Gravity Grease Interceptors. Abandoned gravity grease

interceptors shall be pumped and filled as required by the Authority Having

Jurisdiction.

4714.1101 GENERAL.

Subpart 1. Section 1101.1. UPC section 1101.1 is amended to read as follows:

1101.1 Where Required. Roofs, paved areas, yards, courts, courtyards, vent shafts, light

wells, or similar areas having rainwater, shall be drained into a separate storm sewer system

or into a combined sewer system where a separate storm sewer system is not available, or

to some other place of disposal satisfactory to the Authority Having Jurisdiction. In the

case of one- and two—fanﬁly dwellings, storm water shall be permitted to be discharged on

flat areas, such as lawns, so long as the storm water shall flow away from the building and

4714.1101 42



oL

433

43.4

43.6

43.7
43.8
439
43.10

43.11

43.12

43.13

43.14

43.15

43.16

43.17

43,18

43.19

43.20

43.21

4322

43.23

43.24

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

away from adjoining property and shall not create a nuisance. In no case shalljwater from
D 7™ a4 bulldi auner
roofs or any building roof drainagesse-slowed-to ﬂowz.pe& the public sidewalk, e, Aesigner

wnbwing ly o
iw\::\mi\y allow

Subp. 2. Section 1101.2. UPC section 1101.2 is amended to read as follows:

1101.2 Storm Water Drainage to Sanitary Sewer Prohibited. Storm water shall not be

drained into sewers intended for sanitary drainage unless approved by the municipal sewer

authority or stated elsewhere in this code.

Subp. 3. Section 1101.3. UPC section 1101.3 is amended to read as follows:

1101.3 Material Uses. Rainwater piping placed within the interior of a building or run

within a vent or shaft shall be of cast-iron, galvanized steel, wrought iron, brass, copper,

lead, Schedule 40 ABS DWV, Sche_:dule 40 PVC DWYV, stainless steel 304 or 316L

[stainless steel 304 pipe and fittings shall not be installed underground and shall be kept

not less than 6 inches (152 mm) aboveground], or other approved materials. Changes

in direction shall be in accordance with Section 706.0. ABS and PVC DWYV piping

installations shall be installed in accordance with IS 5 and IS 9.

Subp. 4. Section 1101.11. UPC section 1101.11 is amended to read as follows:
1101.11 Roof Drainage.

1101.11.1 Primary Roof Drainage. When roof areas of a building are drained

by roof drains, the location and sizing of the drains shall be coordinated with the

structural design and pitch of the roof in accordance with section 1106 or as permitted

elsewhere in this code. The roof drainage system shall be sized on a basis of a rate of

rainfall of at minimum 4 inches per hour.

1101.11.2 Secondary Drainage. Secondary (emergency) roof drainage shall be

provided in accordance with Minnesota Rules, chapter 1305.
UPC Table 1101.11 is not amended.

4714.1101 43




441

443
444
44.5
44.6

447

44.8

449

44.10
44.11
44.12
44.13
4414
44.15
44.16
44.17
44.18
44.19
44.20
4421
4420,
44.23
4404

4425

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

Subp. 5. Sections 1101.11.2.1, 1101.11.2.2, 1101.2.2 (A), and 1101.11.2.2 (B).
UpC subsections 1101.11.2.1, 1101.11.2.2, 1101.11.2.2 (A), and 1101.11.2.2 (B) are

deleted in their entirety.

4714.1106 SIZE OF LEADERS, CONDUCTORS, AND STORM DRAINS.

UPC section 1106.3 is amended to read as follows:

1106.3 Reduction in Size Prohibited. Except for siphonic roof drainage systems, storm

drain piping shall not reduce in size in the direction of flow, including changes in direction

from horizontal to vertical.

4714.1108 CONTROLLED-FLOW ROOF DRAINAGE.

UPC section 1108.1 is amended to read as follows:

1108.1 Application. The controlled-flow roof drainage system shall be sized on the basis

of controlled flow and storage of the storm water on the roof, provided the design is based

on a minimum of 4 inches per hour and the following conditions are met:

(1) The water from a 25-year-frequency storm shall not be stored on the roof for more

than 24 hours.

(2) During the storm, the water depth on the roof shall not exceed the depths specified

in Table 1108.1 (2).

(3) Not less than two drains shall be installed in roof areas of 10,000 square feet (929 mz)
or less, and not less than one additional drain shall be installed for each additional 10,000

square feet (929 mz) or less of roof area.

(4) Each roof drain shall have a precalibrated, fixed (nonadjustable), and proportional

weir (notched) in a standing water collar inside the strainer. No mechanical devices or
valves shall be allowed.
(5) Pipe sizing shall be based on the precalibrated rate of flow (gpm) (L/s) of the

precalibrated weir for the maximum allowable water depth, and Tables 1101.7 and 1101.11.

4714.1108 44



45.1
452
453
45.4
455
45.6
457
45.8
459
45.10
45.11
45,12
| 45.13
45.14
45.15

45.16

45.17

45.18

4520
45.21
45.22

4523

4524
4525

4526

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RDA4139

(6) The height of stones or other granular material above the waterproofed surface shall

not be considered in water depth measurement, and the roof surface in the vicinity of the

drain shall not be recessed to create a reservoir,

(7) Roof design, where controlled-flow roof drainage is used, shall be such that the design

roof live load is not less than 40 1b/ftz;

(8) Scuppers shall be provided in parapet walls. The distance of scupper bottoms above the

rooflevel at the drains shall not exceed the maximum distances specified in Table 1108.1(8).

(9) Scupper openings shall be not less than 4 inches (102 mm) high and have a width equal

to the circumference of the roof drain required for the area served, sized in accordance

with Table 1101.11.

(10) Flashings shall extend above the top of the scuppers.

(11) At a wall or parapet, 45-degree (0.79 rad) cants shall be installed.

(12) Separate storm and sanitary drainage systems shall be provided within the building.

(13) Calculations for the roof drainage system shall be submitted, along with the plans, to

the Authority Having Jurisdiction for approval.
UPC Table 1108.1(2) and Table 1108.1(8) are not amended.

4714.1109 TESTING.

Subpart 1. Section 1109.1. UPC section 1109.1 is amended to read as follows:

1109.1 Testing Required.¥¥cw Building storm drainage systems¥and parts of existing

systems that have been altered, extended, or repaired shall be tested in accordance with

section 712 to disclose leaks and defects, except as provided in section 1109.2. Any

section of the building storm sewer that passes through contaminated soils or contaminated

water must be air tested in accordance with section 712.3.

.Subp. 2. Section 1109.2. UPC section 1109.2 is amended to read as follows:
1109.2 Exceptions.

1109.2.1 Testing is not required for:

4714.1109 45




46.1

46.2

46.3

46.4

46.5

46.6

46.7

46.8

46.9

46.10

4611 -

46,12

46.13

46.14

46.15

46.16

46.17

46.18

46.19

4620

46.21

46.22

46.23

46.24

46.25

46.26

46.27

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

(1) outside leaders; .

(2) perforated or open drain tile; or

(3) portions of storm drainage system and sewers that are located more than ten feet

from buildings, more than ten feet from buried water lines, and more than 50 feet from

water wells, and that do not pass through soil or water identified as being contaminated.

1109.2.2 Building storm sewers shall be tested in accordance with section 712 or the

Hydrostatic Test Method from the City Engineers Association of Minnesota. The

Hydrostatic Test Method, provisions E2 and E3, as specified in Standard Utilities

Specifications for Watermain and Service Line Installation and Sanitary Sewer and

Storm Sewer Installation, written and published by the City Engineers Association

of Minnesota, 2013 edition, is incorporated by reference, is not subject to frequent

change, and is available in the office of the commissioner of labor and industry.

4714.1110 SIPHONIC ROOF DRAINAGE SYSTEM.

UPC chapter 11 is amended by adding a new section and subsections as follows:

1110.0 Siphonic Roof Drainage System.

1110.1 General Requirements. Siphonic roof drainage systems shall be designed as an

engineered siphonic roof drainage system when allowed by the administrative authority.

The engineered siphonic roof drainage system shall meet the requirements of Sections

1110.2 and 1110.3.

1110.2 Design Criteria. The siphonic roof drainage system shall be designed and certified

by a registered professional engineer.

1110.2.1 Sizing. The system shall be sized on the basis of a minimum rate of rainfall

of 4 inches per hour.

1110.2.2 Design. The drainage system shall be designed according to ASPE Standard

45, Siphonic Roof Drainage, and according to the manufacturer's recommendations

and requirements. Manufacturer design software shall be in accordance with ASPE

Standard 45.

4714.1110 46



10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI ~ RD4139

47.1 1110.2.3 Roof drain bodies. Roof drains shall meet ASME A112.6.9, Siphonic

472 Roof Drains.

473 1110.2.4 Water accumulation. When designed for water aCcumulation, the roof shall
474 be designed for the maximum possible water accumulation according to Section

415 1108.1 (7), as amended in this code, and Minnesota Rules, chapter 1305,

47.6 1110.2.5 Pipe size and cleanouts. Minimum pipe size shall be 1-1/2 inches. All pipe
47.7 sizes and cleanouts in the drainage system shall be designed and installed according
47.8 to ASPE Standard 45. |

479 1110.2.6 Horizontal pipes. Horizontal pipe size shall not reduce in the direction of
47.10 flow.

47.11 1110.2.7 Plans and specifications. The plans and specifications for the drainage
47.12 system shall indicate the siphonic roof drainage system as an engineered method
47.13 used for the design.

47.14 1110.2.8 Markings. The installed drainage system shall be permanently and

4715 continuously marked as a siphonic roof drainage system at approved intervals and
47.16 clearly at points where piping passes through walls and floors. Roof drains shall be
47.17 marked in accordance with ASME A112.6.9. '

47.18 1110.2.9 Transition locations. The transition locations from the siphonic roof

47.19 drainage system to a gravity system shall be determined by the registered professional
4720  engineer at a location approved by the administrative authority. The design, sizing,
4721 and venting of the transition location shall be in accordance with ASPE Standard 45.
4722 The velocity at the transition location to gravity shall be reduced to less than three |
4723 feet per second. The gravity portion of the building storm sewer system receiving the
4724 siphonic roof drainage system shall be sized for the design rate but not less than a
4725 rainfall rate of 4 inches per hour and in accordance with Section 1106.0.

4726 1110.2.10 Required submissions. All plans, specifications, and calculations shall
4727 be signed and sealed by the registered professional engineer and submitted to the

4714.1110 47



http:1110.2.10

10/07/14 REVISOR : SS/DI RD4139

48.1 | administrative authority. The submitted calculations shall include performance
482 data for the drainage system for the required rainfall rate, including the minimum
483 and maximum calculated operating pressures and velocities verifying that the

48.4 design solution is within the operating parameters required by the design standard.
48.5 All performance data shall be reported as the extreme maximum and minimum
48.6 calculations and shall not be presented as averaged data.

48.7 1110.3 Proof of Suitability. Upon completion of the project: proper tests, inspections,'

48.8 and certification of the siphonic roof drainage system shall be performed according

489  to items 1110.3.1 and 1110.3.2:

48.10 1110.3.1 Testing. Testing shall be performed according to ASPE Standard 45.

48.11 1110.3.2 Written certification. Prior to the final plumbing inspection, the registered
48.12 professional engineer shall provide written certification to the administrative authority
48.13 that the system has been visually inspected by the registered professional engineer or
48.14 the registered professional engineer's designee and the installation has been properly
48.15 implemented according to the certified design, plans, calculations, and specifications.
48.16 The submitted written certification shall include any field modification from the

4817 - initial design involving dimensions, location, or routing of the siphonic roof drainage
48.18 system that shall be reapproved and recertified by the registered professional engineer
48.19 and be accompanied by a final as-built design of the altered system and supported
48.20 by calculated data to show that the overall system remains in accordance with ASPE

4821 Standard 45.

4822  4714.1401 REFERENCED STANDARDS.

48.23 Table 1401.1 is amended to add the following:

48.24 ASPE Standard 45, Siphonic Roof Drainage, and applies to roof drainage referenced
4825  insections 1110.2.5, 1110.2.9, 1110.3.1, and 1110.3.2.

48.26 ASTM Standards C1214-13 referenced in section 712.4.

48.27 ASTM Standards C1244-11 referenced in section 712.4.

|APMO 188 1SS, Pipeless Whirlpoo! Bativtub Aﬁ,tiwws

4714.1401 ' 48


http:Arfti4.A!t.es

49.1

49.2

49.3

49.4

49.5

49.6

49.7

49.8

49.9

49.10

49.11

49.12

49.13

49.14

49.15

49.16

49.17

49.18

49,19

49.20

4921

49.22

49.23

49.24

49.25

49.26

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

Standard Utilities Specifications for water main and service line installation and

sanitary sewer and storm sewer installation referenced in section 1109.2.2.

47141701 GENERAL.
UPC section 1701.1 is amended to read as follows:

1701.1 Applicability. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to the installation,

construction, alteration, and repair of rainwater catchment systems for nonpotable

applications listed in Section 1702.1.

1701.1.1 Irrigation. Rainwater catchment systems used for lawn irrigation are not

covered under this chapter.

1701.1.2 Combination Systems. Rainwater catchment systems used for lawn

irrigation in combination with any uses listed in Section 1702.1 shall meet the

requirements of this chapter. The irrigation system shall be separated by an air gap or

proper backflow protection as required for potable water.

4714.1702 NONPOTABLE RAINWATER CATCHMENT SYSTEMS.

Subpart 1. Section 1702.1. UPC section 1702.1 is amended to read as follows:

1702.1 General. The installation, construction, alteration, and repair of rainwater

catchment systems intended to supply uses such as water closets, urinals, trap primers for

floor drains and floor sinks, industrial processes,'water features, vehicle washing facilities,

cooling tower makeup, and similar uses shall be approved by the commissionet.

Subp.' 2. Section 1702.2. UPC section 1702.2 is amended to read as follows:

1702.2 Plumbing Plan Submission. No permit for a rainwater catchment system shall

be issued until complete plumbing plans have been submitted and approved by the

commissioner in accordance with Minnesota Rules, part 1300.0215, subpart 6.

Subp. 3. Section 1702.4. UPC section 1702.4 is amended to read as follows:

1702.4 Connections to Potable or Reclaimed (Recycled) Water Systems. Rainwater

catchment systems shall have no direct connection to a potable water supply or alternate

47141702 49




50.1
50.2
50.3
504
50.5

50.6

50.7
50.8

50.9

50.11

-50.12

50.13
50.14
50.15
50.16
50.17
50.18
50.19
50.20
5021
50,22
50.23
50.24
50.25
50.26

50.27

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

water source system. Potable or reclaimed (recycled) water is permitted to be used

as makeup water for a rainwater catchment system provided the potable or reclaimed

(recycled) water supply connection is protected by an air gap or reduced-pressure principle

backflow preventer in accordance with this code. An automatic means to supply the

rainwater catchment system with makeup water shall be installed when there is insufficient

rainwater to meet the required demand or due to system failure.

Subp. 4. Section 1702.5. UPC section 1702.5 is amended to read as follows:

1702.5 Initial Cross-Connection Test. Where a portion of a rainwater catchment system

is installed within a building, a cross-connection test is required in accordance with

Section 1702.11.2. Before the building is occupied or the system is activated, the plumbing
S~

as amended . ) , )
contractor shall pe/rfonn the initial cross-connection test in the presence of the Authority

Having Jurisdiction. The test shall be ruled successful before final approval is granted.

Subp. 5. Section 1702.7. UPC section 1702.7 is amended to read as follows:

1702.7 Rainwater Catchment System Materials. Rainwater catchment system materials

shall comply with Sections 1702.7.1 through 1702.7.4.

1702.7.1 Water Supply and Distribution Materials. Rainwater catchment water

supply and distribution materials shall comply with Chapter 6, as amended in this

code, and the requirements of this code for potable water supply and distribution

systems, unless otherwise provided for in this section.

1702.7.2 Rainwater Catchment System Drainage Materials. Materials used in

rainwater catchment drainage systems, including gutters, downspouts, conductors,

and leaders shall be in accordance with Chapter 11, as amended in this code, and the

requirements of this code for storm drainage.

1702.7.3 Storage Tanks. Rainwater storage tanks shall comply with Section

1702.9.5, as amended in this code.

1702.7.4 Collection Surfaces. The collection surface shall be constructed of a hard,

impervious material.

4714.1702 50



10/07/14 : REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

51.1 Subp. 6. Section 1702.9. UPC section 1702.9.3 is amended to read as follows:

512 1702.9.3 Collection Surfaces. Rainwater catchment systems shall collect rainwater
513 only from roof surfaces. Rainiwater catchment systems shall not collect rainwater from:
51.4 (1) vehicular parking surfaces;

51.5 (2) surface Wéter runoff;

51,6 (3) bodies of standing water; or

517 (4) similar nonroof surfaces.

51.8 1702.9.3.1 Prohibited Discharges. Overflows and bleed-off pipes from roof-mounted
519 equipment and appliances, condensate, and other waste disposal shall not discharge

onto roof surfaces that are-intended-for rainwater catchment systems.
“eollect reumnaier

5111 Subp. 7. Section 1702.9. UPC section 1702.9.4 is amended to read as follows:

51.12 1702.9.4 Minimum Water Quality. The minimum water quality for rainwater

51.13  catchment systems shall meet the applicable water quality recommendations in Table
51.14 1702.9.4.

51,15 Subp. 8. Section 1702.9.4. UPC section 1702.9.4 is amended by adding the

5116  following table:

51.17 \ TABLE 1702.9.4
5118  Measure Limit
51.19  Turbidity (NTU) <1
5120  E. coli (MPN/100 mL) 2.2
5121 Odor Non-offensive
5122  Temperature (degrees Celsius) MR
5123 Color : MR
5124 pH ’ MR

5125 MR = measured and recorded only

51.26  Treatment:

5127 Minimum 5 micron absolute filter |

4714.1702 , 51




52.1

523

524

52.5

52.6

52.7

52.8

52.9

52.10

52.11

52.12

52.14

52.15

52.16

52.17

52.18

52.19

52.20

52.21

52.22

5223

52.24

5225

5226

10/07/14 - REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

Minimum .5-log inactivation of viruses

Subp. 9. Section 1702.9.5. UPC section 1702.9.5;is amended to read as follows:
“Bul “e 1

1702.9.5.1 Construction. Rainwater storage shall be constructed of solid,

durable materials not subject to excessive corrosion or decay, watertight, and

suitable for rainwater storage.

Subp. 10. Section 1702.9.5. UPC section 1702.9.5.6 (A) is amended to read as

follows:

1702.9.5.6 (A) Animals and Insects. Rainwater tank openings shall be protected

to prevent the entrance of insects, birds, or rodents into the tank and piping

system. Screen installed on vent pipes, inlets, and overflow pipes shall be

corrosion-resistant and have an aperture of not greater than 1/16 inch (1.6 mm)

and shall be close-fitting. by ads a
A Nenw swbs =i on

Subp. 11. Section 1702.9.5. UPC section 1702.9.5/8 is amended +e-tead as follows:

1702.9.5.8 Storage Tank Venting. A vent shall be installed on each tank. The

vent shall extend from the top of the tank and terminate a minimum of 12

inches above grade, shall be a minimum of 1~1/2 inches in diameter, and shall

be turned downward.

Subp. 12. Section 1702.9.6. UPC section 1702.9.6 is amended to read as follows:

1702.9.6 Pumps. Pumps serving rainwater catchment systems shall be listed.

Pumps supplying water to water closets, urinals, and trap primers shall be capable

of delivering not less than 15 pounds-force per square inch (psi) (103 kPa) residual

pressure at the highest and most remote outlet served. Where the water pressure in

the rainwater supply system within the building exceeds 80 psi (552 kPa), a listed

pressure-reducing valve reducing the pressure to 80 psi (552 kPa) or less to water

outlets in the building shall be installed in accordance with this code.

Subp. 13. Section 1702.9.7. UPC section 1702.9.7 is amended to read as follows:

47141702 52



- 10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DIL RD4139

531 1702.9.7 Roof Drains. Primary and secondary roof drain systems shall be designed
532 and installed in accordance with Chapter 11, as amended in this code. Secondary roof
53.3 drains shall be equipped with a working alarm.

534 Subp. 14. Section 1702.9.8. UPC section 1702.9.8 is amended to read as follows:
53.5 1702.9.8 Water Quality Devices and Equipment. The rainwater catchment system
53.6 shall include filtration aﬁd disinfection to maintain the minimum water quality

53.7- requirements in Table 1702.9.4. At a minimum, a 5-micron absolute filter shall be
53.8 provided along with disinfection to provide a 0.5-log inactivation of viruses. Devices
53.9 and equipment used to treat rainwater shall be suitable for rainwater catchment

5310 system applications, properly designed, sized, and documented for the specific project
53.11 by a Minnesota registered professional engineer.

53.12 Subp. 15. Sections 1702.9.11 and 1702.9.12. UPC sectjons 1702.9.11 and 1702.9.12

5313  are deleted in their entirety.

53.14 Subp. 16. Section 1702.10. UPC section 1702.10.1 is amended to read as follows:
53.15 1702.10.1 Commercial, Industrial, and Institutional Restroom Signs. A sign shall
53.16 be installed in restrooms in commetrcial, industrial, and institutional occupancies
53.17 using nonpotable rainwater for water closets, urinals, or both. Each sign shall contain
53.18 1/2-inch (12.7 mm) letters of a highly visible color on a contrasting background. The
53.19 location of the sign(s) shall be such that the sign(s) shall be visible to users. Bach sign
53.20 shall contain one of the following texts as determined by the a‘éplication:

5321 1702.10.1 (A) TO CONSERVE WATER, THIS BUILDING USES RAINWATER
53.22 TO FLUSH TOILETS AND URINALS.

53.23 1702.10.1 (B) TO CONSERVE WATER, THIS BUILDING USES RAINWATER
53.24 TO FLUSH TOILETS.

5325 1702.10.1 (C) TO CONSERVE WATER, THIS BUILDING USES RAINWATER
53.26 ~ TO FLUSH URINALS. ’

4714.1702 53



http:1702.9.11and1702.9.12
http:1702.9.11and1702.9.12

54.1

54.2

543

54.4

54.5

54.6

54.7

54.8

54.9

54.10

54.11

54,12

54.13

54.14

54.15

54.16

54.17

54.18

54.19

54.20

54.21

5422

54.23

54.24

5425

54.26

54.27

10/07/14

REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

1702.10.1 (D) TO CONSERVE WATER, THIS BUILDING USES RAINWATER
TO *® *

* * shall indicate the rainwater usage.

Subp. 17. Section 1702.11. UPC section 1702.11.2 is amended to read as follows:

1702.11.2 Cross-Connection Inspection and Testing. An initial and subsequent

annual inspection and test in accordance with Section 1702.5 shall be performed

on both the potable water system and rainwater catchment water systems. The

potable and rainwater catchment water systems shall be isolated from each other

and independently inspected and tested to ensure there is no cross-connection in

accordance with Sections 1702.11.2.1 through 1702.11.2.4.

1702.11.2.1 Visual System Inspection. Prior to commencing the

cross-connection testing and annually thereafter, a dual system inspection shall

be conducted as follows:

Pumps, equipment, equipment room signs, and exposed piping in an equipment

room shall be inspected for visible cross-connections, proper operation, and

damage.
1702.11.2.2 Cross-Connection Test. The following procedure shall be followed

by the plumbing contractor in the presence of the Authority Having Jurisdiction

to determine whether a cross-connection has occurred:

(1) The potable water system shall be activated and pressurized. The rainwater

catchment water system shall be shut down and completely drained.

(2) The potable water system shall remain pressurized while the rainwater

catchment water system is completely drained. The minimum period the

rainwater catchment water system is to remain completely drained shall be

determined based on the size and complexity of the potable water system and

rainwater catchment water distribution system, but in no case shall that period

be less than one hour.

4714.1702 54



55.1
55.2
55.3
554
55.5
55.6
55.7
55.8
55.9
55.10
55.11
55.12
55.13
55.14
55.15
55.16
55.17
55.18
55.19
55.20
5521
55.22
55.23
5524
55.25
55.26

55.27

10/07/14

REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

(3) Fixtures, potable water, and rainwater, shall be tested and inspected

for flow. Flow from a rainwater catchment water system outlet indicates

a cross-connection. No flow from a potable water outlet indicates that it is

connected to the rainwater catchment water system.

(4) The drain on the rainwater catchment water system shall be checked for flow

during the test and at the end of the testing period.

(5) The potable water system shall then be completely drained.

(6) The rainwater catchment water system shall then be activated and ] pressurized.

(7) The rainwater catchment water system shall remain pressurized for a

minimum time specified by the Authority Having Jurisdiction while the potable

water system is completely drained. The minimum period the potable water

system is to remain completely drained shall be based on the size and complexity

of the potable water system and rainwater catchment water distribution system

but in no case shall that period be less than one hour.

(8) Fixtures, potable and rainwater catchment, shall be tested and inspected for

flow. Flow from a potable water system outlet indicates a cross-connection.

No flow from a rainwater catchment water outlet indicates that it is connected

to the potable water system.

(9) The drain on the potable water system shall be checked for flow during the

test and at the end of the testing period.

(10) Where there is no flow detected in the fixtures that would indicate a

cross-connection, the potable water system shall be repressurized.

1702.11.2.3 Discovery of Cross-Connection. In the event that a cross-connection

is discovered, the following procedure, in the presence of the Authority Having

Jurisdiction, shall be activated immediately:

(1) Rainwater catchment water piping to the building shall be shut down at the

meter and the rainwater water riser shall be drained.

4714.1702 55




56.1

56.2

563

56.4

56.5

56.6

56.7

56.8

56.9

56.10
56.11
56.12
56.13
56.14

56.15

56.16
56.17
56.18
56.19
56.20
56.21
5622
56.23
‘56.24
56.25

56.26

10/07/14

REVISOR SS/DI RD4139

(2) Potable water piping to the building shall be shut down at the meter.

(3) The cross-connection shall be uncovered and disconnected.

(4) The building shall be retested following procedures listed in Sections
1702.11.2.1 and 1702.11.2.2.

(5) The potable water system shall be chlorinated with 50 ppm chlorine for 24

hours.

(6) The potable water system shall be flushed after 24 hours, and a standard

bacteriological test shall be performed. Where test results are acceptable, the

potable water system shall be permitted to be recharged.

1702.11.2.4 Inspection. An annual inspection of the rainwater catchment water

system, following the procedures in Section 1702.11.2.1, shall be required.

Cross-connection testing, following the procedures listed in Section 1702.11.2.2,

shall be required every five years.

Alternate testing requirements shall be permitted by the Authority Having

Jurisdiction.

Subp. 18. Section 1702. UPC section 1702 is amended by adding the following

section:

1702.12 Maintenance and Inspection. Rainwater catchment water systems and

components shall be inspected and maintained in accordance with Sections 1702.12.1

through 1702.12.3.

1702.12.1 Frequency. Rainwater catchment systems and components shall be

inspected and maintained in accordance with Table 1702.12 unless more frequent

inspection and maintenance is required by the manufacturer.

1702.12.2 Maintenance Log. A maintenance log for rainwater catchment systems is

required. The property owner or designated appointee shall ensure that a record of

testing, inspection, and maintenance in accordance with Table 1702.12 is maintained

4714.1702 56



57.1

57.2

573

574

57.5

57.6

57.7

57.8

57.9

57.10

57.11

57.12
57.13
57.14
57.15
57.16

57.17
57.18
57.19

57.20
57.21
57.22

57.23
57.24

57.25
57.26

57.27

. 57.28

57.29
57.30

10/07/14 REVISOR

SS/DI RD4139

in the log. The log shall indicate the frequency of inspection and maintenance for

each system.

1702.12.3 Maintenance Responsibility. The required operation, maintenance,

monitoring, testing, and inspection of rainwater catchment systems shall be the

responsibility of the property owner.

Subp. 19. Section 1702.12. UPC section 1702.12 is amended by adding the

following table:

TABLE 1702.12

Minimum Alternate Water Source Testing, Inspection, and Maintenance Frequency

Description

Inspect and clean filters and screens, and replace,

Minimum Frequency

Every three months.

Inspect and verify that required disinfection, filters,

After initia] installation and

and water quality treatment devices and systems are

monthly thereafter.

operational and maintaining minimum water quality

Exception: Every 12 months

requirements in Table 1702.9.4.

Inspect and clear debris from rainwater gutters,

downspouts, and roof washers.

thereafter when electronically
monitored.

At the beginning of seasonal
usage and rhonthly during
seasonal usage.

Inspect and clear debris from roof or other aboveground At the beginning of seasonal

rainwater collection surfaces.

usage and monthly during
seasonal usage.

Remove tree branches and vegetation overhanging roof As needed.

or other aboveground rainwater collection surfaces.

Inspect pumps and verify operation.

Inspect valves and verify operation.

Inspect pressure tanks and verify operation.

4714.1702

57

After initial installation and every ~
12 months thereafter.

- After initial installation and every

12 months thereatfter.

After initial installation and every
12 months thereafter. '




581
58.2

58.3
584

58.5
58.6
58.7

58.8

589

58.10
58.11
58.12
58.13
58.14
58.15
58.16
58.17
58.18
58.19

58.20

58.21
58.22
58.23
58.25
58.26

5827

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/Dr - RD4139

Clear debris from and inspect storage tanks and After initial installation and every
locking devices and verify operation. 12 months thereafter.
Inspect caution labels and marking. , After initial installation and every

12 months thereafter.

Cross-connection inspection and test.* After initial installation and
thereafter in accordance with
Section 1702.11.2.4.

*The cross-connection test shall be performed in accordance with this chapter by a plumber

licensed under Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.46, and certified to ASSE Standard 5120.

Subp. 20. Section 1702. UPC section 1702 is amended by adding a section as follows:

1702.13 Operation and Maintenance Manual. An operation and maintenance manual

for rainwater systems shall be supplied to the building owner by the system designer. The

operating and maintenance manual shall include the following:

(1) Detailed diagram of the entire system and the location of system components.

(2) Instructions on operating and maintaining the system.

(3) Details on maintaining the required water quality in Table 1702.9.4.

(4) Details on deactivating the system for maintenance, repair, or other purposes.

(5) Applicable testing, inspection, and maintenance frequencies in accordance with Table

1702.12.
(6) A method of contacting the manufacturer(s).

Subp. 21. Section 1702. UPC section 1702 is amended by adding the following

section:

1702.14 Separation Requirements. All underground rainwater service piping shall be

separated from the building sewer,in accordance with Section 609.2. Treated, nonpotable
A t \A

water pipes shall be permitted to bePrgnr(;?laid in the same trench as potable water pipes

with a 12-inch minimum vertical and horizontal separation when both pipe materials are

approved for use within a building. Where horizontal piping materials do not meet this

4714.1702 58



59.1

59.2

593

59.10

59.11

59.13
- 59.14

59.15

59.16
59.17
59.18
59.19
59.20
59.21
59.22
59.23
59.24
59.25
59.26

59.27

10/07/14 REVISOR SS/DI ‘ RDA4139

requirement, the minimum separation shall be increased to 60 inches. The potable water

piping shall be installed at an elevation above the treated-nonpotable water piping.

Subp. 22. Section 1702. UPC section 1702 is amended by adding the following

section:

1702.15 Abandonment. All rainwater catchment systems that are no longer in use and

fail to be maintained in accordance with Section 1702.12 shall be considered abandoned.

Abandoned rainwater catchment systems are subject to Sections 1702.15.1 and 1702.15.2.

1702.15.1 General. Every abandoned system or part thereof covered under the scope

o ) yaitnwaler catehinvent .
of this chapter, as amended in this code, shall be disconnected from any remaining

systems, drained, plugged, and capped per the requirements of this code.

1702.15.2 Underground Tank. Every underground water storage tank that has

been abandoned or otherwise dlscontmued from use in a,system covered under the

N rainwader, ca.-\-agv\mf
scope of this chapter, as amended in this code, shall be com J)letely dramed

filled with earth, sand, gravel, or concrete or removed in a manner approved by the

administrative authority.

REPEALER. Minnesota Rules, parts 4715.0100; 4715.0200; 4715.0300; 4715.0310;
4715.0320; 4715.0330; 4715.0340; 4715.0400; 4715.0410; 4715.0420; 4715.0500;
4715.0510; 4715.0520; 4715.0530; 4715.0540; 4715.0550; 4715.0560; 4715.0570;
4715.0580; 4715.0590; 4715.0600; 4715.0610; 4715.0620; 4715.0630; 4715.0640;
4715.0700; 4715.0710; 4715.0720; 4715.0730; 4715.0740; 4715.0750; 4715.0760;
4715.0770; 4715.0780; 4715.0790; 4715.0800, subparts 1, 2, 4, 5, 6, 6a, and 7; 4715.0805;
4715.0810; 4715.0815; 4715.0820; 4715.0830; 4715.0840; 4715.0850; 4715.0860;
4715,0870; 4715.0880; 4715.0890; 4715.0900; 4715.0910; 4715.0920; 4715.0930;
4715.0940; 4715.0950; 4715.0960; 4715.0970; 4715.1000; 4715.1010; 4715.1020;
4715.1030; 4715.1100; 4715.1105; 4715.1120; 4715.1130; 4715.1140; 4715.1150;
4715.1160; 4715.1200; 4715.1210; 4715.1220; 4715.1230; 4715.1240; 4715.1250; |
4715.1260; 4715.1300, subparts 1, 2, 3, 4, and 6; 4715.1305; 4715.1310; 4715.1320;

4714.1702 59




60.1

60.2

60.3

60.4

60.5

60.6

60.7

60.8

60.9

60.10

60.11

60.12

60.13

60.14

60.15

60.16

60.17

60.18

60.19

10/07/14

REVISOR

SS/DI

RD4139

4715.1330; 4715.1340; 4715.1350; 4715.1360; 4715.1370; 4715.1380; 4715.1390;

4715.1400; 4715.1410; 4715.1420; 4715.1430; 4715.1440; 4715.1500; 4715.1510;

4715.1520; 4715.1530; 4715.1540; 4715.1550; 4715.1560; 4715.1570; 4715.1580;

4715.1590, subparts 1, 2, 3, and 4; 4715.1600; 4715.1610; 4715.1700; 4715.1710;

4715.1720; 4715.1730; 4715.1740; 4715.1750; 4715.1760; 4715.1770; 4715.1800;

4715.1810; 4715.1900; 4715.1910; 4715.1911; 4715.1912; 4715.1920, 4715.1940;

4715.1941; 4715.1950; 4715.1960; 4715.2000; 4715.2010; 4715.2020; 4715.2030;

4715.2100; 4715.2110; 4715.2120; 4715.2150; 4715.2160; 4715.2161; 4715.2162;

4715.2163; 4715.2165; 4715.2170; 4715.2180; 4715.2190; 4715.2200; 4715.2210;

4715.2215; 4715.2220; 4715.2230; 4715.2240; 4715.2250; 4715.2280; 4715.2300;

4715.2310; 4715.2320; 4715.2330; 4715.2340; 4715.2350; 4715.2360; 4715.2370;

4715.2400; 4715.2410; 4715.2420; 4715.2430; 4715.2440; 4715.2450; 4715.2500;

4715.2510; 4715.2520; 4715.2530; 4715.2540; 4715.2550; 4715.2560; 4715.2570;

4715.2580; 4715.2600; 4715.2610; 4715.2620; 4715.2630; 4715.2640; 4715.2650;

4715.2655; 4715.2660; 4715.2700; 4715.2710; 4715.2720; 4715.2730; 4715.2740;

4715.2750; 4715.2760; 4715.2770; 4715.2780; 4715.2790; 4715.2820; 4715.2840;

4715.2850; 4715.2860; 4715.2870; 4715.3500; 4715.3600; 4715.3700; 4715.3800,

| subparts 1,2, 3,4, 5,6, 7, 8,9, 10a, and 11a; 4715.4100; 4715.5000; 4715.5100;

4715.5200; 4715.5300; 4715.5400; 4715.5500; and 4715.5700, are repealed.

4714.1702

60



Attachment B -

Minnesota Plumbing Board
STATEMENT OF NEED AND REASONABLENESS

Proposed Amendment to Rules Governing Minnesota Plumbing Code, Minnesota
Rules, chapter 4714, and Repeal of Minnesota Rules, chapter 4715; Revisor’s ID Number
R-04139

INTRODUCTION

Regulatory authority to prescribe minimum plumbing standards was established in 1940
and granted to the State Board of Health.* In 1975, the word “regulation” was changed to “rule.”?
In 2007, the rulemaking authority was transferred to the then newly-established Minnesota
Plumbing Board (“Board”).% The Board consists of 14 members.*

The Minnesota Plumbing Code (“Plumbing Code™) is part of the State Building Code.”
Although the Plumbing Code is adopted by the Board, it is administered and enforced by the
Minnesota Department of Labor and Industry (“Department”). The Board proposes to repeal the
current Plumbing Code in chapter 4715 and replace it with a new Plumbing Code in chapter 4714.

The current Plumbing Code is a homegrown code that was developed over time. The Board
proposes to incorporate the 2012 Uniform Plumbing Code by reference, with amendments, to
replace the existing Plumbing Code. The Board formed an advisory committee, the Plumbing
Board National Code Review Committee (“Review Committee™), at the April 2010 Board meeting
to review and make a recommendation to the full Board as to whether to pursue a national code
adoption and if so, which one. Based on request for action forms received, the Review Committee
considered the International Plumbing Code (“IPC”) and the Uniform Plumbing Code (“*UPC”).
Representatives of the IPC and the UPC presented to the whole Board at the April 2011 meeting. A
motion to adopt a national code was passed with the statutorily required two-thirds majority vote at
the April 2011 meeting.® Another motion to adopt the UPC with amendments was passed with the
statutorily required two-thirds majority vote at the April 2011 meeting as well.” The Review
Committee met thirteen times from February 2011 to September 2013 and followed the open
meeting laws. The Review Committee proposed specific UPC amendments to the Board; the
Board discussed each amendment and took informal votes to compile a proposed rule draft. These
proposed rules developed from the first draft after thorough discussions that included Board
members and other interested parties. The Board, pursuant to statute and Board bylaws, approved

! See 5887-19, page 1084 at www.revisor.mn.gov/data/revisor/statute/1940A/1940A-035.pdf#search="5887-19.
% See (as Minnesota Statute, section 326.37) 1975 ¢ 136 s 66 at
WwWw.revisor.mn.gov/data/revisor/law/1975/0/1975-136.pdf
¥ See (as Minnesota Statute, section 326.37) 2007 ¢ 135 art 3 s 19, 20 at
www.revisor.mn.gov/laws/?doctype=Chapter&year=2007 &type=0&id=140
* A list of current Board members is available at www.dli.mn.gov/PDF/pb/members.pdf
®See Minnesota Rules, part 1300.0050
® See meeting minutes at www.dli.mn.gov/PDF/pb/minutes0411.pdf and statutory requirement at
\7/vww.revisor.mn.qov/statutes/?id:3268.435 (note that only 13 of the 14 members are voting members.

Id.

UPC_ADOPTION_ SONAR_DRAFT_1/16/2015


http://www.revisor.mn.gov/data/revisor/statute/1940A/1940A-035.pdf%23search=%225887-19
http://www.revisor.mn.gov/data/revisor/law/1975/0/1975-136.pdf
http://www.revisor.mn.gov/laws/?doctype=Chapter&year=2007&type=0&id=140
http://www.dli.mn.gov/PDF/pb/members.pdf
https://www.revisor.mn.gov/rules/?id=1300.0050
http://www.dli.mn.gov/PDF/pb/minutes0411.pdf
http://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/?id=326B.435

the proposed rules by an affirmative two-thirds or more majority vote of all the voting members of
the Board.®

ALTERNATIVE FORMAT

Upon request, this information can be made available in an alternative format, such as large
print, braille, or audio. To make a request, contact Suzanne Todnem at Minnesota Department of
Labor and Industry, 443 Lafayette Road North, 651.284.5006, fax at 651.284.5725
or dli.rules@state.mn.us.

STATUTORY AUTHORITY

The Board’s statutory authority to adopt the proposed rules is stated in the following
Minnesota Statutes:

326B.43, Subdivision 1.Rules. The Plumbing Board may, by rule, prescribe minimum
standards which shall be uniform and which shall be effective for all new plumbing
installations performed anywhere in the state, including additions, extensions, alterations, and
replacements.

326B.435, Subd. 2.Powers; duties; administrative support.

(a) The board shall have the power to...(3) adopt the Plumbing Code that must be
followed in this state and any Plumbing Code amendments thereto. The Plumbing Code shall
include the minimum standards described in sections 326B.43, subdivision 1, and 326B.52
subdivision 1. The board shall adopt the Plumbing Code and any amendments thereto pursuant
to chapter 14 and as provided in subdivision 6, paragraphs (b), (c), and (d).”

This rulemaking repeals and replaces existing rules for which the Legislature has not newly
revised the statutory authority; therefore, time limits in Minnesota Statutes, section 14.125, do not
apply. The proposed rules do not affect farming operations so no copy of the proposed rules was
provided to the commissioner of agriculture.® The proposed rules do not have their primary effect
on Chicano/Latino people so a copy was not submitted to the State Council on Affairs of
Chicano/Latino People for review. '

Under these statutes, the Board has the necessary statutory authority to adopt the proposed
rules.

REGULATORY ANALYSIS

& Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.435, subdivision 6(c).
%See Minn. Stat. § 14.111.
'2See Minn. Stat. § 3.9223

UPC_ADOPTION_ SONAR_DRAFT_1/16/2015


mailto:dli.rules@state.mn.us
https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes?id=326B.43%23stat.326B.43.1
https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes?id=326B.52%23stat.326B.52.1
https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes?id=326B.52%23stat.326B.52.1
https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/?id=326B.435

Minnesota Statutes, section 14.131, sets out eight factors for a regulatory analysis that
must be included in the SONAR. Paragraphs (1) through (8) below quote these factors and then
give the Board’s response.™*

(1) a description of the classes of persons who probably will be affected by the proposed rule,
including classes that will bear the costs of the proposed rule and classes that will benefit
from the proposed rule

The proposed rules will likely affect plumbing contractors, journeymen, apprentices,
master plumbers, restricted master plumbers, restricted journeymen, plumber’s apprentices,
employers of person who perform plumbing work, persons who wish to perform plumbing work,
plumbing inspectors, building officials, engineers, persons in the water conditioning industry,
residential and commercial building contractors and owners, and the general public.

(2) the probable costs to the agency and to any other agency of the implementation and
enforcement of the proposed rule and any anticipated effect on state revenues

The Board adopts the Plumbing Code but does not administer or enforce it; therefore, the
Board will not incur any costs associated with the adoption of the proposed rules.

Costs to the Department include the costs of purchasing code books for state employees
who address Plumbing Code questions. Adoption of the proposed rules will not affect state
revenues because it is a self-funded program through collection of fees.

(3) a determination of whether there are less costly methods or less intrusive methods for
achieving the purpose of the proposed rule

The purpose of the proposed rules is to promote the public health and safety through
properly designed, acceptably installed, and adequately maintained plumbing systems.*? No other
less costly or less intrusive methods would establish minimum plumbing standards and adequately
maintain plumbing systems. In this case, the proposed rule adopts a model code.

(4) a description of any alternative methods for achieving the purpose of the proposed rule
that were seriously considered by the agency and the reasons why they were rejected in
favor of the proposed rule

The Board seriously considered three options: 1) update the existing Minnesota Plumbing
Code; 2) adopt the International Plumbing Code (“IPC”), with amendments; and 3) adopt the
Uniform Plumbing Code, with amendments.*® The Board rejected the first option because the
existing Code is outdated; updating it would be as time-consuming as adopting a model code but
would not yield the benefits of adopting a model code. The second option was rejected because the
Board wished to adopt a model code, the UPC most closely resembles the existing Minnesota
Plumbing Code, and the UPC is adopted in three of the four states adjacent to Minnesota, two of
which have reciprocity agreements with Minnesota, providing consistency.'* Therefore, adopting
the UPC presents an easier transition from the existing code than the IPC would.

1 Because the paragraphs quote the statute, note that “agency” means the Board in this document.

12 Minnesota Statutes, section 326B.41.

3 The Board received two Requests For Actions (“RFA”) in regard to considered incorporating by reference a model
code; one RFA asking the Board to consider the International Plumbing Code and one RFA for consideration of the
Uniform Plumbing Code.

¥ Minnesota has plumbing license reciprocity agreements with North Dakota and South Dakota. The UPC is adopted

3

UPC_ADOPTION_ SONAR_DRAFT_1/16/2015


https://www.revisor.mn.gov/statutes/?id=326B.41

(5) the probable costs of complying with the proposed rule, including the portion of the total
costs that will be borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate classes
of governmental units, businesses, or individuals

Plumbers, municipal inspection departments and designers will need to purchase copies of
the UPC. Training curriculum will need to be updated to incorporate any changes in the code.

Costs to new home or commercial buildings or other plumbing to which the code applies is
anticipated to be neutral. Some changes might result in higher expenses than the existing rule
requirements but other code changes will result in cost savings. For example, the proposed rules
allow more products to be used without additional local approval, resulting in more available
options than the existing code.

Costs to retrain to the new code are not anticipated to be significantly different from the
existing code because training is already required under the existing code.

(6) the probable costs or consequences of not adopting the proposed rule, including those
costs or consequences borne by identifiable categories of affected parties, such as separate
classes of government units, businesses, or individuals

The existing code is already outdated so not adopting the proposed rules would result in a
Plumbing Code that is further outdated. Other costs or consequences include eliminating new
technologies from the pool of available products and method. These costs and consequences
would ultimately fall to the building owner.

(7) an assessment of any differences between the proposed rule and existing federal
regulations and a specific analysis of the need for and reasonableness of each difference

in: ND, SD, and IA.

UPC_ADOPTION_ SONAR_DRAFT_1/16/2015



There are no applicable federal regulations that address Plumbing Code issues in the
construction of non-federally owned buildings.

(8) an assessment of the cumulative effect of the rule with other federal and state regulations
related to the specific purpose of the rule. . .. ‘[Clumulative effect’ means the impact that
results from incremental impact of the proposed rule in addition to other rules, regardless of
what state or federal agency has adopted the other rules. Cumulative effects can result from
individually minor but collectively significant rules adopted over a period of time.

There are no other state or federal regulations related to the specific purpose of the
proposed rules.

PERFORMANCE-BASED RULES

The Plumbing Code is performance-based in that it balances the method with the end result
of the plumbing work within a framework of standards. The proposed rules are performance-based
standards to the extent practicable.

ADDITIONAL NOTICE

This Additional Notice Plan was reviewed by the Office of Administrative Hearings and
approved in a [date] letter by Administrative Law Judge [name].

This Notice Plan also includes giving notice required by statute. We will mail the Notice of
Intent to Adopt to everyone who has registered to be on the Department’s rulemaking mailing list
under Minnesota Statutes, section 14.14, subdivision 1a. We will also give notice to the
Legislature per Minnesota Statutes, section 14.116.

In addition to the rulemaking lists required by statute, the Board will be mailing or
emailing the Notice of Intent to Adopt to organizations and trade associations anticipated to be
substantially affected by the proposed rules. Those organizations and associations are as follows:

American Backflow Prevention Association (ABPA) — Region 10
American Society of Plumbing Engineers (ASPE) — Minnesota Chapter
American Society of Civil Engineers — Minnesota Section

American Council of Engineering Companies of Minnesota

American Society of Heating, Refrigeration, and Air Conditioning Engineers
(ASHRAE) — Minnesota Chapter

6. Associated Builders and Contractors

7. Association of General Contractors of Minnesota

8. Association of Minnesota Building Officials (AMBO)

9. Association of Minnesota Counties

10. Building Owners and Managers Association (BOMA)/Duluth

11. Building Owners and Managers Association (BOMA)/Minneapolis

12. Building Owners and Managers Association (BOMA)/St. Paul

13. Builders Association of Minnesota (BAM)

14. Builders Association of the Twin Cities

arwDE

UPC_ADOPTION_ SONAR_DRAFT_1/16/2015



15. League of Minnesota Cities

16. Metropolitan Council

17. Minnesota Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials
18. Minnesota Association of Townships

19. Minnesota Mechanical Contractors Association

20. Minnesota Pipe Trades Association

21. Minnesota Plumbing, Heating and Cooling Contractors Association
22. Minnesota Rural Water Association

23. Minnesota State Fire Chiefs Association

24. Minnesota State Fire Marshal Division

25. Minnesota Water Quality Association (MWQA)

26. U. S. Green Building Council — Minnesota Chapter

27. United Association of Plumbers and Gasfitters Local Union #15
28. Water Quality Association (WQA)

This Notice Plan does not include notifying the Commissioner of Agriculture because the
proposed rules do not affect farming operations per Minnesota Statutes, section 14.111.

This Notice Plan does not include notifying the state Council on Affairs of Chicano/Latino
People per Minnesota Statutes, section 3.9223 because the proposed rules will not have their
primary effect on Chicano/Latino people.

CONSULTATION WITH MMB ON LOCAL GOVERNMENT IMPACT

As required by Minnesota Statutes, section 14.131, the Department consulted with
Minnesota Management and Budget (MMB). We did this by sending MMB copies of the
documents that we send to the Governor’s Office for review and approval. The documents
included: the Governor’s Office Proposed Rule and SONAR Form; the near-final proposed rules;
and the near-final SONAR. MMB Executive Budget Officer Elisabeth Hammer responded, in part,
as follows in a letter dated DATE: “Based upon __

The Department will submit a copy of the cover correspondence and the response received
from Minnesota Management and Budget to OAH at the hearing or with the documents it submits
for ALJ review.

DETERMINATION ABOUT RULES REQUIRING LOCAL IMPLEMENTATION

As required by Minnesota Statutes, section 14.128, subdivision 1, the agency has
considered whether these proposed rules will require a local government to adopt or amend any
ordinance or other regulation in order to comply with these rules. The Board has the rulemaking
authority in this case and therefore has made the required determination. The Board has

determined that the only required amendment to a local ordinance that the Board is aware of would
be a change in any specific references from chapter 4715 to chapter 4714.

COST OF COMPLYING FOR SMALL BUSINESS OR CITY

Agency Determination of Cost

UPC_ADOPTION_ S