Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

Link to 2024 IEBC (changes in blue)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

Link to 2021 IEBC (changes in blue)

To Be Completed by TAG Leads

Blue - Current MN Amendment Red - Revisit

Purple - Code Change Proposal

TAG Meeting Results
Recommendations A - Accept Model Code AM - Amend Model Code R - Reject

E Safety/ o =
E Health g g § § % é
§ Value = = 8 § E §
w = IS < O © O
< ~ ()] Q = o 5 =
§ 2024 IEBC (2021 IEBC 5 N Nore L Low E E
Item Code Code 2020 MN Code |Code Section 2 T S o S YorN YorN
Number Section Section Section Heading/Topic £ E |Description of change(s) to code language s b G Staff Comment & L & Comments
1311.0010 Adoption and 1311.0020 References to other Codes
0-.1 1300.0040 Compliance Y N N Coordinate with 1300 No recommendation needed.
Subp. 2 TAG AM NA Y 1300 TAG will address.
0-1 0 1311.0010 General & Mandatory Chapters Y |Sections contain references to dated editions N N Revise amendment. Revise amend. to correct dates.
and code sections which need to be revised AM* AM Y
for current MSBC
0-1.2 1311.0010 Construction Safeguards Y |Using IBC Ch 33. Coordinate with 1305 Coordinate with 1305 TAG and a
Subp. 3 Item D TAG. AM* AM Y CCP related to this section.
0-2 0 1311.0020 References to Other Codes Y |Modifies & establishes references to other N N Carry over amendment. AM AM v Carry over amendment.
codes.
Chapter 2 Definitions
2-1 2 (202 1305.0202 Ambulatory Care Facility Y [Definition brought into 2024 IEBC from IBC. N N Ensure definition Coordinate with 1300 and 1305
MN amended the IBC definition of ACF in MR matches 1305 for the AM* A Y TAGs. Revisit.
1305. 2026 cycle.
2-2 2 1202 202 1311.0202 Approved Y |MN amendment more specific than model N N Carry over amendment AM AM v
code
2-3 2 |202 Approved Agency N |New definition in 2024 N N A A Y
2-4 2 1202 202 Change of Occupancy N [New definition in 2021; Revised definition N N Support - Coordinate Coordinate with 1305 TAG. New
2024 with 1305 definition qualifies a "change of
A* A Y occupancy" to when code
requires a greater degree of
safety.
2-5 2 (202 202 Change of Use N |New definition 2021 N N Support - Coordinate A A v Discussion. Support.
with 1305
2-6 2 1202 1311.0202 Code Y |Definition not present in model code N N Carry over amendment AM A v Carry over amendment
2-7 2 202 202 Code Official Y |MN amendment differs from model code N N Carry over amendment AM A v Carry over amendment
2-8 2 1202 202 Dangerous N [Revised 2021 - Expands loading conditions; L N Support - Coordinate A A v (Structural TAG recommends
Added 'aftershock' 2024. with structural. accepting.)




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

2-9 202 Disproportionate Earthquake N [Revised definition 2024 N N Seismic and earthquake Seismic and earthquake
Damage provisions made non- provisions made non-applicable
applicable elsewhere in A A elsewhere in MN code.
MN code.
2-10 202 202 Emergency Escape and Rescue N |New in 2021 IEBC. Same as IBC. N N Support - coordinate A A Staff coordination with 1305
Opening with 1305. and 1309.

2-11 202 202 1311.0202 Existing Building Y |MN amendment more specific than model N N Carry over amendment AM AM Carry over amendment.
code.

2-12 202 202 Exterior Wall Covering; Exterior N [New in 2021 IEBC. Same as IBC. N N A A

Wall Envelope

2-13 202 202 1311.0202 Historic Building Y |MN amendment references definition in N N Carry over amendment AM AM Carry over amendment.
1300.0700 Subp. 12a

2-14 202 Listed N [New in 2024 IEBC. Same as IBC. N N A A

2-15 202 Lowest Floor N [New in 2024 IEBC. Same as IBC. N N Coordinate with 1305. A A (1305 TAG recommends accept

2024 IBC definition.)

2-16 202 Occupiable Roof N [New in 2024 IEBC, same as new definition in N N Ensure definition (1305 TAG recommends accept
2024 IBC. matches 1305 for 2026 A A 2024 IBC definition.)

cycle.

2-17 202 Peer Review N [New in 2024 IEBC, same as new definition in N N Ensure definition Some discussion. (1305 TAG
2024 IBC. Pertains to Storm Shelter design matches 1305 for the A A recommends accept 2024 IBC
and construction. 2026 cycle. definition.)

2-18 202 Photovoltaic Panel System N [New in 2024 IEBC. Same as IBC. Coordinate with 1305. A A

2-19 202 1311.0202 Repair Y |MN amendment differs from model code. N N AM AM

2-20 202 Storm Shelter N [New in 2024 IEBC. Same as IBC. N N A A

2-21 202 1311.0202 Substantial Damage Y |MN amendment differs from model code. N N Carry over amendment- Discussion. JB to research.

coordinate with Amendment removes
Structural. 'floodplain' because flood regs
AM AM are in MR 1335, not 1311.
(Structural TAG defers to 1311
and 1335.) Consensus 4/30.
2-22 202 1311.0202 Substantial Improvement Y |MN amendment differs from model code. N N Carry over amendment- Discussion. JB to research.
coordinate with Amendment removes
Structural. 'floodplain' because flood regs
AM AM arein MR 1335, not 1311.
(Structural TAG defers to 1311
and 1335.) Consensus 4/30.

2-23 202 Substantial Structural Damage N [Small change to language in 2024 - Only the N N Coordinate with 1305 & Discussion. Tabled. JB to
last sentence added to clarify work done to Structural TAG. research. (Structural TAG defers
implement repairs shall not be considered Structural TAG A A to 1311 and 1335.) Consensus

damage that reduces structural capacity.

recommends accept
change.

4/30.




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

2-24 2 202 202 Technically Infeasible Definition not present in published 1311 N Addressed in Relates to Accessibility, which is
MCCEB. See definitions for Technically amendments purview of 1341 TAG. Replaced
Infeasible, Accessibility and Technically Technically Infeasible with amendment only adding
Infeasible, Stair Construction Accessibility and "Accessibility" to defined term
Technically Infeasible AM AM to distinguish from "Technically
Stairway Construction. Infeasible, Stairways". No
change in application.
2-25 2 1311.0202 Technically Infeasible, Definition not present in model code. N Check with 1341 TAG Relates to Accessibility, which is
Accessibility Pertains to accessibility in existing buildings. chair and rules purview of 1341 TAG.
coordinator. Amendment only adds
AM AM "Acc'es.sibilﬁty" to defined t(.arm
to distinguish from "Technically
Infeasible, Stairways". No
change in application.
2-26 2 1311.0202 Technically Infeasible, Stair Definition not present in model code. N Carry over amendment. Discussion. Some interest in why
Construction only limited to stairway.
Amendment expands
AM? availability of technically
infeasible beyond the model
code language. Revisit. 4/30-MB
to research amendment.
Chapter 3 Provisions for All Compliance Methods
3-1 3 13011 301.1 301.1 Applicability/General In 2021, new Applicability section (moved N Coordinate added Will only need amendment if
from 302) replaces General in 2018 sections from CCPs. CCP's extend numbered
Looks like a good sections.
char.lge coordinating AM (if A or AM
sections 302-309 (and if
i CCP's)*
then some) applicable needed
to all methods
(formerly section
302.1).
3-2 3 (301.1.1 301.1.1 Bleachers Added in 2021 - Refers bleachers to ICC 300. H Bleacher code ICC 300
will need to be added
to 1311.0020 or state
. A A
adoption and
amendments
referenced here.
3-3 3 (301.3 301.3 301.3 Alteration, Addition, or Change Revised in 2021 - Reorganized and removes N Discuss Ex. 1 and 2, Discussion. No substantive
of Occupancy accessibility. coordinate 3 with change in application except
structural. A* A that Ex. 1 exempts accessibility,

which is the purview of 1341
TAG. Coordinate with Structural.




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

3-4 301.3.1 301.3.1 1311.0301.3.1 |Prescriptive Compliance Model codes 2021 and 2024 reference IFC. N Carry over amendment. Consensus not unanimous. Fire
Methods MN Amendment requires compliance with Ch Code still applies, administered
5 Prescriptive Compliance. AM by Dept. of Public Safety, not
CCLD. Table 4/30.
3-5 1311.0301.5 Accessibility in Existing Buildings Section added. Compliance for accessibility N Carry over amendment. AM? A Carry over amendment - sent
sent to 1341 accessibility to 1341.
3-5.1 302.2 Additional Codes List of other codes applicable to existing N Review for consistency
buildings. with MN adopted A A
codes.
3-6 302.2.1 302.2.1 Health Care Facilities New subsection. Added in 2021, adds N Discuss. Discussion. Added in 2021, no
Applicability compliance with NFPA 99 Health Care A A change in 2024. Currently NFPA
Facilities Code for health care occupancies 99 referenced in 1311 and 1305.
3-7 1311.0302.3.1 |Window Cleaning Anchors Amendment adds provision for Window N Carry over amendment. Carry over amendment.
cleaning anchors comply with 1305. This will
. . AM AM
need to be renumbered if carried over (to
302.2.2)
3-8 302.3 302.3 Existing materials In 2021 changed 'building official' to 'code’ N Discuss. Our current Discussion. Our current
official. Also renumbered - was 302.5. amendment of CODE amendment of CODE OFFICIAL
OFFICIAL in 202 already A A in 202 already refers to
refers to 1300.0070, 1300.0070, subpart 5.
subpart 5.
3-9 303 303.1; Storm Shelters (Moved) General; 2021 relocates Storm Shelters from Chapter N Discuss and coordinate Discuss and coordinate with
303.1.1 Construction 11 (Additions) to Chapter 3 (All Compliance with 1305 Ch 4. 1305 Ch 4. Amendment needed
Methods). Revised language. Amendment needed to to specify counties where
specify counties where applicable. Add Mower County
i AM* AM .
applicable. Add Mower to list.
County to list.
3-10 304 Structural/Seismic Revisions to seismic requirements only. N Coordinate with (Structural TAG recommending
Structural TAG. acceptance of seismic
references throughout model
IBC and ICEB because MR
A A 1305.0011 Subp. 4 and
1311.0010 Subp. 4 deletes any
references to earthquake or
seismic provisions.)
3-10.1 305 In-Situ Load Tests Renumbered in 2021 from 304 to 305. A A
3-11 306 1311.0305 Accessibility in Existing Buildings Changes made in both code cycles. Needs to N Send to 1341 TAG. All accessibility to 1341 TAG.
(multiple be renumbered to 1311.0306. AM* A

sections)




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

3-12 307.1 307.1 Smoke Alarms Moved in 2021 from individual compliance H N See proposed Table until June 11 meeting
methods to Ch 3 and is applicable to all amendment CCP-EB-1. when proponent for related
compliance methods except for the Also, apply the current CCPs present at meeting.
exception. Consider deleting the exception to amendment to 503.14
align with 1309. here. Consider

amendment to delete AM*
the exception.

(coordinate with 1305

and 1309 TAG's)

3-12.1 1311.0503.14 Smoke alarm code sections from other No No (coordinate with 1305 Table until June 11 meeting
chapters moved to 307. Carry amendment to | change.| change. |[and 1309 TAG's) when proponent for related
new smoke alarm location. Renumber to AM* CCPs present at meeting.
1311.0307. Amendment points to 1305.

3-13 307 307 1311.0307.1, Smoke Alarms Conforms req. for annunciators in dwelling H L See CCP-EB-1. Discuss Table until June 11 meeting
1311.307.1.1, units with Fire Code. at 6/11 Meeting. AM* when proponent for related
1311.307.1.2 CCPs present at meeting.

3-14 308 308.1 1311.0503.15 [Carbon Monoxide Detection Section relocated here in 2021, revision for |- H N The amendment to Table until June 11 meeting

(Moved) 2sin 2024 in exception #4. Added 'E's' in 503.15 should be when proponent for related
2021. Removed specific occupancies in the applied here. Propose CCPs present at meeting.
2024 and changed wording to existing amending reference to
buildings. IBC instead of IFC/IRC AM*
and deleting exception
#3 (coordinate with
1305 and 1309 TAG's)
3-14.1 1311.0503.15 |Carbon Monoxide Alarms Carry amendment from Ch 5 to new location. H N (coordinate with 1305 Table until June 11 meeting
and 1309 TAGs). AM* when proponent for related
CCPs present at meeting.
3-15 309 309 Add & Replace Ext Wall Covering Section added in 2021, revision for high rises H M Public member concerned with
& Envelope in 2024. A scope of requirements. MB to
research reason for addition in
model code.
3-16 1311.0310 Energy Code for Existing L M See CCP-EB-2. All Table until June 11 meeting
Buildings references in IEBC to when proponent for related
1322 and 1323 per CCPs present at meeting.
1311.0020.
3-17 1311.0310 Energy Conservation L M See CCP-EB-3. All Table until June 11 meeting

references in IEBC to
1322 and 1323 per
1311.0020.

when proponent for related
CCPs present at meeting.




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

3-18 3 1311.0311 Electric Vehicle Charging Stations Adds scoping for EV charging stations M See CCP-EB-4. Support, Table until June 11 meeting
but need cost benefit when proponent for related
analysis information. CCPs present at meeting.

Chapter 4 Repairs

4-1 4 401.1.1 Bleachers, etc. New in 2021 - Repairs shall comply with ICC L A A

300.
4-2 4 1401.2 Compliance 2024 adds language for nondamaged L A A
components incidental to repair.
4-3 4 1405 405 405 Structural Minor change 2021. More changes 2024. M Send to Structural TAG. A A Coordinate with Structural TAG.
4-4 4 1311.0405.2.4 |Substantial Structural Damage to Amendment requires demonstration that M Send to Structural TAG. Discussion. Public member
Gravity Load-Carrying components have capacity to carry design concerned with scope of
Components loads of rehab design. Current amendment AM* AM requirements. Has been in code
and also new language in model code. since 2006. Priority for
recommendation to Structural
TAG.
4-5 4 1406.1 406.1 General Electrical Changes "material" to "general". Requires M Obtain input from Electrical unit aware of model
repairs to comply with NFPA 70. Previously, Electrical Unit. A A code language.
allowed to be replaced with like material.
4-6 4 1406.1.1 406.1.1 Reconditioned Electrical Eliminates "Receptacles"” section, replaces M Obtain input from Electrical unit aware of model
Equipment with requirement for reconditioned Electrical Unit. A A code language.
equipment to comply with NFPA 70 or NFPA
99.

4-7 4 1406.1.2 406.1.2 Plug Fuses - Deleted Eliminated in 2024. N Obtain input from A A Electrical unit aware of model
Electrical Unit. code language.

4-8 4 1406.1.2 406.1.4 Health Care Facilities (Electrical) Added in 2021, renumbered in 2024. Group I- M Obtain input from Electrical unit aware of model

2, ambulatory care facilities and outpatient Electrical Unit. A A code language.
clinics repairs shall comply with NFPA 99.
4-9 4 1408.3 408.3 Health Care Facilities (Plumbing) Added in 2021, renumbered in 2024. Group I- M
2, ambulatory care facilities and outpatient A A
clinics med gas system repairs shall comply
with NFPA 99.
Chapter 5 Prescriptive Compliance Method
5-1 5 (501.3 501.3 Health Care Facilities Added in 2021, Group I-2, ambulatory care L
(Prescriptive Compliance) facilities and outpatient clinics alterations and
additions electrical or med gas systems shall A A
comply with NFPA 99.
5-2 5 1502.1 502.1 General (Additions) Revised in 2024 - limits some structural Coordinate with Coordinate with Structural.
compliance requirements, specifies addition Structural TAG and « A
of occupiable roof shall comply with IBC (with obtain input on cost.
exception).




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

5-3 502.1.1 Risk Category Assignment New in 2024. M Coordinate with Coordinate with Structural.
(Additions) Structural; TAG and & A
obtain input on cost.
5-4 502.1.2 Creation or Extension of New in 2024 (with exception). H Coordinate with Coordinate with Structural.
Nonconformity (Additions) Structural TAG and * A
obtain input on cost.
5-5 502.2 Disproportionate Earthquake Eliminated in 2024.
Damage (Additions) - Deleted A A
5-6 502.2 502.3 Flood Hazard Areas (Additions) Renumbered and revised in 2024. Coordinate with MR
1335 Floodproofing A A
Regs.
5-7 502.3 502.4 MR 1311.502.4 |Existing Structural Elements Renumbered in 2024. Send to Structural TAG.
Carrying Gravity Loads & A
(Additions)
5-8 502.4 502.5 MR Existing Structural Elements Renumbered and revised in 2024. Send to Structural TAG.
1311.0502.5 Carrying Lateral Loads * A
(Additions)
5-9 502.5 Smoke Barriers in Group I-1, New in 2024. Addresses smoke barriers in H A A
Cond. 2 (Additions) additions to I-1 Cond. 2.
5-10 502.6 1311.0502.6 Smoke Alarms in Existing Relocated in 2021. Now addressed in 307.1. H Amendment not Amendment to be in Ch. 3.
Portions of a Building (Additions) See also CCP-EB-1. needed here - address AM* AM
- Relocated in 307.1.
5-11 502.6 502.6 Enhanced Classroom Acoustics New in 2021. Requires enhanced acoustics in H Coordinate with 1341 Requires enhanced acoustics in
(Additions) additions with a volume of 20K cf or less. TAG. additions with a volume of 20K
Applies ICC A117.1 808 accessibility standard A cf or less. Applies ICC A117.1
for reverberence only. 808 accessibility standard for
reverberence only.
5-12 503.1 503.1 1311.0503.1 General (Alterations) Reworded in 2021, structural revision in Coordinate with
2024. MN amendment modifies exceptions. Structural TAG. Review AM* A
language.
5-13 503.3 1311.0503.3 Existing Structural Elements No changes in 2021 or 2024. Send to Structural TAG. Send to Structural TAG.
Carrying Gravity Load AM*
(Alterations)
5-14 503.4 503.4 1311.0503.4 Existing Structural Elements Exceptions 1 revised & 2 added in 2021. Send to Structural TAG. Send to Structural TAG.
Carrying Lateral Loads Further revision of Exception 1, and addition
(Alterations) of Exception 3 in 2024 related to seismic. MN AM*
amendment rewords Exception 1.
5-15 503.5 Seismic Design Category F Seismic revised in 2024. Proposed CC-P to See proposed Table until June 11 meeting
replace with Reroofing. amendment CCP-EB-5 when proponent for related
replacing this section. CCPs present at meeting.
5-16 503.5 1311.0503.5 Reroofing (Alterations) Proposal deletes seismic provision, replaces See CCP-EB-5. Also CCP- Table until June 11 meeting

with direction to comply with 1305 for
reroofing.

EB-7

when proponent for related
CCPs present at meeting.




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

5-17 503.6, 503.7, Bracing and Anchorage for Several 2024 changes in these sections, some Send to Structural TAG. Send to Structural TAG.
503.8, 503.9, Parapets, Bracing and Anchorage referencing IEBC Ch 3. Roof Diaphragm
503.10, for Masonry Walls, Substantial revised 2021 and 2024.
503.11, Structural Alteration, Roof
503.12, Diaphragms Resisting Wind *
503.13 Loads, Voluntary Lateral-Force
Resisting Systems (Alterations)
5-18 503.14 503.14 Smoke Compartments Relocated 2021. Was under Refuge Areas.
(Alterations) Addresses smoke compartments in I-2s for A
alterations. Language changed in 2021. No
changes in 2024.
5-19 1311.0503.14 |Smoke Alarms in Existing Smoke alarms relocated to 307.1 in 2021. Current amendment to Table until June 11 meeting
Portions of a Building See also CCP-EB-1. One exception added. 503.14 not needed here AM when proponent for related
(Alterations) - Relocated to 307.1 307.1 needs this CCPs present at meeting.
amendment.
5-19 1311.0503.15 |Carbon Monoxide Alarms CO alarms relocated to 308 in 2021. Two Current amendment to Table until June 11 meeting
exceptions added. 503.15 not needed AM when proponent for related
here. 308 needs CCPs present at meeting.
amendment.
5-20 503.15 503.15 Refuge Areas Revised in 2021. Minor change in 2024. From 2018: 503.16.1
Smoke Compartments
now in 503.14; 503.16.2
Ambulatory Care now
in 503.17; 503.16.3 A
Horizontal Exits address
here in 503.15.
5-21 503.16, Conditions for Group I-1 New in 2024.
503.16.1 Occupancies; Smoke Barriers in A
Group I-1, Cond. 2
5-22 503.17 Ambulatory Care Facilities New language in 2024. Was under Refuge A
Areas.
5-23 503.18 503.16 Enhanced Classroom Acoustics New in 2021. Renumbered in 2024 Coordinate with 1341. Requires enhanced acoustics in
(Alterations) additions with a volume of 20K
A cf or less. Applies ICC A117.1
808 accessibility standard for
reverberence only.
5-24 503.19 503.17 Locking Arrangements in New in 2021. Renumbered in 2024. Reference Watch for errata.
Educational Occupancies to IBC numbering is incorrect in model code. Reference to 1010.2.8
Should be 1010.2.7. was renumbered to A

1010.2.7.




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

5-25 503.20 503.18 Two-Way Communication New in 2021. Renumbered in 2024. M A A
Systems
5-25.1 1311.503.21 Elevator Hoistway Opening See CCP-EB-6
Protection
5-25.2 504.4 1311.504.4 Fire Escapes, Dimensions Carry over. AM AM
5-26 505.1 505.1 505.1 Replacement Windows Changed "glass" to "windows" in 2021. No Discussion, Window manf.'s
change in 2024. A instructions don't cover existing
buildings. Mike to research.
Revisit.
5-27 505.2 505.2 505.2 Window Fall Prevention on Sub-section revised in 2021. Renamed in L
Replacement Windows 2024 from "Window Opening Control Devices A A
on Replacement Windows" to new heading.
5-28 505.3; 505.3; 505.3 Replacement Window Some changes in 2021, including separating L
505.3.1 503.3.1 Emergency Escape and Rescue Control Devices to a sub-section. Only revised A A
Openings IRC citation in 2024.
5-29 1311.0505.3.1 |Licensed Facilities Addresses requirements for foster care, day L Coordinate with Fire
care licensed or registered by the State. Code AM AM
5-30 505.4 505.4 Bars, Grilles, Covers or Screens Renamed in 2021 to "Bars, Grilles, Covers or L
Screens". Was "Emergency Escape and A A
Rescue Openings"
5-30.1 1311.0505.4 Windows and Emergency Escape Amendment removes reference to Smoke L Revise amendment to Delete amendment. Accept
Openings Alarms in model code. Smoke Alarms are address 505.4 Item 4. R R model code.
addressed elsewhere.
5-31 506.1 506.1 1311.0506.1 Compliance MN amendment references the Life-Safety L Carry over. AM AM
and Fire Risk Table 506.1.
5-31.1 CCP-EB-8 Table - Prescriptive Life Safety & Proposed revision to MR Table 506.1 L Review 2018 SONAR
Fire Risk for the original
amendment.
5-32 1311.0506.1.2 |Small Assembly Spaces Language similar to IBC Ch 3. L Carry over. AM MB to research
5-33 506.4 506.4 Existing Emergency Escape and Added to 506 Change of Occupancy in 2021. M Coordinate with 1305
Rescue Openings (Change of and 7511. AM*
Occupancy)
5-34 506.5.3 506.5.3; 506.4.3; 506.4.4|Seismic Loads (seismic force- Changes in 2021 and 2024 Priority Structural Coordinate with Structural for
506.5.4 resisting system); Access to Risk A* Risk Categories.
Category IV
5-35 506.6 506.6 Enhanced Classroom Acoustics Added to 506 Change of Occupancy in 2021. M Coordinate with 1341. Requires enhanced acoustics in
(Change of Occupancy) additions with a volume of 20K
A cf or less. Applies ICC A117.1

808 accessibility standard for
reverberence only.

Chapter 6 Classification of Work (Work Area Compliance)




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC) 1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet 10

6-1 6 |601.1 General Scope Change in 2024. Removes moved buildings
from scope for Classification of Work A
method.

6-2 6 1603.1 603.1 Scope Change in 2021. Adds qualifier that Level 2
Alterations are work area less than 50% of
building area where within the scope of work A
described. Exception clarifies exempt items.

Chapter 7 Alterations - Level 1

7-1 7 |701.3 Flood Hazard Areas Level 1 Change in numbering for work in flood

Alterations hazard area. MR 1311.0010 Subp. 3, C A
already sends this to MR Chapter 1335

7-2 7 (702.4 702.4 Window Fall Prevention 2021 changes "bottom of sill" to "bottom of Confirm consistent with
the clear opening". 2024 Changes title of 1305 and 1309. A
section and adds "or other window fall
prevention devices".

7-3 7 |702.5 702.5 Replacement Window for 2021 added "for" in section title.

Emergency Escape and Rescue Renumbered reference to IRC and IBC AM
Openings sections. Sends replacement windows for
change of occupancy to IEBC Ch 10.
7-4 7 1311.0702 Replacement Window Amends and adds subsection 702.5.1. Need amendment to
Emergency Escape and Rescue Removes reference to IRC buildings; remove IRC buildings.
Openings; Licensed Facilities combines window opening control devices Could leave Control
(found in subsection 702.5.1 in model codes) Devices as 702.5.1 and
to main section. Added subsection 702.5.1 make Licensed Facilities
addresses foster care or day care licensed or 702.5.2. Must confirm
registered by state of MN. provisions for licensed
facilities include all
r.elevant types of AM*
licenses and that req.'s
match MDH and MN
Fire Code. Renumber
from 702.5.1 to 702.5.2
and carry forward.
7-5 7 (702.5.1 702.5.1 Control Devices (Replacement New sub-section for control devices for A
EEROs) replacement EEROs added in 2021.

7-6 7 |702.6 702.6 Bars, Grilles, Covers or Screens New section in 2021. Allows if meeting clear Amend to be consistent
opening for code under which building was with 1311.0505.4. AM
constructed.

7-7 7 |704.1.1 704.1.1 Projections in Nursing Home New in 2021. A

Corridors (Means of Egress)
7-8 7 (704.2 704.2 Casework (MOE) New in 2021 A




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC) 1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet 11
7-9 7 1704.3 704.3 Locking Arrangements in New in 2021. Includes E, B ed occupancies, M Watch for errata.
Educational Occupancies (MOE) and I-4. Reference to 1010.2.8
was renumbered to A
1010.2.7.
7-10 7 General - Reroofing CCP for Ex. 2 See CCP-EB-7
7-11 7 1705.1 General - Reroofing For Ex. 1 and 2, adds requirement to comply Send to Structural TAG. *
with IBC Snow and Rain Loads
7-12 7 705.2 Structural and Construction Section deleted in 2021. Send to Structural TAG. «
Loads
7-13 7 |705.2 Roof Replacement Changed in 2024. Now 3 exceptions to L
removal of all existing layers of coverings A
down to deck.
7-14 7 1705.3 Roof Recovering Over Wood Renumbered in 2024. L A
Shingles or Shakes
7-15 7 |705.3.1 Roof Recovering Over Wood Renumbered in 2024; Renamed in 2024; L
Shingles or Shakes Added "panel products" to gypsum in 2024. A
7-16 7 1311.0706.2 Addition or Replacement of Send to Structural TAG.
Roofing or Replacement of *
Equipment
7-17 7 1706.3.1 Bracing for Unreinforced Change in 2024. Send to Structural TAG.
Masonry Bearing Wall Parapets *
7-18 7 1706.3.2 706.3.2 Roof Diaphragms Resisting Wind Change in 2021 and again in 2024. Send to Structural TAG.
Loads in High-Wing Regions *
7-19 7 (707 707 Health Care Facilities Added in 2021. I-2s, ACFs, outpatient clinics L Electrical unit is aware
altered electrical systems comply with NFPA of change. A
99.
7-20 7 1708 1311.0707 Energy Conservation Sends Ch 7 Energy to MN Energy Code 1322 M AM
and 1323
Chapter 8 Alterations - Level 2
8-1 8 1311.0801.1 Work Area Method Level 2 MN amendment deletes exception for N AM
General, Scope reconfig for accessibility.
8-2 8 (801.3 801.3 L2 System Installations New in 2021. Requirements related to work L
area are not applicable where the Level 2
alterations are limited solely to mech, elec,
fire prot., haz mat abatement, windows, A
hardware, op. controls, elec. outlets, signs,
alterations primarily for accessibility.
8-3 8 |802.4 802.4 L2 Interior Finish Change in 2021. Adds 'trim’, clarifies N A
exception, adds testing.
8-4 8 1802.4.1 802.4.1 L2 Supplemental Interior Finish Change in 2021. Adds 'trim'. N A
Requirements




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

8-5 8 1803.2.2 803.2.2 L2 Automatic Sprinkler Systems, Change in 2021. Breaks out | occupancies. N N
Specific Occupancy Groups A
8-6 8 |803.2.2 Ex. L2 Automatic Sprinkler Systems, Change in 2024. For specific occupancy H N
Specific Occupancy Groups groups, revises (clarifies?) the exception for A
no water available-then smoke detection req.
8-7 8 [803.2.3 803.2.3 L2 Automatic Sprinkler Systems, Change in 2021. Sprinkler regs for I-2s. H M A
Group I-2
8-8 8 [803.2.5 803.2.5 L2 Automatic Sprinkler Systems, New in 2021. Requirements related to work H M
Other Required Automatic area with shared exits or corridors by more
Sprinkler Systems than one tenant or occ load greater than 30, A
work area requires sprinklers.
8-9 8 [803.2.5 L2 Automatic Sprinkler Systems, Change in 2024. For other buildings and areas H N
Other Required Automatic listed in IBC T 903.2.11.6, revises (clarifies?) A
Sprinkler Systems the condition where sprinklers req.
8-10 8 1803.2.6 803.2.6 L2 Automatic Sprinkler System Change in 2021. Clarifies Ex. 1. N N A
Supervision
8-11 8 1803.2.6 L2 Automatic Sprinkler System Change in 2024. References IBC 903.4 for H L A
Supervision sprinkler supervision.
8-12 8 1803.4 L2 Fire Alarm and Detection Changes in 2024. Reorganizes, specifies H N
reference to IFC CH 11 for several A
occupancies.
8-13 8 [803.4.1.1 L2 Fire Alarm and Detection, Change in 2024. Specifies reverence to IFC Ch H N A
Group E 11.
8-14 8 1803.4.1.2 803.4.1.2 L2 Fire Alarm and Detection, Change in 2021. Removed "residential care/ H N A
Group I-1 assisted living".
8-15 8 [803.4.1.3 803.4.1.3 L2 Fire Alarm and Detection, Change in 2021. Specifies reference to IFC Ch H N A
Group I-2 11.
8-16 8 [803.4.1.5 L2 Fire Alarm and Detection, Change in 2024. Specifies reverence to IFC Ch H N A
Group R-1 11.
8-17 8 [803.4.3 L2 Fire Alarm and Detection, Change in 2024 reorganization of section. H N
Installation This basic language was in 803.4, requires A
compliance with IBC 907 and NFPA 72.
8-18 8 1804.3 804.3 805 L2 Means of Egress, Group [-2 New section 2021. In I-2s, where corridors H M
are used for movement of beds, ramps and
corridors to be 48" or more. (All of Means of A
Egress renumbered in 2021 from 805 to 804.)
8-19 8 1311.0805.2 L2 Means of Egress, General MN amendment. N N AM
8-20 8 804.4 804.11 805.10 L2 Refuge Areas Revised in 2021. Moved in 2024 to 804.4. H L A
8-21 8 |804.5; L2 Means of Egress, Refuge Renumbered in 2024. Adds "or access to H N
804.5.1 Areas; Number of Exits exits" and changes "occupied roof to A

"occupiable roof".




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

13

8-22 804.5.1.1 804.4.1.1 805.3.1.1 L2 Means of Egress, Single-Exit 2021 changes "non-sprinklered" to "without M Further research on
Buildings an approved automatic sprinkler system". origin and impact of
2024 changes "occupied roof" to "occupiable changes needed.
roof".
8-23 Table Table Table L2 Means of Egress, Stories with 2021 changes footnote a - "non-sprinklered" M Further research on
804.5.1.1(1) (804.4.1.1(1) |805.3.1.1(1) One Exit or Access to One Exit for to "without an approved automatic sprinkler origin and impact of
R-2 Occupancies system". In 2024, increases to 3rd story, 125 changes needed.
feet, etc. Similar changes in 2024 IBC.
8-24 Table Table Table L2 Means of Egress, Stories with Change in 2024 adds occupiable roofs, M Further research on
804.5.1.1(2) |804.4.1.1(1) |805.3.1.1(2) One Exit or Access to One Exit for changes 1st occ load to 49, adds B and F to origin and impact of
Other Occupancies allowance for 100 feet exit access travel changes needed.
distance.
8-25 804.5.1.2- |804.4.1.2 - 805.3.1.2- L2 Means of Egress, Multiple 2024, renumbered, including subsections. N
804.10.2 804.12.2 805.11.2 Sections
8-26 804.6.1.2 804.5.1.2 805.4.1.2 L2 Means of Egress, Egress Change in 2021. |-2 Cond. 2 altered care M
Doorways, Group I-2 suites comply with IBC 407.4.4-407.4.6.2.
8-27 804.6.4 804.5.4 805.4.4 L2 Means of Egress, Egress Change in 2021. Adds compliance with IBC M
Doorways, Panic Hardware 1010.2.
8-28 804.7.3 804.6.3 805.5.3 L2 Means of Egress, Openings in Change in 2021. Adds option to protect M
Corridor Walls, Other Corridor openings per IBC 716.
Openings
8-29 804.8 804.7 805.6 L2 Means of Egress, Dead-End Change in 2021. Adds I-2s with max 30 feet M
Corridors and adds I-2s to exceptions.
8-30 804.14.2 805.11.2 L2 Means of Egress, Guards, Change in 2024. Exception: In Group I-1 and I- L
Design 2 facilities, required guards enclosing the
occupiable roof areas shall be permitted to
be greater than 48 inches (1219 mm) above
the surface of the occupiable roof where the
occupants, because of clinical needs, require
restraint or containment as part of a function
of a psychiatric or cognitive treatment area.
8-31 1311.0806.2 L2 Structural, Existing Structural MN amendment. Priority to Structural TAG.
Elements Carrying Gravity Loads
8-32 1311.0806.3 L2 Structural, Existing Structural MN amendment. Priority to Structural TAG.
Elements Resisting Lateral Loads
8-33 805.3 806.3 L2 Structural, Existing Structural Changes in 2024. Priority to Structural TAG.
Elements Resisting Lateral Loads
8-34 805.4 806.4 L2 Structural, Voluntary Lateral Changes in 2024. Priority to Structural TAG.

Force-Resisting System
Alterations




Model Code - 2024 International Existing Building Code (IEBC)

1311/2024 IEBC Changes Technical Advisory Group (TAG) Review Worksheet

14

Facilities

outpatient clinics additions to med gas

system install and equipment per NFPA 99.

8-35 806.3 806.3 L2 Electrical, Health Care New in 2021, |-2s, ambulatory care, CCLD Electrical Unit is
Facilities outpatient clinics additions to electrical aware of change.
system install and equipment per NFPA 99.
8-36 808.1 808.1 L2 Plumbing, Health Care New in 2021, I-2s, ambulatory care,




